SHEET INDEX

GENERAL

G00 COVER SHEET

GO1 SITE PLAN & PROJECT INFORMATION
G02 FAR CALCULATIONS

G03 OPEN SPACE CALCULATIONS

G04 BUILDING GROSS AREA

G05 BUILDING AREA PER CBC

G06 FIRE SAFTY PLAN

G06.1 FIRE CODE

G08 SURVEY

G09 SURVEY

CIVIL
C00 PRELIMINARY GRADING PLAN AND DRAINAGE

ARCHITECTURAL
A10 B2 FLOOR PLAN
A1 B1 FLOOR PLAN

A12 FIRST FLOOR PLAN
A13 SECOND FLOOR PLAN
A14 THIRD FLOOR PLAN
A15 FOURTH FLOOR PLAN
A16 FIFTH FLOOR PLAN
A7 ROOF PLAN

A23 ELEVATIONS

A30 BUILDING SECTIONS

il
T
f L {
P
,' ! ! ' T
'l
ARCHITECTURAL ABBREVIATIONS ARCHITECTURAL SYMBOLS
@ AT FG FINISH GRADE OH OVERHEAD an n
4] DIAMETER FIN FINISH OPNG OPENING ) DETAIL WINDOW MARK ALIGN FINISHES
FLR FLOOR
AB ANCHOR BOLT FJ FLOOR JOIST R PROPERTY LINE
AIC AIR CONDITIONING FMC FLOOR MATERIAL CHANGE PERF PERFORATED | DOOR MARK SMOKE DETECTOR
AC ASPHALT CONCRETE FO FACE OF... PIP PROTECT IN PLACE BUILDING SECTION
ACT ACOUSTIC CEILING TILE FOC FACE OF CONCRETE PLAM PLASTIC LAMINATE
ADA AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT FOF FACE OF FINISH POC POINT OF CONNECTION AN > WALLTYPE & COMBINATION SMOKE / CARBON
ADJ ADJACENT FOM FACE OF MASONRY PRT PRESSURE TREATED 1 I MONOXIDE DETECTOR
AFF ABOVE FINISH FLOOR FOGS FACE OF GYPSUM SHEATHING PT PAINT \AT0Y/ WALL SECTION
ALT ALTERNATE FOSS FACE OF STRUCTURAL SHEATHING PTD PAINTED ey WORK POINT
ALUM ALUMINUM FOS FACE OF STUD A FIRE EXTINGUISHER
APPROX  APPROXIMATELY FR FIRE RESISTANT Qry QUANTITY
ARCH ARCHITECT, ARCHITECTURAL FS FINISH SURFACE D B INTERIOR ELEVATION NOTE
R RADIUS or RISER AREA DRAIN
BD BOARD Ga GAUGE RCP REFLECTED CEILING PLAN C
BF BRACE FRAME GALV GALVANIZED RD ROOF DRAIN *ePee  ACCESSIBLE PATHOF TRAVEL
BLK BLOCK GB GRAB BAR REF REFRIGERATOR EXTERIOR ELEVATION FLOOR DRAIN
BM BEAM GC GENERAL CONTRACTOR REQ'D REQUIRED \AT09/
BTWN BETWEEN GYPBD  GYPSUMBOARD REV REVISION or REVISED FENCE
BUR BUILT-UP ROOF RJ ROOF JOIST ——><——  FLOOR MATERIAL TRANSITION
HB HOSE BIBB RM ROOM & ELEVATION MARK FHC
CAB CABINET HC HOLLOW CORE ROW RIGHT OF WAY ® EXIT SIGN
CIP CAST-IN-PLACE HCW HOLLOW CORE WOOD . SECURITY OPENING
cJ CEILING JOIST HDR HEADER sC SOLID CORE
¢ CENTER LINE HM HOLLOW METAL SCW SOLID CORE WOOD
cL CLOSET HR HANDRAIL SEC SECTION
CLF CHAIN LINK FENCE HSS HIGH STREGTH STEEL SF SQUARE FEET PROJECT TEAM FIRE DEPARTMENT NOTES
CLG CEILING HT HEIGHT SHT SHEET
CLR CLEAR SHTG SHEATHING OWNER CIVIL ENGINEER 1. IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE GRAND &
CMU CONCRETE MASONRY UNIT INS INSULATION SIM SIMILAR GRIFFIN CATALYST DEVELOPMENT  ALLIANCE KANSAS SPECIFIC PLAN FIRE
coL COLUMN INT INTERIOR SL SLOPE FUND, LLC 2248 FARADAY AVE REQUIREMENT, FIRE IMPACT FEES ARE
CONC CONCRETE SPEC SPECIFICATION(S) 1521 GRAND AVE CARLSBAD, CA 92008 APPLICABLE TO THIS PROJECT.
CONST ~ CONSTRUCTION STD STANDARD PHONE: 310.469.6134 CONTACT: TANYA WOOD 2. EMERGENCY RESPONDER RADIO
CONT CONTINUOUS LAM LAMINATE STL STEEL CONTACT: WILLIAM MESSORI COVERAGE IS REQUIRED FOR THIS
CONTR ~ CONTRACTOR LAV LAVATORY STRUCT ~ STRUCTURAL PROJECT OFG 510,
COORD  COORDINATE LIN LINOLEUM ARCHITECT LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT
CPT CARPET TBD TO BE DETERMINED KEA LLP SITESGAPES
CRS COURSES WMAX MAXIMUM TH THRESHOLD 3573 HAYDEN AVENUE 3190 B-2 AIRPORT LOOP DRIVE
cT CERAMIC TILE MECH MECHANICAL THK THICK CULVER CITY. CA 90232 COSTAMESA. CA 92626
MFR MANUFACTURER T TRUSS JOIST PHONE: 310.399.7975 x207 PHONE: 929.644.9370
(D) DEMOLISH MIN MINIMUM TO TOP OF CONTACT: BRAD LEEDS CONTACT: SCOTT SHOUP
DAS DISABLED ACCESS MISC MISCELLANEOUS TOC TOP OF CONCRETE
DBL DOUBLE MO MASONRY OPENING TOP TOP OF PLATE
DET DETAIL MOD MODIFY TOPO TOPOGRAPHY
DIA DIAMETER MR MOISTURE RESISTANT TOS TOP OF SLAB
DIM DIMENSION MTD MOUNTED TOSHTG  TOP OF SHEATHING
DN DOWN MTL METAL TOW TOP OF WALL
DS DOWNSPOUT TR TREAD
DWG DRAWING N NOTE TYP TYPICAL
N) NEW
(E) EXISTING NIC NOT IN CONTRACT UNO UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE
ELECT  ELECTRICAL NTS NOT TO SCALE
ELEV ELEVATOR veT VINYL COMPOSITION TILE
ENGR ENGINEER, ENGINEERING oc ON CENTER VERT VERTICAL
EOS EDGE OF SLAB OFCl OWNER FURNISHED- VIF VERIFY N FIELD
EQ EQUAL CONTRACTOR INSTALLED
EXT EXTERIOR OFol OWNER FURNISHED- wi WITH
OWNER INSTALLED we WATER CLOSET
FAB FABRICATE OFVI OWNER FURNISHED- WD WOOD
FE FIRE EXTINGUISHER VENDOR INSTALLED WH WATER HEATER
FF FINISH FLOOR WP WATERPROOF
WPT WORK POINT

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED HEREIN
ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA, LLP AND MAY NOT

BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN PERMISSION

SUBMIT
TAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET
9098033

DAT
09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET TITLE:

COVER SHEET

SHEET

GO0

9/9/2025 10:04:33 AM



) ) 5'_-_0" 5'-07_ o - o o o o o o o 5 0"_ )
ETBACK -
_ DEDICATI i SETBACK
@) i s |
ok | |
O |
- = EEREEEEEERE P " T
S e e e O O B L G ] N
{_’ | l_ =T — N\ — ||/ %— — — _’—’—_—‘—j_ — — —’_’:‘_rr — ‘_ _@_ — ‘@ — — — ‘I \\ /
52 = 50' - 1" \ | |
O | < 3 STORIES @HOLLY ST | 3 STORIES @HOLLY ST | 06
R APPROX HEIGHT | APPROX HEIGHT | TYP
| | | FROM SIDEWALK: 35FT } FROM SIDEWALK: 35FT |
5 |
1 L vl | | |
| . A T T T N
NN | || | | | | | | |
| 3 STORIES | | \
| APPROX HEIGHT | | | |
] FROM SIDEWALK: | | 5 STORIES @ COURTYARD A | |
E | | 35FT } } | | 0
| ] | 5 I A O
w0 : : | |
N o il | ‘ |
N )] | ENCLOSED GATED
| | N | PARKING AREA
%2 | | | | SEPARATE PROPERTY
| c<,§ ] H ‘ _ COURTYARD A 20658 SF
| | @ LEVEL B2 i | |
g || | | | NOTE: ALL; PARKING
B 5 STORIES . SPACES PROVIDED IN.THIS
N || : } 4 STORIES @ 6 STORIES @WASHINGTON ST | AREA ARE CONVENIENCE
| | | COURTYARD A @ COURTYARD A | PARKING FOR|AUTOMOTIVE
I | 1 REPAIR, NO PUBLIC
| | 25 } N PARKING IS PROVIDED iS
| | | | ! o |
N | |
: : | | j  — e R o
| |
N . | 5 STORIES @ | -
. EXISTING TWO STORY | L | COURTYARD A
>\ RESIDENTIAL BUILDING i | |
"\ APPROX HEIGHT: 25 FT e e |
N\ | | | | | = — |
] LOBBYENTRANCE , [——————————— = al
o | @ LEVEL B1 | |
y
| ! ' 6 STORIES @ COURTYARD A =
| | | 5 STORIES @ COURTYARD B |
i
|
| —
| : | | ] |
| - |
| | T — - - - --———
| | |
| |
M _ , L
|| b | g
|| 3 STORIES |
APPROX HEIGHT \
o
: I FROM SIDEWALK: |
[N 35FT COURTYARD B }
1 @ LEVEL B |
[ — \
| l
. | \
| || | |
| A | [ I L \
| | | 1
[ | |
| | | |
| | | \ 5 STORIES @ COURTYARD B }
I | \
| | { l |
A | T T T I
NN | | }
] I \ | | 6 STORIES PARKING GARAGE TYPE IA
el 2 STORIES @ | 4 STORIES @ | ‘
: ! | | COURTYARD C } COURTYARD C \ S QB E \ The number of pedestrian and vehicular access points shall be
’ﬁﬁﬂ | } | minimized. Except at vehicle and primary pedestrian openings,
' | \ \ } the structure shall be designed, to the satisfaction of the City, to
‘1 ! | \ preclude human entry from any exterior accessible surface to a
. } | height of eight feet. Chain link fencing shall not be utilized if
” ‘ 1 | | } visible from a public right of way. When required, fire authority
T - | openings in the form of swing-out gates shall be provided and
\ | | L | secured by a padlock with @ minimum 3/8-inch diameter shackle
\ T | | } and five-pin tumbler operation.
% o " COURTYARD C |
N . @ LEVEL 1 [ | |
x ! | - 3,825.24 SF | 0 :
\
N i : NN
|
%EXISTING THREE STO - #J:ﬁ | |
\RESIDENTIAL BUILDIN L | \ ND FLOOR
\APPROX HEIGHT: 35 F ' | \ ARKING
\ , | I ARAGE
% [ 1] ‘ | BNTRANCE
|
\
| N
\ EEh : TN
| | | . - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - |
% | 5 STORIES @ GRAND AVE | SSS
| T APPROX HEIGHT | |
FROM SIDEWALK: 55FT | T| : |
| : a N
!
o | |
= O | |
5% N
© I’Z | 7& * — —- —t s _, | :
) LQ/MWLD ______ C— T 7 —" T T J— N
o 8 [/ = == [~ I = — ]
<< ' : 40'-0"
59O MAIL/ PARCEL & 7 d
T ENTRANCE R T : N
2 @ LEVEL 1 @
SITE PLAN 1
1" = 20!_0"

VEHICULAR PARKING UNIT COUNT LEGAL DESCRIPTION
PARCEL 4: (APN: 4139-008-010)
PROVIDED PARKING UNIT MIX LOTS 226 AND 227 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO,
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK
ACCESSIBLE 9 NAME COUNT MIX 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF
COMPACT 38||1BR 152 95% SAID COUNTY.
STANDARD 355| |2 BR 66 24%
GRAND TOTAL 402| |3BR 6 2% PARCEL 5: (APNZ 4139-008-011, 012, 018, 046)
STUDIO 5 19% LOT 228, 229 AND 265, 266, 267 AND 268 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY
OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP
PROPOSED PARKING TOTAL 276 RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY
RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY.
1 SPACE PER STUDIO AND 1BR 203
2 SPACES PER 2BR AND 3BR 146 PARCEL 6: (APN: 4139-008-047)
0.2 PER UNIT FOR GUEST PARKING 53 PARCEL 6A:
LOT 262, 263, 264 OF BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO,
TOTAL 402 COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK
PROPOSED FAR éz/; lFE)Agg&s& T1 36 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF
LOADING SPACES (SEE SHEET A02 - SITEPLAN) EXCEPT FROM SAID LOT 262 THE SOUTH 30 FEET THEREOF, AS CONVEYED TO THE
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES FOR ROAD AND HIGHWAY PURPOSES BY DEED
- ONE LARGE TRUCK LOADING ON WASHINGTON ST LEVEL TYPE AREA RECORDED IN BOOK 6017 PAGE 93, OF DEEDS.
- ONE SMALL TRUCK LOADING ON GRAND AVE B2FLOOR  |RESIDENTIAL 24354 SF
D1 FLOOR | RESIDENTIAL 36130 5F Eé?ge% GB?_:OCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO TRACT, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY
ISTFLOOR _ |RESIDENTIAL 61598 SF OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22
2NDFLOOR | RESIDENTIAL 54222 SF PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID
3RDFLOOR  RESIDENTIAL 42428 SF COUNTY.
ATHFLOOR | RESIDENTIAL 37991 SF
STHFLOOR __|RESIDENTIAL 18277 SF ﬁﬁ?gﬁt ?%F PARCEL MAP NO. 7197, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS
TOTAL FLOOR AREA 277005 SF ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS FILED IN BOOK 110, PAGES 96 AND 97 OF
SEE SHEET G02 FOR MORE INFORMATION PARCEL MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY.
BICYCLE PARKING GROSS AREA PROJECT INFORMATION
PROJECT NAME: 1521 E GRAND APARTMENTS
PROVIDED LONG-TERM BICYCLE PARKING GROSS BUILDING AREA
TYPE COUNT | SPACES |TOTAL | AREATYPE | LEVEL | CONST.TYPE | AREA ADDRESS: 330 KANSAS ST, 348 KANSAS ST, 1521 E GRAND AVE, EL
RESIDENTIALLONG TERM 21 |2 42 SEGUNDO, CA 90245
DOUBLE TIER AMENITY  |B2FLOOR |GSF-TYPEIIl 3178 SF
GRAND TOTAL: 21 42 AMENITY  |B1FLOOR |GSF-TYPE Il 1976 SF
AMENITY 1ST FLOOR |GSF -TYPE Ill 11492 SF OWNER: GRIFFIN CATALYST DEVELOPMENT FUND, LLC
PER ESMC15-15-6 B: REQUIRED LONG TERM BICYCLE | AMENITY 4TH FLOOR |GSF - TYPE Il |758 SF
PARKING SPACES IS 10% OF PROJECT'S VEHICLE 7405 SF
PARKING SPACES. PROJECT DESCRIPTION: NEW CONSTRUCTION OF A RESIDENTIAL BUILDING
PARKING B1FLOOR |GSF-TYPEI |9275 SF INCLUDING 276 RENTAL UNITS WITHIN 3 TO 5 STORY
402x10% =402 41 SPACES REQUIRED PARKING  |1STFLOOR GSF-TYPEI| |25123 SF BUILDING AND A 6 STORY PARKING STRUCTURE
PARKING  |2ND FLOOR GSF-TYPE| |25123 SF
PARKING  |3RD FLOOR GSF-TYPEI| |25123 SF
PARKING  4THFLOOR GSF-TYPEI 25123SF | coNSTRUCTIONTYPE:  MAX. 5 STORIES OF TYPE IlIA AND A 6-STORY PARKING
PARKING 5TH FLOOR |GSF - TYPE| 25123 SF STRUCTURE OF TYPE IA CONSTRUCTION
PARKING  |ROOFTOP |GSF-TYPEI 11331SF PARTIAL TYPE IA PODIUM
PROVIDED SHORT TERM BICYCLE PARKING 146220 SF
RESIDENTIAL |B2 FLOOR |GSF-TYPE| |9694 SF
PER CAL GREEN: REQUIRED SHORT-TERM BICYCLE | RESIDENTIAL B2FLOOR |GSF-TYPENl 14913S5F | ZONING: SMOKY HOLLOW EAST (SHE)
IRNGSPICES S QUM TOSUONPROECTS  GESOENTAL B1FLOOR GSF-TWPEN WSS riooozove 1
RESIDENTIAL |1ST FLOOR |GSF - TYPE Il 60717 SF
53x5% =265 3 SPACES REQUIRED & PROVIDED RESIDENTIAL |2ND FLOOR |GSF - TYPE Il 155187 SF SITE AREA: GROSS AREA POST - WASHINGTON STREET DEDICATION
RESIDENTIAL |3RD FLOOR |GSE - TYPE Il 142628 SF = FULL SITE, INCLUDING PUBLIC ROW,AND EXCLUDING
WASHINGTON STREET 144,754 SF OR 3.32 ACRE
RESIDENTIAL |4TH FLOOR |GSF - TYPE Ill |37155 SF !
RESIDENTIAL |5TH FLOOR GSF - TYPE Il {17300 SF NET AREA POST - DEDICATIONS
274176 SF = REMAINING SITE FROM SIDEWALK EDGE INWARDS,
TOTAL: 429, 608 SF WHICH EXCLUDES (1) PUBLIC R.O.W, AND (2) ANY AREA
OF WASHINGTON STREET 121,865 SF OR 2.8 ACRE
SEE SHEET G04 FOR MORE INFORMATION SET BACKS: PROPOSED SETBACKS
GRAND AVE 5FT
KANSAS ST 5FT
OPEN SPACE HOLLY ST 3FT
WASHINGTON ST 5FT
NAME LEVEL |QTY| AREA (SF)
COMMON OPEN SPACE: | B2 FLOOR | 1 6136
COURTYARD A PROJECT DENSITY: GROSS 83.1 UNITS PER ACRE
COMMON OPEN SPACE: | B1FLOOR | 1 6241 NET 986 UNITS PERACRE
COURTYARD B
COMMON OPEN SPACE: | 18T FLOOR | 1 3732  BLDG HEIGHT: 60 FT ( MAXIMUM HEIGHT FROM EXISTING GRADE)
COURTYARD C EL SEGUNDO MUNICIPAL CODE 15-2-3 FOR EXCEPTIONS
COMMON OPEN SPACE: | B2 FLOOR | 1 1626
NW CORNER OCCUPANCY TYPE: R-2,S-2, A3
COMMON OPEN SPACE: | 4TH FLOOR | 1 1281
ROOF DECK
COMMON RECROOM | B2FLOOR | 2 2985
COMMON REC ROOM | B1FLOOR | 1 714
COMMON REC ROOM | 4THFLOOR | 1 715
9 23430
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | B2 FLOOR | 15 750
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | B1FLOOR | 30 1500
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 1ST FLOOR | 43 2050
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 2ND FLOOR | 42 2100
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 3RD FLOOR | 30 1500
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 4THFLOOR| 25 1250
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 5THFLOOR| 9 450
194 9600
GRAND TOTAL 203 33030 NOTE

SITE PLAN NOTES

01 PROPOSED RIGHT OF WAY. SEE CIVIL
02  EXISTING CURB AND SIDEWALK

03  TRANSFORMER
ELECTRICAL SWITCHING SECTION

03.1

04  EXISTING POWER POLE. SEE SURVEY SHEET

G08 & G09 TO BE RELOCATED
05 FENCE AND GATE
06  NEIGHBOR'S PARKING STALL

07  LARGE TRUCK LOADING SPACE
08  SMALL TRUCK LAODING SPACE
09  PULL SECTION CABINET
10 SHORT-TERM BICYCLE PARKING

11 FUSING STRUCTURE

SEE SHEET G03 FOR MORE INFORMATION

PROJECT MUST COMPLY WITH THE EL SEGUNDO SECURITY CODE

VICINITY MAP

E MARIPOSA AVE

CENTER ST

E MAPLE AVE

WASHINGTON ST

E PINE AVE

1 PN

T SEGUNDO AVE
PARKS & ~ /CALIFORNIA ST
RECREATIO = H/(x)\L/EY

INDIANA ST

E GRAND AVE

N 5\

E FRANKLIN AVE

CONTINENTAL| BLVD
E NASH ST

EL SEGUNDO BLVD

LAKES AT
EL SEGUNDO

SITE:
1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED HEREIN
ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA, LLP AND MAY NOT
BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN PERMISSION

SUBMIT
TAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET
9098033

DAT
09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET TITLE:

SITE PLAN &
PROJECT
INFORMATION

SHEET

GO01

9/9/2025 10:04:34 AM



—— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— GROSS LOT AREA (POST WASHINGTON
RESIDENTIAL RESIDENTIAL RESIDENTIAL STREET DEDIACTION):
61598 SF 144,754 SF OR 3.32 ACRE
42428 SF 24354 $F;
] I 1 I i I IIT r (| el L D LT INal ? ‘ ”—H o H D N bl i ’ MULTIPLIER:
| | | E L % .
| | | 1.0
L A A A N AR FH“% “/? A N ALLOWABLE FAR:
| | | | | | | | | =LOT AREA X MULTIPLIER
| | i E i | | | ' f ! E e t | | ! i i b ] | | =144,754 X 1 3573 HAYDEN
] Janaw et il d 1 — =144,754 SF AVENUE
- ] | i R | 1 S % 2 | 1] g = CULVER CITY,
) | ! o] [ | ] ! oo T | B 7] iy 88 P | PROPOSED FAR: 1.90 CA 90232
| - 1 ! @ G il & ﬁ 2 $10-399.7975
[ ] | | i 2] | 15 aHELS i Rl | | 15 afhss | | | PROPOSED FLOOR AREA =277,005 SF
T | E | | 3 T g E | | i ¥ Z E | | 277,005/144,754 = 1.91
T | e s | | ¢ ] | & T
I[ N | c S ]l | % Y & = | > T c
- [ [ E g Bl E il E £l e E
I I I I i I I N I I
E | | as 1 | | , | | Dillle % = | | m
— ~ g — 5 % N N 9
:II:II ol = Leal mE - F
L | =1 5 | g: |
' i f ' s ' i it 2
E n 5 E AeEEHEEa 5 i HEHEE 5
u - : I O E =) | . : LL)
I ‘ﬁ | | r [ * | %_ ' u | 8l |
1 | B F [ I - — IR : | =
| i 5 5 F
oy R I | (el | % (oAl | | m
_ | 5 | f | |
RESIDENTIAL ) | I ) ) ) c | ﬂ || ) ) ) B |
18277 S d T A ! o a AN M
77 SF
I W S S : i i H 0
11 R = S B Ecl S B '
|
L — | o I ] ot I | PROPOSED FAR <
| — ' 5 | T — 5 | 0 |
— LEVEL TYPE AREA
Eii B2FLOOR  RESIDENTIAL 24354 SF m
| |B1FLOOR  |RESIDENTIAL 38136 SF
_ EEmmaEE 11STFLOOR | RESIDENTIAL 61598 SF >
IE_ Loal | 2ND FLOOR  |RESIDENTIAL 54222 SF
I T a o) ’ ; . : — 3RDFLOOR  |RESIDENTIAL 42428 SF <
it L 1] ik L B i 11 | =y 4THFLOOR  |RESIDENTIAL 37991 SF
| 2 o iy il | | 24 i o i | i % | | |5THFLOOR | RESIDENTIAL 18277 SF
| b | | t ¥ | ] | | | TOTAL FLOOR AREA 277005 SF Q
I : | : : : -
‘ (P (A (P (I L ﬁ = e VN g N e M N ey M N e Y AL | — ] S g — g s— ) — S
1 o
ﬂ-
5TH FLOOR FAR PLAN /7\ 3RD FLOOR FAR PLAN 5 1ST FLOOR FAR PLAN 3 B2 FLOOR FAR PLAN 1 w N
1 " = 40'_0" \—/ 1 n = 40'_0" 1 n = 40'_0" 1 " = 40'_0" m 8
=<
Ll =
D -
—— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— —— - O
O
RESIDENTIAL RESIDENTIAL o &E S
RESIDENTIAL 54222 SF 38136 SF N O (39
37991 SF ] b DA LA A Al ‘— el ial 4~ g Lo LI LL
© 0
—
— AR 1 7] /1 M gl
t I I I I I I
] = | | i [X i 5 | | ' g SEEcdds X i | | SHEET NOTES GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
' IE v IE il E DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
| | i | / . 266 KANSAS STREET,
| — — | — | = el % L T | E 1 % e i EL SEGUNDO MUNICIPAL CODE 15-1-6 £l SEGUNDO, CA 90245
N il T : < i} . % e FLOOR AREA RATIO: THE FLOOR AREA OR
L SN | - e i £l | . 2 L | || NET FLOOR AREA OF ALL BUILDINGS ON A LOT,
A ! | K A ! | £ A | || DIVIDED BY THE LOT AREA
| = L = | '
| E 5 2 | L BERSESIEER - 5 2 | . L E FLOOR AREA (NET): THE TOTAL HORIZONTAL AREA OF
| q | ] o | B z | ALL FLOORS, STORIES OR LEVELS, AS MEASURED TO
0 — i § i et THE INTERIOR OF A BUILDING'S PERIMETER WALLS.
E 5 5 -
= 2 [iset = z o = UNLESS SPECIFIED IN OTHERWISE INDIVIDUAL
A 1 | | < . T | | : % o . | || ZONING DISTRICT, SPACE DEVOTED TO THE
— B 2 — S 2 = R A R — < FOLLOWING SHALL NOT BE INCLUDED WHEN
e - ead 1 : ; LB B DETERMINING THE TOTAL NET FLOOR AREA WITHIN A
| ATA e = | /| | | : BUILDING OR STRUCTURE:
| L | L | P - | A. ELEVATOR SHAFTS,
N 9 F N 9 'Ij W A o J B. STAIRWELLS AND STAIRWAY ENCLOSURES.
A L—v A C. COURTS OR ATRIUMS.
Lﬂ i : ™5 % E: T : d % E_ ‘ : D. ROOMS EXCLUSIVELY HOLDING BUILDING THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
Y ‘ HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
I - % ‘ | L, B I OPERATING EQUIPMENT. ;Aé-\;hmgglgﬁ REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
| 1 ’ ’ N | | E I ’ ’ B o o | A E ’ ’ n | E. PARKING SPACES AND PARKING STRUCTURES. D
| 2 | J 2 | ’ = o A4 F. THAT PORTION OF ANY STRUCTURE THAT IS SUBMITTAL
- L, DEVOTED EXCLUSIVELY TO PARKING.
5 = = = o 1 = n . . — 2 = ! ! | G. RESTROOMS AND HALLWAYS IN ENTITLEMENT SET
e oy | : | | j [ | COMMON AREAS OF NONRESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS. EB(%B%R 033
: 1 T : % 7 JL : DATE:
| [} [} [} [} [} | [} [} [} [} [} | [} [}
| al Ay IF ' I E I lL\ | | L4 I' rd 09800822025
REVISIONS:
n B 1 ’ L i % [
== . . @ 5@ | K= g g @ 5@ ! . . !
| s | sj% | LEGEND
A i | e . | | EggEREREeE! |
[3 t O = il il C 3 t O = il j D
I [ | I | | I
! e | L = | ! |
=R . R : :
] H@| B O O a [@ B O O
; g 1 & P s [T X
| S | &8 S ST Famsems | | U ST | | ] |
( l [’ l l SHEET
| | | :
ﬁ o T 1 I TOAT L o T 1 I TOAT L AT L % ML ML ML FAR
] I 1 1 | — 1 [ 1 o J — = il f i i ind i = “[
\_ __ __ __ __ __ \_ __ __ __ __ __ \_ . - - __ __ CALCULATIONS
4TH FLOOR FAR PLAN @ 2ND FLOOR FAR PLAN @ B1 FLOOR FAR PLAN @ v
1 " = 40'_0" 1 n = 40'_0" 1 n = 40'_0" G 0 2

9/9/2025 10:04:37 AM



COMMON OPEN SPACE: COMMON OPEN SPACE:
PRIVATE BALCONY, TYP PRIVATE BALCONY NW CORNER COURTYARD A REQUIRED OPEN SPACE
TvP \ S LUREER W 6265 SF PRIVATE BALCONY
1626 SF \ TYP
1 = = | 1 r jEeaE) At Tha—1pa—ilpa—— \ LD Ll TL r\fl\ — g -
t — FST | 5 5 5 M [ T ‘ 1 g % /
L/ — UL/ L/ D L N L/ — N[V L ;f ‘ %% A UL/ L/ 1%
] 7 1 X = 1 / 3573 HAYDEN
: i g = = 2 L g g AVENUE
= [ Izl I I 5 [Fi] 3 ‘ 5B CULVER CITY,
] Ll ﬁ ksl —= 2 5 e i : o T CA 90232
i] = il g J $10:399.7975
L @ % J o= Al e < %
f 3 g E R
b E J E o ;
[ N oo N c S i | r s
L 2 —] L/ - |
[ c c 1 j > % < NAME LEVEL |QTY| AREA (SF) m
e I Lea) = % —3 / / o COMMON OPEN SPACE: | B2FLOOR | 1 6136
| COURTYARD A h
: (1 | : 1 =L -
i — L | | B ~ | COMMON OPEN SPACE: | B1FLOOR | 1 6241
N I Il . I > 4 é J COURTYARD B Z
L c L ‘ L, .
_ [ - _ I - _ Elln | COMMON REC ROOM 30 10°61- COM;\{ATOYI\L %’EN SPACE: | 1STFLOOR | 1 3732
. 1 1 T 7 1885 SF COU ¢ m
| B D D | D D D T COMMON REC ROOM COMMON OPEN SPACE: | B2 FLOOR | 1 1626
Il | [ | s o n% : : = 1734 SF NW CORNER
. | f . COMMON OPEN SPACE: | 4TH FLOOR | 1 1281 E
| ' 3 | : 3 ROOF DECK
W ] u L | Il e f 'l v COMMON RECROOM | B2FLOOR | 2 2565|
| ) | I fpalipal—y COMMON RECROOM | B1FLOOR | 1 714
] COMMON REC ROOM | 4THFLOOR | 1 715 m
— ° ] — ° ° ° = e 1 ° ° ° = @ 9 23430
f -1 T = : < = & PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | B2 FLOOR | 15 750 <
T2 L = N B i b % ] B PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | B1FLOOR | 30 1500
J ° _ ° ° ° ° e % ° ° ; = e PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 1ST FLOOR | 43 2050 m
| PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 2ND FLOOR | 42 2100
L L]
— | —— e ST : PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 3RD FLOOR | 30 1500 <
° = e ° ° ° = e | ° ° ° = @ PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 4TH FLOOR | 25 1250
@ i @ i i i @ i B PRIVATE OPEN SPACE | 5THFLOOR| 9 450
° ° ° a1 ° ° ° ol | ° ° ° j : 194 9600 m
- 1 L GRAND TOTAL 203 33030 >
foal s fral w Ry
@ \'% B o (m] T \'% == B [m} u} I gi 2] o u} A J
3 . | <
! I A [ ] ! R . ! 1T i 7
- T c 1 2 7
N L L N LU
- - 0
F [N [i = e 0 [ T N T T —9 F—T1 F—% I " | Z
COMMON OPEN SPACE: <
3732 SF =
#
5TH FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN 7 3RD FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN 5 1ST FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN 3 B2 FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN 1 w N
1" = 40'_0" 1" = 40'_0" 1" = 40'_0" 1" — 40'_0" m 8
> <
Ll =
D -
- O
- < 0O
— U; T i i 1 = 1 \.“ =0 rﬁﬁw NG 1 ﬁ‘rO 5l F‘i Ll F‘i L] % %
— PRIVATE BALCONY N 0
TYP W0
) o
ﬁ'—'iﬂ—‘ _ _ 1 N g e I | /1 /1 /1 . LO _|
t JJ N % — U L % — N ¥ 2 ‘ ~— Ll
‘ ‘ ) K > K )
4 ] 2 | = 2] SHEET NOTES GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
— 1 n u ) o & ) g%ﬁ - DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
| - ﬁ il | S ﬁ 1) o @ - ALL REQUIRED OPEN SPACE AND RECREATIONAL é?6s*<EAGNUS,\lA[)SOSE§E9EOT2’ 45
COMMON OPEN SPACE: IL ] c 5 FACILITIES ARE IN ADDITION TO THE REQUIRED !
ROOF DECK ) R FRONT AND STREET SIDE SETBACKS. INTERIOR
1281 SF - | m 3 | COMMON REC ROOM : SIDE AND REAR SETBACKS MAY BE CONSIDERED
4 L f i 2393 SF g AS REQUIRED OPEN SPACES AND RECREATION
a7 ’ = S E 1T 4 FACILITIES. ALL REQUIRED
| i E . | b= E il o COMMON OPEN SPACE MUST: 1) BE PHYSICALLY
|2 = z 2 OR VISUALLY ACCESSIBLE TO THE RESIDENTS, 2)
o | g B BE A MINIMUM OF FIVE FEET IN BOTH LENGTH AND
- _ ——=¢ = S a— = - 1 S WIDTH, AND 3) INCLUDE A MINIMUM OF 50
& Lpal Lpal | | e al PERCENT OF SOFTSCAPE LANDSCAPING.
2| PRIVATE BALCONY, TYP A 2 i 90§
COMMON REC ROOM —1_1 L \‘ | } | I L
715 SF M M jﬂ ) S . jﬂ ﬂ Qﬂ
Lo —* ]
u} 8] o a ;% & O n} m a n] 8] o THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
| 4 \L E MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
— — = PERMISSION
PRIVATE BALCONY, TYP g
c q LJZU SUBMITTAL:
N < o o o S 1 N < o o o S < o o ‘
L 5 c 2 i I ] ENTITLEMENT SET
M 2021-033
L4 T - I | Y N . | ] S o
% H A i i i} i} i 7; %é g N J@ _ _ i} ; _ . i REVISI;NS: .
L [OSPL] B E;w ZN| B LEG EN D
) ) ) S ) ) ) S COMMON OPEN SPACE: ) )
@ o @ d COURTYARD B COMMON OPEN SPACE: COURTYARD A
o o : o] : : : oo 5827 SF
E ﬂ COMMON OPEN SPACE: COURTYARD B
% M B | il N ,_ﬂ |
&T E@ 0 0 0 f CH o 0 0 COMMON OPEN SPACE: COURTYARD C
<] il
I —— g —Ld COMMON OPEN SPACE: NW CORNER
L N N[ L/
E % COMMON OPEN SPACE: REC ROOM
T — — ——— i — i COMMON OPEN SPACE: ROOF DECK %TP EN SPACE
COMMON REC ROOM CALCULATIONS
PRIVATE OPEN SPACE
4TH FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN @ 2ND FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN @ B1 FLOOR OPEN SPACE PLAN @ N e
1" = 40'_0" 1" = 40'_0" 1" = 40'_0" G 0 3

9/9/2025 10:04:42 AM



NOTES

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

NJ
I.I.I

L
ﬂ T % { ‘ = T — T ) E L1 L] T ﬁé %
o A A 1 A Ay o e % M
t % i/ % : Hjm N % i/ : | ” N 1/ N %% %0
7 7
] 3 fooecn 3 ! . =
i @ % l&% : @ % ]&% i ¥ B @ 1&% P
P | . . — | .
L > | | o
| 5 J I % o EJ 5 | ~zolelez EJ :
T )i ' ga = E
i . : , E :
I[ B KX F J. % N ﬁ A
- L = E - | S i i ; Bl  ppamam E
E - ’ | L i | —] L/ K
) A 5 1 i
1 % 1 S % % e vl o
kv ]| [k ]]
i 5] 5l
_E R [, 5 _E X Sl X [ 5
- RISt ¢ S e ]
I L h I a I
o i | L5 e L5 i | l\%
| r I ‘ﬁ,ﬁ_,ﬁﬁ o o . o | - iﬁ,ﬁﬁﬁ? o o o | __]jﬁ . |
d M | L E | -E | D X< |
Y o o - o o \ Y o o - o o
—1____ W | I 1 tealeal
| | | | |
(1 | =l o o o o o | =l O O o o o | |
g _ A A | 4 7 A |
[2 : % ; [ i T [2 B
T 3 I
| et | a |
@ i ]
| ] | | o [ms] (] | = o I |
| 1 |
r | Lo L | |
% o o ! [ % t% E ol 5 P ! |
‘U% [ Bl
! B g - PROPOSED GROSS FLOOR AR
' i 1/ 3 NP ./ |/ Yitee l
| _ B | TYPE LEVEL AREA
| [ | | GROSS B2FLOOR 27100 SF
s o | ISR : , 8 | | GROSS B1FLOOR  |42639 SF
— = = I GROSS 1ST FLOOR | 66430 SF
\_ L L N L _ __ __ __ \ __ __ __ GROSS 2ND FLOOR 59373 SF
GROSS 3RD FLOOR 46359 SF
GROSS 4TH FLOOR 41261 SF
GROSS 5TH FLOOR |21554 SF
5TH FLOOR GROSS AREA 7 3RD FLOOR GROSS AREA 5 1ST FLOOR GROSS AREA 3 B2 FLOOR GROSS AREA 1 TOTAL GROSS AREA 304716 SF
1" = 40'-0" 1" = 40'-0" 1" = 40'-0" 1" = 40'-0"
I I R PA oA A TRy TRA] N A = g
% /1 ] A 1 AP
t ﬁ : ' |
: | 5 o2 = : | Fﬁ N V = o K 2 B SHEET NOTES
— u . 5 = ] i % o i - % e o % e MEASUREMENT PER EL SEGUNDO 15-1-6:
[ =7 = T [ = ] Ejj [ FLOOR AREA (GROSS):
S L 2] e THE AREA INCLUDED WITHIN THE SURROUNDING
7 | ] 2 | EJ 2 EXTERIOR WALLS OF A BUILDING OR PORTION
5 e g b g THEREOF, EXCLUSIVE OF GARAGES, VENT SHAFTS
= K < . T < L s AND COURTS. THE FLOOR AREA OF A BUILDING, OR
G ) 4 ﬂ 4 PORTION THEREOF, NOT PROVIDED WITH
— 3 - — 5 b ’ @ PR 5 SURROUNDING EXTERIOR WALLS SHALL BE THE
& : s T B 1 R USABLE AREA UNDER THE HORIZONTAL
2 % | = 21“ | jetele i % - 5 PROJECTION OF THE ROOF OR FLOOR ABOVE.
A {eah a7 | = e L)
| N ] é 5‘ R %
>, > H A
A N ll § N N N M I SOOI N
1 f : e : = S e
i : i & T a
X e 0 : N = 5 E‘;qpi’ 0 S i S 4 %F.Q : : |
> << | = |[§ <] | 7 [E |
f ] f ] b
% % 1 3 %
s T 0 ey
| | 3 |
o o o o o | [ o o o o o | oy o o |
: | 5 3 e L5 l 5
2
=EI 3 Cn i W C“ Gl
o || ] ] ] o % %% | ] ] ) o 4 ] ]
BNFEEN s : e eaiiees % : | ] :
|
— v -
,
§TeTR | : E : :
S [
J 2 |
iy 5% |
| L = =
e A SECE SRt e S <

4TH FLOOR GROSS AREA

1" = 40'_0"

2ND FLOOR GROSS AREA

1" = 40'_0"

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC

B1 FLOOR GROSS AREA

1" = 40'_0"

266 KANSAS STREET,
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

BUILDING
GROSS AREA

SHEET

G04

9/9/2025 10:04:49 AM



NOTES

TYPE IIl-A
TYPE IIl-A TYPE III-A 1357 SF
44029 SF 63123 SF
L 1 1 % \‘W W\M miﬁ |
e X ,
t % N i \ \t D\ Q ]
| \\% \ x N N -+ 3573 HAYDEN
1l | SE AVENUE
R RSV N SRS . A CULVER CITY,
% [ \ %\ - BRERT CA 90232
1l g 8 % Na g 5 [ 316:399.7975
Z
I[ T § § | § \ gk B
(] E A
E Il [ Py N X\\ &l [P N X 3 3
i [ .
ﬁ =) \% 1) N \% 1 m
TYPE I-A ] S TYPE I-A F
— 24125SF 3 I _
; \\ N \ ;§ \ \ \ ] 9425 SF Z
Mzﬂuﬁ L | m%ﬁ ] _§ ‘\ ML% =
N 1 I = B NN § RO :
Y ! T % E
o ] SN 5 . . e IS 5 . . el
\ NN : 1 i \ \ NSNS SRS N\ ] R . t
\ 1 K \ EN\E \ ol
1 RAVRSIE AR :
TYPE Il1-A * 83 ; 5 2 X553 Bk ; : 2 S <
[ o
18705 SF @ : : m : @ : : ﬁ | . @ : : : DD m
3 < @ N < * j :,IaH H7
Lg\\ % - B o il ‘ [% \ \% jﬂ B o 0 T ¢ B 7 % B o o | 4 >
NS [T ] RN i NNER 7 <
N \ b\ ) N\ b\ \ ] PROPOSED BUILDING AREA
H’ [ B2FLOOR | TYPEI-A 9425 Q
ﬁ AN NN NN NN AN ﬁ RATRAR A AN SN ) 7 BIFLOOR | TYPEI-A 11895
— — — — — — — — — ] e e e s B L1 10 1STFLOOR | TYPE I-A 24115 Z
INDFLOOR | TYPEI-A 24303
TYPE 1A TYPE 1A 3RDFLOOR | TYPEIA 24114 <
ATHFLOOR | TYPEI-A 24114
24114 SF 24115 SF 5THFLOOR | TYPEIA 24125 m o
TYPE I-A 142091
5TH FLOOR AREA (CBC) @ 3RD FLOOR AREA (CBC) @ 1ST FLOOR AREA (CBC) @ B2 FLOOR AREA (CBC) @ B2FLOOR | TYPEII-A 17244 w N
1" = 400" 1" = 400" 1" = 40'-0" 1" = 400" B1FLOOR | TYPEII-A 39619 WS
1STFLOOR | TYPE IIl-A 63123 >
OND FLOOR | TYPE III-A 56281 m <O
TYPE lILA 3RDFLOOR | TYPEIlI-A 44029 % o
TYPE llIl-A = TYPE lil-A ATHFLOOR | TYPEIII-A 40647 < 0
40647 SF 56281 SF 39619 SF 5THFLOOR | TYPE lll-A 18705 Y % %
TYPE III-A 279648
T e T T s ey TOTAL BUILDING AREA 421739 1\ w S
) o
\ = 27

SHEET NOTES

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

]
LF

|
ﬁ
=

1. EGRESS WIDTH REQUIREMENTS PER OCCUPANT
SERVED AT STAIRWAYS EQUAL 0.3 INCHES PER
OCCUPANT PER CBC SECTION 1005.3.1

2. EGRESS WIDTH REQUIREMENTS PER OCCUPANT
SERVED AT ALL EGRESS

COMPONENTS EXCLUDING STAIRS EQUALS 0.2
INCHES PER OCCUPANT PER CBC SECTION 1005.3.2

=

LAl ealr A
Wl el

.
/

!

<
1)

3. MINIMUM WIDTHS FOR EGRESS COMPONENTS
SN PER CBC SECTIONS 1005

Tl
N 4. EXIT ACESS TRAVEL DISTANCE (TABLE 1017.2)

AT

7
ity

AR <250'
B <300’
T | S-2 <400

\
—r—
AT

==

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

: 5. MAX COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL (TABLE
1006.2.1)

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

B

A=T75%

R e

e q‘

NSV

B =100'
M=75

R-2 =125

S =100

6. EVERY ROOM OR SPACE WHICH IS USED FOR
ASSEMBLY, CLASSROOM, DINING, DRINKING, OR
SIMILAR PURPOSES HAVING AN OCCUPANT LOAD OF
50 OR MORE SHALL HAVE THE OCCUPANT LOAD OF
THE ROOM OR SPACE POSTED IN A CONSPICUOUS

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

PLACE, NEAR THE MAIN EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS
DOORWAY. POSTED SIGNS SHALL BE OF AN
APPROVED LEGIBLE PERMANENT DESIGN AND
SHALL BE MAINTAINED BY THE OWNER OR
AUTHORIZED AGENT.

TYPE |-A
11895 SF

NN

BUILDING AREA LEGEND BUILDING
AREA PER CBC

:

|

ISENNNENT [

R-2 RESIDENTIAL
TYPE I-A

24114 SF

24303 SF TYPE 1A

@ TYPE lll-A ﬁﬂé 0 5

4TH FLOOR AREA (CBC)

1" = 40'_0"

2ND FLOOR AREA (CBC)

1" = 40'_0"

B1 FLOOR AREA (CBC)

1 " = 40'_0"

® O

9/9/2025 10:04:56 AM



L)
ro

TO PARAPET
+173.50

~aa

ROOF TOP /
+169.17

5TH FLOOR
+159.00

4TH FLOOR
+148.83

3RD FLOOR
+138.67

2ND FLOOR

GRAND AVENUE
HOLLY STREET

I STUDIO E STUDIO E T T 1 [ " ————p |
e ] -E- . * E-
1ST FLOOR ’{; T Cc COURTYARD C i STUDIO STUDIO v STUDIO |
+118.33— HH‘HE\H:\WEHEWEH‘EHE\HE—HEMEJ\EM\:\H:HE SIS EIEIEIEIEIEIEIEIEIEIEIE J

EEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE E E E e = == = e E T EEE EETETETE STUDIO COURTYARD B STUDIO |
SIIB1 FLOOR H@\,:m:m:M:M:M:M:M:M:M:M:M:M:M:i:M:M:M:M:M:M::J:[F:TLEm:ﬁﬁﬁﬂ:H:{L:MﬂLL:J:\ == '
% | e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e | e N e N N R e i =

L ST e T T T P R A Gatkrvdon 1L L1 oo
=i R = EEE EEEE EEE E EEEE EEEE EEE E ETE E E ET E E E E E E E EE EE E EE N E E T E E N E E T E E N E E T E E N E = E E T = = e —— =k STUDIO E -
@%BZFLOOAJ;%M#MM === == S ——— " ———— e =

I L e T e e e T T T T T T T T
EEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE EEEE EEEEEE EEEEE EEEEEEETEEEEEEE EEEEEE EEEE EETEE EEEEE EEEE EEEET EEEEEE EEEEE EEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE T ETEE =
SIEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE EEEE EE EE EE E EEE EEEEEEEEE EEEEEEEE EE EE EE EE EE EE EE EE T EEEEE EE EE EE EE EE EE EEEEE EE EEEE E EE EE EEE EEEEEE EE EE EE EEEEEE
ElEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE EEEE EEEEE EE EE EE EE EE EEEE EE EE EEEEEEEEEEE EE N E EE EEEEEEEE EE EE EE EEEE T EEEEEEE T EEEEEEEEEEEE EE EEEEEEEEE
=== == == === == === == === === === === = === == == == === == == == === === === === == == === === === === === === == == === == === === == === == === === === == = E
H%Hg\ngHg\Hg\Hg\ngHg\ng\gu\gu\gu\gu\gu\%H%H%H%H%Hz\\%\H%H%H%\\%H%\\gmgmgw\\%H%H%ng\gmgmgwng\gmgmgw\\%H%H%H%\\‘:szmgmgw\\%H%H%H%\\%\\%Hg\u‘:ﬂu\‘:JH\‘:JH\‘:J\H‘:JH\‘:JH\‘:JH\‘:JH\‘:J\H!Hgmgw\\%H%H%H%\E\H‘:ng\H%H%H%H%ng\gmgmgwng\gmgmgw\\gmgmgmg\\\%H%H%Hg\H‘EH\H%H%Hz\\\‘EH\H%H%H%\\%H%H%ng\%H%Hg\\\%H%H%H%\\%H%H%

:‘_

 E—

E—

i
!
l
{
{

| 0-gr
0 o I e
g

[
i
)

=

:

10!_2" 10l_2|| 10!_2" 10l_2|| 10!_2"

| d

H

NORTH - SOUTH SECTION A FIRE
ACCESS DIAGRAM @

1 " = 20'_0"

NOTES

01 PROPERTY LINE
02  EXISTING CURB AND SIDEWALK

04  EXISTING POWER POLE. SEE SURVEY SHEET

G08 & G09
05  GATE WITH KNOX BOX
06  NEIGHBOR'S PARKING STALL
07  LARGE TRUCK LOADING SPACE
08  SMALL TRUCK LAODING SPACE
09  TRANSFORMER
09.1 TRANSFORMER
10  PROPERTY LINE
11 EXISTING FIRE HYDRANT
12 GROUND LEVEL UNIT PATIO & DOORS
13 FIRE APPARATUS
14 PROPOSED FIRE HYDRANT & 6" LATERAL

15 BACK FLOW VALVE / FDC (FIRE DEPARTMENT

CONNECTION)
16 EXISTING TOPO SURFACE
17 FUSING STRUCTURE
18 PULL SECTION CABINET

7 | | EN
/ HOLLY AVENUE o 5
\ /

\ 25! i Oll

B TO PARAPET |
I bl +173.50 \

ROOF TOP L

_2" 10l_2|| 10!_2" 10l_ﬁ" 10!_2" ’b4l_4ll

+169.17

5TH FLOOR TYP
+159.00

4TH FLOOR
+148.83 |

3RD FLOOR
+138.67

2ND FLOOR
+128.50

i 1ST FLOOR
e +118.33 -

uO - IO9

\
|
WASHINGTON STREET

l
r

/

/
KANSAS STREET

“ﬁ“
am “E“
N I
| \
—~ZBR*~”” T T2BR COURTYARD A ﬁi
== W - | _ IEEEEEEEEEEEEE B2FLOOR

e e e e e e e e e L LR el ‘z”mgmgm‘z”m%%mgmgmgmgmgmgmgmgmgmgm‘z 3

< STAIR
ACCESS

KANSAS STREET

\

|

%

=; EH:\H:\H:HEW

== = = === :HEHEHEHEHE\ Tt

I B iy IEEEEEEEEEEEEEE

SN R G B M o 1BR

L HEEEEEEEEEEEEEE:

=
—[  B1FLOOR $
M* +108.17

Y HIEIEEEEEEEEEEEDE

X izl STAIR#2ROOF ACCESS

/-
Z
X CLASS 1 STANDPIPE Z/;‘,
m
=<

I

4STORES@ | ~ PooL
“COURTYARD A | STAR #1 ROOF ACCESS /

CLASS 1 STANDPIPE GOURTYARD A
N @ LEVEL B2

i
=§ 7 —— STAIR #3 ROOF ACC

\

L:’ 0T
TYP

| CLASS 1 STANDPIPE

ESS

EEEE ST E S S S ST S S S E S S S S SRS S R E S S S S S S T S S ST S =R
T T T T T e T T T e T T e e T T e e T T T T T e T T T e T T T e T T T R T T T e T T T T T T e T T T T T T T T T T T e =
S e T T e T T T e T T e el T e e T T T T T T T T T T e T T T T T T T T T T T T T
el I T T e T T e e e e s I e e e e e e S = = e T e e e

]
N

so,,

/?qx HH

= STHR 4 STORIES @ i -

2

| ¥ -~ | COURTYARD'A —
| CeEss LOBB/V b Begisss s T/ A l | L
ENTRANCE / 1

. @ LEVEL B ’ 6 ) COURTYARDA | 4 STORIES@

EAST - WEST SECTION A -FIRE _ HOSEPULL LENQP w7 - ’/ WASHINGTON ST| |
ACCESS DIAGRAM — P ~.. — RESIDENTIAL |1 =
1" = 20!_0" 3 | | ACCESlS \) | — "

e

%
<

%%

J

.

STREET

I
1
I
I
I
|
|
I
|
/
/
/
7
i
o
)
m
w»n
()

N
WASH

| \ (

STAIR #7 ROOF ACCESS | f — .o -0 ]
CLASS 1 STANDPIPE 4 TORI l /\ | | e RAD N /\
| A H i ‘ N ORNY
|
|

—
~

STAIR #4 ROOF ACCESS a
L || 'HFRO CLASS 1 STANDPIPE | (W) ¥

BUILDING ADDRESS : TBD 3 v o : | =
KNOX BOX AT ENTRY 1 COURTYARD'B 150 ‘ |
ANNUNCIATOR PANEL IN LOBBY 50 0 @ LE\,(EL B1 — ELEVATOR FOR FIRE DEPT. 1
|
|
|
|
|
|
|

FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION & y 5%/}/0 o " 450" R g?IEE(TSéIZ-iEEDR)FOR AIRANCE
AA 1

CENTRAL CONTROL STATION PER EL
SEGUNDO FIRE CODE SECTION 511.4 = |4

P
I
|
L
T
S
-

DAl 7 Lo
o
w
—
(@]
Yy
m
A W]
|

STAIR #6 ROOF ACCESS
CLASS 1 STANDPIPE

' N %
I % . 6STORIES PARKING GARAGE TYPE IA )

" )| 4STORES@ |  S5STORES@ |

4
COURTYARDC |  COURTYARDC | — _ 3~ <
10'- .-Ez STORIE = T

COURTYARD[C [ - 7 1%

)

— —

N !
) A | ——| w—— (]
¢ STAR - Ja
ACCESS | -~ -

4

—— =

- - - - e s COURTYARD C
. “@LEVEL 1

pd
_j HOSE PULL LENGTH : 120" -~ [_ T

| V4 — |— B A

- / - ACCESS

— CLASS 1 STANDPIPE

-CLASS 1 STANDPIPE

V]

\ 2ND FLOOR
PARKING
GARAGE

TURAN -

|
\
|
|
|1
K
|
I
|
.J_LL‘.l
|
\
\
AY
"’U~nn

STAR

|
N 7/;/11

[l

\\\J
~
|
/
/
o
w
=
> O
T
w
)
D
o)
>
=
(o )
>
=
m
I
I
\
\
‘ /A
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
|
\
\
\
\
\
\
\
|

l
m
P
o
=
«
o
m

- — B v
. N T L STAR " STAIR #6 ROOF ACCESS STAIR #5 ROOF ACCESS \

& :
S
A MAIL/ PARCEL ~ - - - - - -
& @0% ENTRANCE \ | |
Qe @ LEVEL 1 \ \ /

\\ . GRANDAVENUE :
\ \ /

\ \ \ /

' ) \

/
\ SITE PLAN - FIRE ACCESS DIAGRAM

FIRE DEPARTMENT NOTES

1. EGRESS WIDTH REQUIREMENTS PER OCCUPANT

SERVED AT STAIRWAYS EQUAL 0.3 INCHES PER
OCCUPANT PER CBC SECTION 1005.3.1

2. EGRESS WIDTH REQUIREMENTS PER OCCUPANT

SERVED AT ALL EGRESS
COMPONENTS EXCLUDING STAIRS EQUALS 0.2

INCHES PER OCCUPANT PER CBC SECTION 1005.3.2

3. MINIMUM WIDTHS FOR EGRESS COMPONENTS
PER CBC SECTIONS 1005

4. EXIT ACESS TRAVEL DISTANCE (TABLE 1017.2)
A, R <250

B <300’
S-2 <400

5. MAX COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL (TABLE

1006.2.1)

A=T75%
B =100'
M=75
R-2 =125
S =100

6. EVERY ROOM OR SPACE WHICH IS USED FOR
ASSEMBLY, CLASSROOM, DINING, DRINKING, OR

SIMILAR PURPOSES HAVING AN OCCUPANT LOAD OF
50 OR MORE SHALL HAVE THE OCCUPANT LOAD OF
THE ROOM OR SPACE POSTED IN A CONSPICUOUS

PLACE, NEAR THE MAIN EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS
DOORWAY. POSTED SIGNS SHALL BE OF AN
APPROVED LEGIBLE PERMANENT DESIGN AND
SHALL BE MAINTAINED BY THE OWNER OR
AUTHORIZED AGENT.

SHEET NOTES

1. SEE SITE PLAN ON SHEET A000 FOR ADDITIONAL

INFORMATION.

2. FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD SHALL HAVE
AN UNOBSTRUCTED VERTICAL CLEARANCE
CLEAR TO THE SKY

3. AN APPROVED KEY BOX, LISTED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH UL 1037 SHALL BE
PROVIDED AS REQUIRED BY FIRE CODE 506.
THE LOCATION OF EACH KEY BOX SHALL BE
DETERMINED BY THE FIRE INSPECTOR

4. THE MEANS OF EGRESS, AND EXIT DISCHARGE,

SHALL BE ILLUMINATED AT ANY TIME THE

BUILDING IS OCCUPIED WITH A LIGHT INTENSITY

OF NOT LESS THAN 1 FOOT-CANDLE AT THE
WALKING SURFACE LEVEL, PER CBC 1008.2.1

LEGEND

20" MINIMUM WIDE FIRE ACCESS
LANE OPEN TO SKY DESIGNED AND

MAINTAINED TO SUPPORT 25 TONS

5' WIDE FIRE FIGHTER WALKWAY
ACCESS ROUTE

2-STORY ROOF

3-STORY ROOF

4-STORY ROOF

5-STORY ROOF

6-STORY ROOF

1" = 30'_0"

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN

PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

FIRE SAFTY
PLAN

SHEET

G06

9/9/2025 10:05:02 AM



CHAPTER 9

FIRE CODE

SECTION:

13-9-1: Adoption Of California Fire Code, 2022 Edition
13-9-2: Amendments To The Fire Code

13-9-3: Geographical Limits

13-9-1: ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 2022 EDITION:

Pursuant to California Government Code sections 50022.1 to 50022.8, the California Fire Code (“CFC”), 2022 Edition,
published as Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of Regulations, including Appendices B, C, O, BB, and CC, and
Sections 503, 510.3, 808.5, and 1103.2, is adopted by reference, subject to the amendments, additions and deletions set
forth below. One true copy of the CFC is on file in the office of the Building Official and is available for public inspection as
required by law. (Ord. 1532, 12-6-2016; amd. Ord. 1604, 11-19-2019; Ord. 1641, 11-15-2022; Ord. 1660, 5-7-2024)

13-9-2: AMENDMENTS TO THE FIRE CODE:
Section 1.11.4.1 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

1.11.4.1 Fees. The fire department is authorized to collect fees for permits, fire inspections and other services, including
the review of plans, annual fire inspections and new business inspections. Fees shall be paid by the applicant prior to
issuance of permits. Fire department fees shall be subject to change based upon the producer's price index.

Section 104.1.1 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:
104.1.1 Authority of the Fire Chief and Fire Department.

1. The Fire Chief is authorized and directed to enforce all applicable State fire laws and provisions of this ordinance and
to perform such duties as directed by the El Segundo City Council.

2. The Fire Chief is authorized to administer, interpret, and enforce this ordinance. Under the Fire Chief's direction, the El
Segundo Fire Department is authorized to enforce ordinances of the City of EI Segundo pertaining to the following:

2.1. The prevention of fires.
2.2. The suppression or extinguishment of dangerous or hazardous fires.
2.3. The storage, use, and handling of hazardous materials.

2.4. The installation and maintenance of automatic, manual, and other private fire alarm systems and fire extinguishing
equipment.

2.5. The maintenance and regulation of fire escapes.

2.6. The maintenance of fire protection and the elimination of fire hazards on land, in buildings, structures and other
property, including those under construction.

2.7. The maintenance of means of egress.
2.8. The investigation of the cause, origin and circumstances of fire and unauthorized releases of hazardous materials.

3. The following persons are hereby authorized to interpret and enforce the provisions of this ordinance and to make
arrests and issue citations as authorized by law:

3.1. The Fire Chief, Peace Officers and Public Officers of the El Segundo Fire Department.
3.2. The Police Chief and any police officer serving the city of El Segundo.
3.3. Officers of the California Highway Patrol.
3.4. Code Officers of El Segundo Code Enforcement Department.
Section 104.1.2 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

104.1.2 Operating Guidelines. The El Segundo Fire Department Fire Prevention Standard Operating Guidelines has
been created and adopted to serve as instructions and interpretations of the adopted Fire Code. The El Segundo Fire
Department Fire Prevention Standard Operating Guidelines shall be a published document, amended from time to time to
provide current instruction and interpretation.

Section 104.11.2 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

104.11.2 Technical assistance. When there is a fire, explosion, hazardous materials incident or other potential life or
serious property threatening situation, the fire code official can request the owner to or operator to hire a private fire
protection or hazardous materials investigator, acceptable to the fire code official and at the expense of the owner or

511.1.1 Scope. In addition to other applicable provisions of this code, other laws and regulations, and any policies of the
fire code official, the provisions of this article applies to every mid-rise building, of any type construction, newly constructed
after the adoption of this Code, or which undergoes a complete renovation that requires the complete vacancy of the
building.

Exceptions: The following structures, while defined as mid-rise buildings, are not subject to this article:
1. Buildings used exclusively as open parking garage;
2. Buildings where all floors above the third floor (9,144 mm) level are used exclusively as open parking garage;

3. Buildings such as power plants, lookout towers, steeples, grain houses, and similar structures with non-continuous
human occupancy, when so determined by the fire code official;

4. Buildings used exclusively for jails, prisons, and hospitals.
511.1.2 Definitions. For definitions of MID-RISE BUILDING and BUILDING ACCESS, see Section 202.
511.2 Building Access.
511.2.1 Building Access. Building access must be provided and approved by the fire code official.
511.3 Fire and Life Safety Requirements.

511.3.1 Automatic Fire Sprinklers. Every mid-rise building must be protected throughout by an automatic fire sprinkler
system that is designed and installed in conformance with NFPA 13. A shut-off valve and a water flow alarm device must be
provided for each floor.

511.3.2 Standpipes. Every mid-rise building must be provided with a class | standpipe system in each required
stairway. The standpipe system must be interconnected with the fire sprinkler system. The system must consist of 2 1 /2
inch hose valves provided for each floor level above or below grade. Two hose outlets must also be located on the roof,
outside of each stair shaft enclosure that penetrates the roof. Hose connections must be located in the exit vestibule, unless
otherwise approved by the fire code official.

511.3.3 Smoke Detection. Smoke detectors must be provided in accordance with this section. Smoke detectors must
be connected to an automatic fire alarm system installed in accordance with NFPA 72. The actuation of any detector
required by this section will operate the emergency voice alarm signaling system and will place into operation all equipment
necessary to prevent the circulation of smoke through air return and exhaust ductwork.

511.3.3.1 Location. Smoke detectors must be located as follows:

1. In every elevator machinery room and in all elevator lobbies. Elevator lobby detectors must be connected to an
alarm verification zone or be listed as a releasing device.

2. In the main return-air and exhaust-air plenum of each air- conditioning system. Such device must be located in a
serviceable area downstream of the last duct inlet.

3. At each connection to a vertical duct or riser serving two or more stories from a return-air duct or plenum of an
air conditioning system. In Group R-1 and R-2 Occupancies, an approved smoke detector may be used in each return-air
riser carrying not more than 5,000 cubic feet per minute and serving not more than 10 air inlet openings.

4. For Group R-1 and R-2 Occupancies, in all corridors serving as a means of egress for an occupant load for 10 or
more.

511.3.4 Smoke Control. A passive or active smoke control system must be provided for all mid-rise buildings whenever a
complete floor is in excess of 55 feet (16.764 mm) from the lowest point of Fire Department access. Such system must be
mechanical and must be designed, installed, and tested to be in compliance with Section 909.

511.3.5 Fire Alarm System.An approved and listed, automatic and manual, fully addressable and electronically
supervised fire alarm system must be provided in conformance with this code and any policies of the Fire Prevention
Division.

511.3.6 Emergency voice alarm signaling system. The operation of any automatic or manual fire alarm initiating device
must automatically sound an alert tone followed by a pre-recorded voice instruction giving appropriate information and
direction on a general or selective basis to the entire building, occupied and normally non-occupied areas.

511.3.6.1 Manual override. A manual override for emergency voice communication must be provided for all paging
zones.

511.4 Central Control Station.

511.4.1 General. A central control station room for fire department-operations must be provided. The location and
accessibility of the central control station room must be approved by the fire department. The room must be separated from
the remainder of the building by not less than one-hour, fire resistive occupancy separation. The room must be a minimum
of 200 square feet with a minimum dimension of 8 feet. It must contain the following as a minimum:

1. The voice alarm and public address panels.

2. Buildings that are three or more stories in height.
3. Buildings that are two or more stories below the highest level of fire department access.
Section 903.4.2 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

903.4.2 Alarms. One exterior approved audible and visible device, located on the exterior of the building in an approved
location, shall be connected to each automatic sprinkler system. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm device shall be activated by
water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a fire alarm
system is installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system. Exterior audible
and visible alarm notification shall be provided on NFPA 13, NFPA 13R and NFPA 13D systems.

Exception: Group R-3 and R-3.1 occupancies floor control valves and waterflow detection assemblies shall not be
required.

Section 909.11 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

909.11 General. The smoke-control system shall be supplied with two sources of power. Primary power shall be from the
normal building power systems. Secondary power shall be from an approved standby source complying with Section 1203 of
this code. The standby power source and its transfer switches shall be in a room separate from the normal power
transformers and switchgear and ventilated directly to and from the exterior. The room shall be enclosed with not less than
1-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with
Section 712, or both.

Transfer to full standby power shall be automatic and within 60 seconds of failure of the primary power. The systems shall
comply with the Electrical Code.

Exception: The secondary power is not required for pressurized enclosures in buildings of less than 5 floors used for
human occupancy

Section 1103.2 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

Section 1103.2. Emergency Responder Communication Coverage in Existing Buildings.Existing buildings other
than Group R-3, that do not have approved in-building, two-way emergency response communication coverage for
emergency responders in the building based on existing coverage levels of public safety communication systems, shall be
equipped with such coverage according to one of the following:

1. Where an existing wired communication system cannot be repaired or is being replaced, or where not approved in
accordance with Section 510.1, Exception 1.

2. Within a time frame established by the adopting authority.

Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the in-building, two-way emergency responder
communication coverage system is not needed.

Section 1207.11.3 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:
1207.11.3 Location. ESS shall be installed only in the following locations:
1 Detached garages and detached accessory structures.
2. Deleted.

3. Outdoors or on the exterior side of the exterior walls located not less than 3 feet (914mm) from doors and windows
directly entering the dwelling unit.

4. Deleted.
ESS shall not be installed in any attached structure to a dwelling unit.
Section 1207.11.4 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

1207.11.4 Energy Ratings. Individual ESS units shall have a maximum rating of 20kWh. The aggregate rating structure
shall not exceed:

1. Delete.

2. 80 kWh in detached garages and detached accessory structures not associated with dwelling units.
3. 80 kWh on exterior walls.

4. 80 kWh outdoors on the ground.

ESS Installations exceeding the permitted individual or aggregate ratings shall be installed in accordance with Sections
1207.1 through 1207.9 of the California Fire Code.

Section 1207.11.6 “Fire Detection” of the 2022 CFC is deleted.
Section 3305.9 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

operator, to provide a full report of the incident, including, without limitation, such matters as origin, cause, circumstances or
proposed solution to the problem.

Section 104.12.4 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

104.1.4 Financial Responsibility. Any person who personally, or through another, willfully, negligently, or in violation of
law, sets a fire, allows a fire to be set, or allows a fire kindled or attended by him/her to escape from his/her control, allows
any hazardous material to be handled, stored, disposed of or transported in a manner not in accordance with this Code,
State law or nationally recognized Standards, allows any hazardous material to escape from his/her control, allows
continuation of a violation of this Code is liable for the expense of fighting the fire or for the expenses incurred during a
hazardous materials incident, and such expense will be a charge against that person.

Section 104.12.4 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

104.12.4 Authority of Peace Officers.|n enforcing the provisions of the California Fire Code, California Building Code,
California Health & Safety Code, California Penal Code, California Vehicle Code and the El Segundo Municipal Code and
such laws, orders, rules and regulations, variances and standards in connection therewith, the Fire Marshal and Fire
Prevention Specialist are hereby given the powers of peace officers.

Section 105.2 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

105.2 Application for Permit. Applications for permits will be made to the fire prevention office in such form and detail as
prescribed by the fire code official. Applications for permits must be accompanied by such plans as required by the fire code
official. Any applicable permit and/or plan check fees must be paid at the time of application for the permit and/or plan
review.

Section 107.4 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

107.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. A person who commences any work before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to a fee in addition to the normally established plan check fee, equal to 100% of such normally
established permit fee, or as otherwise determined by the fire code official.

Section 107.7 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

107.7 Cost Recovery. Fire suppression, investigation, rescue, or emergency medical costs are recoverable in
accordance with Health and Safety Code Sections 13009 and 13009.1, as may be amended from time to time. Additionally,
any person who negligently, intentionally or in violation of law causes an emergency response, including, but not limited to, a
traffic accident, spill of toxic or flammable fluids or chemicals is liable for the costs of securing such emergency, including
those costs pursuant to Government Code Section 53150, et seq, as may be amended from time to time. Any expense
incurred by the El Segundo Fire Department for securing such emergency shall constitute a debt of such person and shall
be collectable by the city of El Segundo in the same manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, express or
implied.

Section 108.2.1 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

108.2.1 Inspection requests. It is the duty of the holder of the permit or their duly authorized agent to notify the fire code
official when work is ready for inspection. It is the duty of the permit holder to provide access to and means for inspection of
such work that are required by this code. Every request for inspection must be filed not less than three working days before
such inspection is desired. Such request must be in writing and all inspection fees paid prior to requesting.

Section 111.5 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

111.5 Filing fee and application. The City will assess a fee in an amount set by resolution at the time that an appellant
files an appeal of any order, decisions, or determination made by the fire code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this Code. The fee is refundable should the appellant prevail in a decision by the Board. The appeal must be
taken by filing a written notice of appeal, in letterform, to the Board of Appeals. The Board's decision constitutes the City's
final decision.

Section 112.4 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

112.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or fail to comply with any of its requirements
or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire
code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by
a fine of not more than $1,000 dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding 6 months, or both such fine and imprisonment.
Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served constitutes a separate offense.

Section 202, definition of "Fire Chief" in the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:
FIRE CHIEF. The Fire Chief of the El Segundo Fire Department or the Fire Chief's designee.
Section 202, definition of "Low-Rise Building" is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

LOW-RISE BUILDING. Is any building that is less than four stories in height from the lowest level of fire department
access.

Section 202, definition of "Mid-Rise Building" is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

The fire alarm graphic annunciator panel.

Elevator annunciator panel when the building exceeds 55 feet in height.
Status indicators and controls of air handling systems.

Controls for unlocking stairwell doors.

Annunciator panels for emergency and stand-by power status.
Annunciator panels for fire pump status.

Complete building plans set.

Work table.

© ® N O 0 A~ LN

10. Elevator control switches for switching of emergency power.

511.4.2 Annunciation identification. Control panels in the central control station must be permanently identified as to
function. Water flow, automatic fire detection and manually activated fire alarms, supervisory and trouble signals must be
monitored by an approved central monitoring station and annunciated in the central control station by means of an audible
and visual indicator. For the purposes of annunciation, zoning must be in accordance with the following:

1. When the system serves more than one building, each building must be considered separately.

2. Each floor must be considered a separate zone.

3. When one or more risers serve the same floor, each riser must be considered a separate zone.
511.5 Elevators.

511.5.1 Standards. Elevators and elevator lobbies must be provided and must comply with the California Building Code
and the following:

511.5.2 General. At least one elevator cab must be assigned for Fire Department use, which serves all floors of the
building. All provisions hereinafter are in reference to said elevator cab(s).

511.5.2.1 Size. The size of the elevator cab must have dimensions as specified in Section 915.5.2.1.1.

511.5.2.1.1 Ambulance Stretcher. The elevator cab must be provided with adequate dimensions to accommodate an
ambulance type stretcher in accordance with the provisions of Section 3002.4a.1 of California Building Code.

511.6 Standby Power.

511.6.1 General. An on-site standby power system conforming to the City of El Segundo Electrical Code must be
provided. In the event of failure of the normal power source, the standby power system must provide an alternate source of
electrical power to serve at least the designated loads as set forth in Section 511.6.2 at full power. The system may consist
of an on-site generator or a system of batteries, or both. The installation must be in accordance with this code, nationally
recognized standards, and any policies of the fire code official.

511.6.2 Loads. The power load requirements for sizing the standby power system must include, without limitation to the
following:

1. Exit signs and exit path illumination;

Fire alarm system;

Elevator(s) assigned for fire department use;
Electrically driven fire pumps (if provided);

Smoke control systems;

I

Stairwell pressurization;

7. Lighting circuits supplying all elevator cabs, elevator lobbies, generator room, fire pump room, and other areas
designated by the fire code official.

511.6.3 Fuel Supplies. On-site fuel supplies for prime movers of a standby power generator must be sufficient for at
least 12 hours at the generator’s listed full load. Where fuel supplies require automatic transfer into a primary tank from a
secondary fuel storage tank, the fuel transfer system must be provided with redundant fuel pumps to insure reliability. The
fuel supply tank provided must be capable of storing at least 200% of the calculated amount of fuel needed.

511.7 Emergency Electrical System.

511.7.1 General. Electrical systems and equipment specified in Section 915.6 are classed as emergency systems and
must be installed in accordance with this code, NFPA 110, NFPA 111 and policies of the fire code official. Such systems
must operate within 10 seconds of failure to normal power supply. Such emergency power supply may be separate from the
standby power required for fire pumps and elevators assigned for fire department use.

3305.9 Separations between construction areas. Separations used in Type | and Type Il construction to separate
construction areas from occupied portions of the building, shall be constructed of materials that comply with one of the
following:

1. Non-combustible materials.
2. Materials that exhibit a flame spread index not exceeding 25 when tested in accordance with ASTM E84 or UL 723.

3. Materials exhibiting a heat peak release rate not exceeding 300kW/m when tested in accordance with ASTM E1354 at
an incident heat flux of 50 kW{r'n2 in the horizontal orientation on specimens at the thickness intended for use.

Section 5601.1.3 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

5601.1.3 Fireworks. The possession, manufacture, storage, sale, handling and use of fireworks is prohibited. The
possession, sale, use, and/or discharge of “Safe and Sane” fireworks is prohibited.

Exceptions:
1. Storage and handling of fireworks as allowed by Section 5604.
2. Manufacture, assembly and testing of fireworks as allowed in Section 5605 and Health and Safety Code Division 11.

3. The use of fireworks for fireworks displays, pyrotechnic before a proximate audience and pyrotechnic special effects
in motion pictures, television, theatrical or group entertainment productions are allowed in Title 19, Division 1, Chapter 6
Fireworks reprinted in Section 5608 and Health and Safety Code Division 11.

Section 5601.3.1 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

5601.3.1 Fireworks. The manufacturing, possession, storage, sale, use and handling of fireworks, including without
limitation, “Safe and Sane” fireworks, is prohibited.

Exceptions:

1. Storage of fireworks in accordance with the requirements for low order explosives in Title 19, California Code of
Regulations, Chapter 10.

2. Storage of fireworks, 1.4G in accordance with the Building Code.

3. Use and handling of fireworks for professional display in accordance with Title 19, California Code of Regulations,
Chapter 6.

Section 5601.7 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

5601.7 Seizure. All fireworks including “State approved” shall be illegal in the City of El Segundo. The fire code official and
police officers shall have the authority to seize, take and remove fireworks and/or safe and sane fireworks stored, sold,
offered for sale, used or handled in violation of the provisions of Title 19 CCR, Division 1, Chapter 6 and Health and Safety
Code, Chapter 9.

Exception: When permits are issued for such use.

5601.7.1 Financial Responsibility. See section 104.11.4 Financial Responsibility for cost recovery of enforcement of
section 5609.1. Fireworks may be identified as hazardous waste by the State of California; violators shall be responsible for
any disposal fees.

Section 5801.1.1 is added to the CFC to read as follows:

5801.1.1 Methane Soil Gas. All sources of methane soil gas, including petrogenic and biogenic, are subject to methane
soil gas testing, passive or active mitigation, and methane detection and alarm system per El Segundo Fire Departments
Guidelines.

Section B105.2 of Appendix B of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

B105.2 Buildings other than one- and two-family dwellings, Group R-3 and R-4 buildings and townhouses.The
minimum fire-flow and flow duration for buildings other than one- and two-family dwellings, Group R-3 and R-4 buildings and
townhouses shall be as specified in Table B105.1.

Exception: A reduction in required fire-flow up to 50 percent, as approved, is allowed when the building is protected with
an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.1.1, 903.1.2, or 903.3.1.3. The resulting
fire-flow must not be less than 1,500 gallons per minute (5678 U/min) for the prescribed duration as specified in Table
B105.1.

(Ord. 1532, 12-6-2016; amd. Ord. 1604, 11-19-2019; Ord. 1641, 11-15-2022; Ord. 1660, 5-7-2024)

MID-RISE BUILDING. A building four or more stories high, but not exceeding 75 feet in height and not defined as a high-
rise building by section 202 of the California Building Code. Height measurements shall be made from the underside of the
roof or floor above the topmost space that may be occupied to the lowest fire apparatus access road level.

Section 308.1.4, "Open-Flame Cooking Devices" of the 2022 California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety.
Section 311.5, “Placards” of the 2022 California Fire Code is deleted in its entirety.

Section 503 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

Section 503 Fire Apparatus Access Roads

503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in accordance with Sections
503.1.1 through 503.1.3.

503.1.1. Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be provided for every facility, building or
portion of a building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. The fire apparatus access road shall
comply with the requirements of this section and shall extend to within 150 feet (45270 mm) of all portions of the facility and
all portions of the exterior walls of the first story of a building as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the
building or facility.

Exceptions:

1. The fire code official is authorized to increase the dimension of 150 feet (45720 mm) where any of the following
conditions occur:

1.1. The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.1.1, 903.3 or 903.1.3.

1.2. Fire apparatus access roads cannot be installed because of location on property, topography, waterways,
nonnegotiable grades or other similar conditions, and an approved alternative means of fire protection is provided.

1.3. There are not more than two Group R-3 or Group U occupancies.

2. Where approved by the fire code official, fire apparatus access roads shall be permitted to be exempted or
modified for solar photovoltaic power generation facilities.

503.1.2. Additional access. The fire code official is authorized to require more than one fire apparatus access road
based on the potential for impairment of a single road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain, climatic conditions or other
factors that could limit access.

503.1.3. High-piled storage. Fire department vehicle access to buildings used for high-piled combustible storage shall
comply with the applicable provisions of Chapter 32.

503.2 Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged in accordance with Sections 503.2.1
through 503.2.8. Per California Code of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1, §3.05(a) Fire Department Access and Egress,
required access roads form every building to a public street shall be all-weather hard-surfaced (suitable for use by fire
apparatus) right-of-way not less than 20 feet in width. Such right-of-way shall be unobstructed and maintained only as
access to the public street.

Exception: The enforcing agency may waive or modify this requirement if in his opinion such all-weather hard-surfaced
condition is not necessary in the interest of public safety and welfare.

503.2.1. Dimensions. Fire apparatus roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm),
exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical
clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm).

503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall have the authority to require or permit modifications to the required access
widths where they are inadequate for fire or rescue operations or where necessary to meet the public safety objectives of
the jurisdiction.

503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus roads shall be designed and maintained to support the imposed loads of fire apparatus
and shall be surfaced so as to provide all-weather driving capabilities.

503.2.4 Turning radius. The required turning radius of a fire apparatus access road shall be determined by the fire code
official.

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (45720 mm) in length shall be provided
with an approved area for turning around fire apparatus.

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is part of a fire apparatus access road,
the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in accordance with AASHTO HB-17. Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be
designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both
entrances to bridges where required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed or such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be installed and
maintained where required by the fire code official.

511.7.2 Emergency Systems. The following are classed as emergency systems:
1. Exit signs and means of egress illumination.
2. Fire alarm system.
3. Fire detection system.
4. Sprinkler alarm system.
5. Elevator cab lighting.
6. Smoke control systems.
511.8 Means of Egress.
511.8.1 General. Means of egress must comply with the provisions of Section 915.8.

511.8.1 Stairway enclosures. All stairways used for exiting must be protected by an exit enclosure designed in
accordance with the California Building Code, Section 1020.1 and this Section.

511.8.2.1 Construction. Construction of stairway enclosures must be in accordance with the California Building Code,
Section 1023.

511.8.2.2 Extent of Enclosure. Stairway enclosures must be continuous and must fully enclose all portions of the
stairway. Exit enclosure must exit directly to the exterior of the building or include an exit passageway on the ground floor,
leading to the exterior of the building. Each exit enclosure must extend completely through the roof and be provided with a
door that leads onto the roof.

511.8.2.3 Openings and Penetrations. Openings and penetrations must be as specified in the California Building Code,
Section 1023.4 and 1023.5.

511.8.2.4 Pressurized Enclosures. A pressurized stairway enclosure must be provided for all mid-rise buildings
whenever a complete floor is in excess of 55 feet (16.764 mm) from the lowest point of Fire Department access. The
pressurized stairway must be designed and pressurized as specified in the California Building Code, Section 909.20.

511.8.2.4.1 Vestibules. Pressurized stairway enclosures, serving Mid-Rise buildings must be provided with a
pressurized entrance vestibule on each floor that complies with the California Building Code, Section 909.20.

511.8.2.4.1.1 Vestibule Size. Vestibule size must be not less than 44 inches in width and not less than 72 inches in
the direction of travel.

511.8.2.4.1.2 Vestibule Construction. Vestibules must have walls, ceilings and floors of not less than two-hour fire
resistive construction.

511.8.2.4.1.3 Vestibule Doors. Vestibule doors must comply with California Building Code, Section 909.20.

511.8.2.4.1.4 Pressure Differences. The minimum pressure difference within a vestibule must comply with California
Building Code, Section 909.20.

511.8.2.4.1.5 Standpipes. Fire Department standpipe connections and valves serving the floor must be within the
vestibule and located in a manner so as not to obstruct egress when hose lines are connected and charged.

511.8.2.5 Locking of Stairway doors. All stairway doors that are locked to prohibit access from the stairway side must
have the capability of being unlocked simultaneously, without unlatching, upon a signal from the fire control room. Upon
failure of normal electrical service, or activation of any fire alarm, the locking mechanism must automatically retract to the
unlocked position. Hardware for locking of stairway doors must be State Fire Marshal listed and approved by the fire code
official by permit before installation. Stairway doors located between the vestibules and stairway shaft must not be locked.

511.8.2.6 Communications. A telephone or other two-way communications system connected to an approved
emergency service which operates continuously must be provided at not less than every third floor in each required exit
stairway vestibule.

Section 808.5 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

Section 808.5. Play Structures Added to Existing Buildings.Where play structures that exceed 10 feet (3048 mm) in
height or 150 square feet (14 m?) in area are added inside an existing building, they shall comply with Section 424 of the
California Building Code.

Section 901.4.8 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

901.8 Partial fire sprinkler systems. Where in this Code or the Building Code a partial fire sprinkler system is required,
the fire sprinkler system must be installed, modified or extended to protect the entire building or structure.

Section 901.11 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

901.11 Problematic systems. In the event of a failure of a fire protection system or 2 or more alarms in a week where the
fire code official finds no evidence of a situation requiring a response, the fire code official is authorized to require the

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be within the limits established by the fire code official
based on the fire department’s apparatus.

503.2.8 Angles of approach and departure.The angles of approach and departure for fire apparatus access roads
shall be within the limits established by the fire code official based on the fire department's apparatus.

503.3 Marking. Where required by the fire code official, approved signs or other approved notices or markings that include
the words “NO PARKING-FIRE LANE" shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads or prohibit the
obstruction thereof. The means by which fire lanes are designated shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all
times and be replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads.Fire apparatus access roads shall not be obstructed in any manner,
including eh parking of vehicles. The minimum widths and clearances established in Sections 503.2.1 and 503.2.2 shall be
maintained at all times.

503.4.1 Traffic calming devices. Traffic calming devices shall be prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

503.5 Required gates or barricades. The fire code official is authorized to require the installation and maintenance of
gates or other approved barricades across fire apparatus access roads, trails or other accessways, not including public
streets, alleys or highways. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates
intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM
F2200.

503.5.1 Secured gates and barricades. Where required, gates and barricades shall be secured in an approved
manner. Roads, trails and other accessways that have been closed and obstructed in the manner prescribed in Section
503.5 shall not be trespassed on or used unless authorized by the owner and the fire code official.

Exception: The restriction on use shall not apply to public officers acting within the scope of duty.

503.5.2 Fence and gates. School grounds may be fenced and gates therein may be equipped with locks, provided that
safe dispersal areas based on 3 square feet (0.28 m?) per occupant are located between the school and the fence. Such
required safe dispersal areas shall not be located less than 50 feet (15240 mm) from school buildings. Every public and
private school shall conform with Section 32020 of the Education Code.

503.6 Security gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road shall be approved by the fire
code official. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation. The security
gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided,
shall be listed in accordance with ULA 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

Section 503.6.1 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

503.6.1 Automatic opener. New motorized gates shall be provided with means to be automatically opened remotely by
emergency vehicle in accordance with El Segundo Fire Department Guidelines, as may be amended from time to time.

Exception: Gates serving individual one- and two-family dwelling parcels.
Section 507.2.1 of the 2022 CFC to amended to read as follows:

507.2.1 Private fire hydrants. When required, private on-site fire hydrants shall be in accordance with the location and
spacing specified for public streets and hydrants for similar occupancies. All private hydrants shall be installed in accordance
with NFPA 24, Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and their Appurtenances, unless required to meet public standards.
Private hydrants shall be painted red. When alternate materials or methods of protection, as approved by the chief are
provided, these requirements may be modified or waived.

Section 510.3 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

Section 510.3 Permit Required. A construction permit for the installation of or modification to in-building, two-way
emergency responder communication coverage systems and related equipment is required as specified in Section 105.6.4.
Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered a modification and does not require a permit.

Section 510.4.2.9 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

510.4.2.9 Building conduit and pathway survivability. All new buildings shall be constructed with not less than a two
inch (2") dedicated conduit raceway or other method approved by the fire code official for future expandability, or the
installation of an Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System. The raceway shall meet pathway survivability
requirements in NFPA 1221 and shall be installed from the lowest floor level to the roof.

510.4.2.9.1 Identification. The raceway and junction boxes shall be labeled “Emergency Responder Radio Coverage
System use only”.

Section 511 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:
Section 511 Mid-Rise Buildings.

Section 511.1 General.

building owner or occupant to provide a fire watch until the system is repaired. Fire watch personnel must be provided with
at least one approved means for notification of the Fire Department and their only duty is to perform constant patrols of the
protected premises and keep watch for fires.

Section 901.12 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

901.12 Firewatch. Per Section 901.11 the Fire Chief is authorized to require the building owner or occupant to provide a
fire watch with personnel acceptable to the Fire Chief until documentation is provided that the system is repaired and is
operational. Such individuals shall be provided with at least one approved means for notification of the fire department and
their only duty shall be to perform constant patrols of the protected premises, keep and maintain a log and keep watch for
fires.

Section 903.2 of the 2022 CFC is amended as follows:
903.2 Where required.

A. New Buildings. Unless otherwise prohibited by law, an approved automatic sprinkler system in new buildings and
structures shall be required for all occupancies.

Exception: New detached buildings under one thousand (1,000) square feet subject to approval of the Fire Official.

B. Existing Buildings. Unless otherwise prohibited by law, any work to an existing building which removes more than fifty
percent (50%) of the exterior perimeter wall height as defined in ESMC 15-1-6 for additions and alterations will require the
existing building to be fully sprinklered throughout.

Section 903.2.1 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.2 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.3 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.4 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.5 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.6 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.7 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.8 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.9 of the 2022 CFC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 903.2.10 of the 2022 CFC is deleted.

Section 903.2.10.2 of the 2022 CFC is deleted.

Section 903.2.11.1 of the 2022 CFC is deleted.

Section 903.2.11.3 of the 2022 CFC is deleted.

Section 903.2.22 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

903.2.22 Structures in the Smoky Hollow Specific Plan Area.An automatic sprinkler system must be provided
throughout every facility or building hereafter constructed within the Smoky Hollow Specific Plan Area.

903.2.22.1 Existing Buildings. Unless otherwise prohibited by law, any work to an existing building which removes
more than fifty percent (50%) of the exterior perimeter wall height as defined in ESMC 15-1-6 for additions and alterations
will require the existing building to be fully sprinklered throughout.

Section 903.3.5.3 is added to the 2022 CFC to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of hydraulically calculated fire sprinkler systems shall not
exceed 90% of the water supply capacity.

Section 903.3.8 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

903.3.8 Limited Area Sprinkler Systems. When a fire sprinkler system is required it shall be provided throughout the
building.

Exception: Protection for specific appliances and/or hazards.
Section 903.3.9 of the 2022 CFC is amended to read as follows:

903.3.9 Floor Control valves. Floor control valves and waterflow detection assemblies shall be installed at each floor
where any of the following occur:

1. Buildings where the floor level of the highest story is located more than 30 feet above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access.

NOTES

SHEET NOTES

1. EGRESS WIDTH REQUIREMENTS PER OCCUPANT
SERVED AT STAIRWAYS EQUAL 0.3 INCHES PER
OCCUPANT PER CBC SECTION 1005.3.1

2. EGRESS WIDTH REQUIREMENTS PER OCCUPANT
SERVED AT ALL EGRESS

COMPONENTS EXCLUDING STAIRS EQUALS 0.2
INCHES PER OCCUPANT PER CBC SECTION 1005.3.2

3. MINIMUM WIDTHS FOR EGRESS COMPONENTS
PER CBC SECTIONS 1005

4. EXIT ACESS TRAVEL DISTANCE (TABLE 1017.2)
A, R <250
B <300’
S-2 <400’

5. MAX COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL (TABLE
1006.2.1)

A=T75
B =100
M=75
R-2=125'
S =100

6. EVERY ROOM OR SPACE WHICH IS USED FOR
ASSEMBLY, CLASSROOM, DINING, DRINKING, OR
SIMILAR PURPOSES HAVING AN OCCUPANT LOAD OF
50 OR MORE SHALL HAVE THE OCCUPANT LOAD OF
THE ROOM OR SPACE POSTED IN A CONSPICUOUS
PLACE, NEAR THE MAIN EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS
DOORWAY. POSTED SIGNS SHALL BE OF AN
APPROVED LEGIBLE PERMANENT DESIGN AND
SHALL BE MAINTAINED BY THE OWNER OR
AUTHORIZED AGENT.

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

FIRE CODE

SHEET

G06.1

9/9/2025 10:05:03 AM



5 " n
CAUTION: IF THIS SHEET IS NOT 30"x42" IT IS A REDUCED PRINT
¥
S as)
. 2 §
>-
Z
VICINITY MAP LEGAL DESCRIPTION <
- - - - - - - - n § 3573 HAYDEN
THE LAND REFERRED TO HEREIN BELOW IS SITUATED IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE COUNTY OF L O & AVENUE
LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AND IS DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: m - CULVER CITY,
E MAPLE AVE N [}
& PARCEL 1: (APN: 4139-006-056, 064) o § CA 90232
o THE EASTERLY 66 FEET OF LOT 179 AND ALL OF LOT 208 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY - = =
E OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN ) ) ) ) = 'J “E’ 310:399.7975
& BOOK 22 PAGE 106, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. =
E MARIPOSA AVE WASHINGTON ST - EXCEPT THE NORTH 30 FEET OF SAID LOT 208 CONVEYED TO THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES FOR PUBLIC e < E
\ % ROAD AND HIGHWAY PURPOSES. N -y -y y o S
E_PINE AVE | PN S T g
[ SEGUNDO AVE < PARCEL 2: (APN: 4139-006-057) 5 s
PARKS &  /CALIFORNIA ST = LOT 180 ON BLOCK 123 OF THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF o -
RECREATIO| CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF m c
S THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. CINE TABLE " o m o
- 3 EXCEPTING ALL MINERALS, OIL GAS AND OTHER HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES WITHIN OR UNDERLYING OR 3 29 £ 3
- E GRAND AVE |2 - THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM THE HEREIN ABOVE DESCRIBED REAL PROPERTY TOGETHER WITH THE SOLE i 94.89TC > 11048710 S
:;’& S = 2 AND EXCLUSIVE RIGHT TO REMOVE SAME, PROVIDED, HOWEVER, THAT THE GRANTOR HEREN, ITS BIFS, | (IS o5 e LINE # | DIRECTION | LENGTH MONUMENT NOTES wairrs e, JBAIL o o TODAYS S 0 S m Q
' g % SUCCESSORS OR ASSIGNS SHALL NOT AND DO NOT HAVE THE RIGHT TO GO UPON THE REAL PROPERTY, 95.03FS ' B 18 | NOOUE'IE'W | 489.89° o Y citiog 63 CURB DRAN ~J| 1 | 7077 o) o
E FRANKLIN AVE < = 94 76FS x 95.10F9 95.50F g 110. 78F. & O c
= = = OR ANY PART THEREOF, TO CARRY ON DRILLNG OR OTHER OPERATIONS FOR THE DISCOVERY OR 94 abagib b - o5 17 MON DESCRIPTION x | Mfi09 651 HOZENMNS 9 £
= 8 w PRODUCTION OF OIL, GAS OR OTHER HYDROCARBON OR OTHER MINERALS; BUT SAID GRANTORS, ITS I | o g5 10rd BRI\ o 125 19 | noovsss'w | 3s6.50° - % 1092675 * 109.9 34" L1051 i@; < ©
pe SUCCESSORS OR ASSIGNS SHALL HAVE THE RIGHT TO REMOVE SAID OIL, GAS, HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES 94.88RI | X 944875 ) o R o " FD SPIKE & WASHER, STAMPED "LS 541", PER PWFB 0816/561 110.00Fs L STl BIC 1104470/ ] 2 °
EL SEGUNDO BLVD OR OTHER MINERALS WITHIN OR UNDERLYING OR THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM BENEATH THE SURFACE e UNABLE TO OPEN (9% 71£S = 9155 NV SV 12 PIPE L10 | N89B248°E | 2501 ' ' ' AUS \=—CURB |, 101655 o ars | B 2 & |
OF SAID REAL PROPERTY BY WHIP STOCK DRILLING, SLANT DRILLING OR ANY OTHER MEANS CONDUCTED il Vo089 i $9-976S Ture — S , ” alts | IEEEN : S| /17,9870 <
I ON LAND OTHER THAN SAID REAL PROPERTY, AS RESERVED BY ESTHER BERNICE BURTIS, ET AL., IN DEED 89.63NV SLY 10 PIPE 04.50F5} S~ 3t IS ok 67 CETA AL L Ul L | So0vs’36E | 12330’ M43 FD SPIKE & WASHER, STAMPED LS 5411%, PER PWFB 0816/551 SE e < 1104865 - o 18 1770075 2
3 RECORDED FEBRUARY 25, 1947 IN BOOK 24265 PAGE 210, OFFICIAL RECORDS. 89.60NV WLY 10" PIPE s 346310 Y . 95.85AIM 88.56INV LY 12" PIPE 10445k < Shaty % SIS 112201 ol
1 YN Y 10 & O474F =\, 95.651C NT BERIM oI o : 110.44FS K -S|, \f7107491C 110.55FS 17910\ || < (777 79F o
x 89.57NV Ny 10" PIPE S IIZFS | 9% 3476 10 Bg/ ULl OF crAVEL / 97.10RIM L12 | NOOVE'3E"W | 12329 =k 09.99F5 6 ENE = 47219015 s9rs o
PARCEL 3: (APN: 4139-006-061, 062, AND 063) CERrA A $499K) FeT N 95 86F5 \ / [T o 1o4ors ® s WL T34ars =
T LOTS 202, 203, 204, 205, 206 AND 207 IN BLOCK 123, SHEET 8, EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL . I 2L S = AT A T b2 s | | s qare 1973575 JUNABLE T0 0PEN  98.07Fs TS 0070 OLIIFS. 101 60FS e 104,465 e 108.15F5 109.41FS BN il ., el BTN HO 174402 5
A SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) NABLE_TO ( ~=.9490E0 94 J0F CERLT ® : A = — e L D s — = o4/ = B
106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. i N L : P e o e e JTEC 976275 9BOKG __ IBIIFS ~ SIDEWALK oo oo Bosrs 4N\ 162,185 104.445 "\ 106.06FS 1081655\ 199305110 7r) 110.061C 770,/4FS 112 76FS 74,1685 SDEWALK \ rw I u
EXCEPTING THEREFROM LOT 202 ALL MINERALS, OIL, GAS AND OTHER HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES WITHIN R/W s B &Ry \ 562 98,753 - XS 767 OW | P— { GRASS 5050 110 26FsL2X HO.05ES 171 4. “TII00s 147ITC / T
, OlL, 97,9058 ‘ . 111,128 Xi14.7171C
93,70~ II9ICE: 94.70TC | 68 B { 9790k 98 91ES 99,6865 o 102,055 R/W i EC 110.0010 x I1VT9FS 114.200C \ el =
OR UNDERLYING OR THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM SAID LAND, TOGETHER WITH THE SOLE AND EXCLUSIVE 03 7FRlL ShOFRICE " o 94.15FS | T OO (wfagie 1o 11322FS 1156/ES  “CURB T14.42FS
. X S : i <901 vat 96.94FS\IZ.791C "\ 98.741C \99.60IC ~ 100.661C/ 101.291C \[02.291C \104.231C V05.8710 N\ cupg  0Z94TC 109407 JI0TTIC 110.281C 112.61RM b o)
SCHEDULE B ITEMS RIGHT TO REMOVE THE SAME THEREFROM, AND TOGETHER ALSO WITH THE RIGHT TO INJECT, STORE, . % L et CURB CURB o & Qo 1L701C Q ©
94,4010 losors 94 49FS 96.501c] | W& 446D 97 167 96.96FS 97.29FS 98.23FS 99.11FS 1001BFS 102.051C J01.73FS 108.65FS 105.55S 107.34FS 108.71FS /109.47FS 109.86FS 110.37NV NI 12" PIEE
REMOVE AND WITHDRAW OIL AND GAS, REGARDLESS OF WHERE THE SAME IS PRODUCED, IN AND FROM 93 79 : SIS T T % . 9s3prs,  FAESl/o o LA 96.6755 g6.47¢5 SLIEIE 97 4373 100351 10740FS A0, 5750 111.67F5 - ey 12 114.02F5 R - =
ANY SUBSURFACE ZONE, FORMATION OR AREA UNDERLYING THE ABOVE DESCRIBED LAND, WITHOUT THE g = g;&%ﬁw e L) 9518655 : t : Liodlgy 96 42M ' . RH0S07FS /e, . ZIINVILY 4D A X o 5 g
BASED UPON TITLE REPORT NO. 00104439-016—NJ-DB, DATED NOVEMBER 12, 2019 AS PREPARED BY RIGHT TO GO UPON SAID LAND, OR ANY PART THEREOF, TO CARRY ON DRILLING OR OTHER OPERATION - - 10" VENT —~ Cn SV 96.10R . - ) o Q\‘ Q“) @ Q Y FD 4 PUNCHED MARKS ON MANHOLE 92.29INV WLY T4 PIPE 114 14FS ) 0
CHICAGO TITLE COMPANY. FOR THE DISCOVERY OR PRODUCTION OF OIL GAS OR OTHER HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES OR OTHER AV PER PLAN NO. E-295 = G e [e_ggs FULL OF 9058V ELYE WLY & s S HOL YS%TR ET S R s N89‘52':¥8"E 32 '\?50. $ RIM, PER PWFB 0816,/561 92 )NV ELY 14" PIRE/, <o B ¢] £ 2 o
MINERALS THEREFROM, BUT WITH THE RIGHT TO REMOVE SAID OIL, GAS, HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES AND | ~ 95845 FER AN NO, AEL 36" E - — - REET) N/ __N895248E _328. e = L J5F5L774.52FS 1148565 _@ & . g 8z
OTHER MINERALS WITHIN OR UNDERLYING OR THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM BENEATH THE SURFACE OF T50Fox X 94,6075 = ' 05 5o ok 96.0BF5 T3S = y 1 o7 1012055 ST02.62FS X 104.6375 < 106 108, 06F S/ e o8 TITOOFSE « 112 24FS% 11349FS™ 11412FS . ¢ gfap
@aggﬁwﬂ:‘g ﬁﬁofvé"';ﬁ it LGS L ST AD 2 (DL THE ABOVE DESCRIBED REAL PROPERTY BY WHIPSTOCKING DRILLING, DIRECTIONAL DRILLING OR OTHER AT e S FUETS TS M1 Ig| b5 | 3 GAS UNE PeR 95,85 o IRES et ol @ oS | P j@/— Y 0 X pse 1MIFS CP9 2l 2w, .5 £533 F
- G - ~ PLAN NO. E=295 UL OF GRAVEL Al L _ - p——Wiruh T _ 114.17FS _ . J oS g g8 £ 923
kst ekt B SRR A Al T A | SR T S i o S KE ST S S | § EFTL
) ) L . « : , 110.18FS X 111.87FS 113.16FS X 113.35F - o < ZeEFadas T gla
@AN EASEMENT FOR PRIVATE ROADWAY, RAILROAD, SIDEWALKS, POLE LINES, CONDUITS AND IN DEED FEGORDED MAY. 27. 1952 IN BOOK 36025 PACE 243, OFFICIAL RECORDS. GUTTER 94.70FS 95 3pFs ONAL T o & & el 105.301C HO90FS| - ! R T 5§g&% 2E£3%
INCIDENTAL PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGES 106 AND 107 OF MAPS. (PLOTTED HEREON) : ' LI ? LD , 95 1775l o6 [ FULL OF GRAVEL RN (accEss) S N 196455 \ igsurs[O00L cre | 109s0rc  109kirs 111.89FS ‘ J 2 ESEEZ cio%
PARCEL 4: (APN: 4139-008-010) SiSIE 94‘-50% 571C N 96.221C 96.501C CURB 95.9076) 977310 AL 9g301c 953310 100.087C | 101.80T¢ 1035310 103, 72ESf /%7@ JOB71C | 052 /%770-0370 e P”ﬁm 117.56FS | e / CURB ool O
(9) AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED MAY 22, 1950; RECORDNG NO. 2171 OFFICAL LOTS 226 AND 227 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS : kg ' S LSS L0 AT P DR — j =5 (ACCES?MS e ANWFS gL X iRt TSI T Z
’ ' - 98003 10 TF , TT5 4075 116,697
RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, / R/W 2 & sprwaix 95.17FS [ o SDEWAK YO A\, oSt 98567 oo ot on s | G SowK ] @B T\ 5 arsd a1/ B ¢ e A s L Ve i14.108 175 dors SUEWALK, jr7559r< a
z X 001 2F ] G ] o = .
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED NOVEMBER 23, 1956; RECORDED IN BOOK IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. 95 53rS Z 22z 5/50F5 ) ' —— : Sl /106 0475 ’—' 19.47¢S . Lty TS 277 G % .
(e SO S ARl o) PARCEL 5: (APN: 4139-008-011, 012, 018, 046) ; $IIES 8] WATER LNE FER OPENING 012975 | =, = TS e | Todacsy e B i 23 17635 52 2 2524
@ LOT 228, 229 AND 265, 266, 267 AND 268 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, 193, : 0r25red 102205\ 105 aarSG0TG IS *106.5265 “T10.25S 1160455 THATBIC o B80S - €558
AN EASEMENT FOR PRIVATE ROADWAYS, POLE LINES, RAILROAD CONDUITS AND INCIDENTAL K <95 235 o 25E5R 07 7 i 10175 110216 N1 66F: W 625 s
e I S T D e COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106, OF NN 101221 4 PARKING STALLS 104 226 108925 1094455 PAD 114 I5r i R DI TC A 116.50NG Z > 523
' - ) MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. S5 Jod 107 1003wV £ PPEAL gim‘mw Nz PIPE CP127)0 e : R 14 26NN i aes A1546F . 116.59FS 116 6ore : O3:k
' ) s 96.32FS : ® 5 S NCP109 $ 109, 71FS, | 110.24FS W Tin581C AN o w s <
AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES AND PUBLIC UTILITIES PURPOSES; RECORDED MAY 4, 1926; PARCEL 6: (APN: 4133-008-047) S LOT 226 205 A 1 W& A\ Cige 155 & 108805 104107 X P\ 097583« g0 o7es (R 120906 ENSTHG BULDING = €5 3
RECORDED IN BOOK 5632 PAGE 325 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) PARCEL 6A: LOT 213 7 1 S - [ 05050 LOT 268 N 109617C 309, 45F9 TIEN oSl g ores I N212FS— A 122805 @ > :5
: 96,4815 i 709 36F o T10°08KS K0.21F5 L2106 » 3
LOT 262, 263, 264 OF BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS 96.08FS 95 451 —006- jog o> i b C 716, 04NG W 717.16FS 117 74F 0 W 7ge
@ THE RIGHT TO LAY, CONSTRUCT, MAINTAIN, OPERATE, REPAIR, RENEW, CHANGE THE SIZE OF, AND ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS 26,097 i 492 42ES 9 ids 72f5A'P'N' 4139 OO%M%?ZOZ - 108.42FS x 11841 % 116.93F5 116 60FS Fam ﬁ 3 Q S 588
REMOVE A PIPE LINE FOR TRANSPORTATION OF OIL, PETROLEUM, GAS, GASOLINE, WATER OR OTHER ' ' ' ' AL 96,055 2 - x105.09s / 108, x 109, 41FS [~y 0% < 109.94F5 - 10997F e 116,995 mir POR LOT 281 j u €255
SUBSTANCES OVER SAID LAND; AS SHOWN ON MAP OF TRACT 2028 RECORDED IN BOOK 35 PAGE N THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. s T S s 5 961NV WLY 24/ PIPE & A 1 ! T @S58
' , G224 < 103.31F} 9 Ly o8 $ a7y | % Hees | 118555 AP.N. 4139-008-019 | © D -5t
37 OF MAPS AND SAID LOT 202, RECORDED IN BOOK 15938 PAGE 176 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED R N 6. S48l 195.69FS [ (g™ S IGYINV NLY 24" PIPE (0200 |, k= cuRrB 2 Y765 A0 z S|nsés
HEREON — NO WOTH GVEN) . ANGELES FOR ROAD AND HIGHWAY PURPOSES BY DEED RECORDED IN BOOK 6017 PAGE 93, OF DEEDS. unaBLE 10 oPEN™N][CB 7R S 3 2 §" comm (re) oovers| fe & 109.86F5. 109955 | 117.86FS = 7 z Nsee
S 96.10RM £99.5 X LANDING { 109.807C|| IS = 09855 - « 116.87FS ) At
PARCEL 6B: sz wiy & st~ o " [ § 1274110P 108, 56FS ] 08-73ES — 10650 5-OXB) 108,965 0ot [ Vr188ic Jog sor 1 20 > 16961 | 118 I s osrs o -
AN EASEMENT FOR POLE LINES AND CONDUITS PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 21122 PAGE 8 LOT 230, BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO TRACT, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, 48" PIPE. 5 | x 103.47FS 72[;19/5)%% 170.03NG 09511, 88108 35FS COLUMN (Tﬁﬂ 1118610 N 709.97r8] k\l |776,57F5 118.275S x | 118.67FS m c
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON — NO WIDTH GIVEN) STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE et —\@ i\ 99.49FS 3 o (770,505 5475 e e S~ NS e & 1 V8525 & A
OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. ol 96.917C ¥.97.71Fs < 10383FS 105 64FS s EATING UFERR LINDNG g™ X N >
@AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED DECEMBER 24, 1953; RECORDING IN BOOK 7N K ¢ % G6FS 108 7000 TGS SYSTEM e 1098357 T, 5L 11006851 5 el 26 y o FOR AND ON BEHALF OF
43469 PAGE 98 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON — NO WIDTH GIVEN) PARCEL 6C: I e N -3 0311FS T09MEFS — 09 93FS 08 9ES a0 PA8OFS_g—rrina4rs e I 19,1505 NG CATE o WARE MALCOMB CVIL ENGINEERING
PARCEL 1 OF PARCEL MAP NO. 7197, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF 2 INNEE P4ET, S 5 10240LD L Ll 1098379 o\|N 0/ 11080FS" 770 2gF S Y c1860r | ngigre . N0 3
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 10, 1954; RECORDING NO. 2201, CALIFORNIA, AS FILED IN BOOK 110, PAGES 96 AND 97 OF PARCEL MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY T s=ll Ngg5gre | 97.62t5 N F%L OF DIRY LANDING 109,50RS Q4197050575 EA MI0.176S__110.25FS A [ - } 119 4dps > 119.43FS %
IN BOOK 45277 PAGE 179 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. OB S | S22 o e 102.72FS 10a s 110 DmeY =S 119.5710P GAS TANK S T ||} Herfedecleded £c| SE 1_| 176 666 : N K
—_—— — —/ —/— Q=T dseee man B ' Z W <103.11FS 10045_) ] 110.32S 110,345 110.24K8 TT082r5 177 2 x119.12FS i B g
(19) AN EASEMENT FOR RIGHT OF WAY FOR A PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 10, 1954; 97.27F51° G T I 8" WATER LINE PER L i — f 5 ; | IOSZES 170.82F5 SEWER LINE_ PER z
g ! ! < i -t 102. 35F S\ )102.42FS 110.235FSE=4X110.59F S 1104558 110.44F 10.20FS 7 == =0 120 -
RECORDING NO: 2204, IN BOOK 45277 PAGE 250 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) BASIS OF BEARINGS AR NCA L PLAN NO. E-295 PARCEL 4 " o [T 103.95( 110.28FS i TS i 79A§ - ,.LLOEV SHNGNY TS | i 7
(20) AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED OCTOBER 1, 1954; RECORDING NO. 3341, IN e S e » 101,255 (PER TITLE REFORT) 104,085 whs X B n0rsTG, CLN (TF) TR oy | s o o 5 LLI
BOOK 45734 PAGE 407 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) R THE BEARINGS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED UPON THE CENTERLINE OF KANSAS STREET, BEING S00'06'36"E 977175} W |92.681C - e A.P.N. 4139-006-010 102, 76FS o 10 © ol 110K 050 0 1086557, 2 7] @'ﬂ A LS.92TC 120.65FS x %)
: PER TRACT MAP NO. 53175, FILED IN BOOK 1278 PAGES 10 AND 11 OF TRACT MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF 97.91F5 - r |IES R 8% RIS R\ | B 067 = IRON FENCE N >
, , THE COUNTY RECORDER OF LOS ANGELES COUNTY. 97 00r3] | 3o ol .pJ oo B 1848 3 =8 - PAD Al ] u
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED OCTOBER 4, 1955; RECORDING NO. 3605, : 97.287¢ S 10405574, S S _5:1 | 21 = m
IN BOOK 49137 PAGE 281 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) BENCHMARK s Vo  ovsd Y o . 776 8r 2
: ! - 104.07F5/ 4089 xR / 110.46F5 i gy : J 121.35FS x m
(29 AN EASEMENT FOR ROAD AND PUBLIC UTILITY PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 6045 PAGE 130 98BIIFST ACBIN 7R ARG/ U N e 3 %\&-% @[J\l/;g% ks ®121.1F5" - LOT 282 2 -
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) LOT 212 Bl AW (7541 4 iy == AL 12N7) s S ] & o 170.84F5| 110.82F3 110,985 120 derd | 121475 R
ELEVATIONS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED UPON LOS ANGELES COUNTY BENCHMARK NO. 8Y11740, Sl e S SEIN < S S 710455 110.47F5 110.50FS g I CP11 A.P.N. 4139-008-020 7 (D
@AN EASEMENT FOR SANITARY SEWERS PURPOSES; RECORDED DECEMBER 5, 1939 IN BOOK 17121 ELEVATION 165.09 FEET (NAVD 88). TR ¥ 8 1359 AR 121.54C | 1 4&’27'5” > K121.67FS &
PAGE 74 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) e S \eeak S LOT 227 ;%’-Qﬁ‘/ﬁ 095 | S , 121.56FS 121.71FS >
DESCRIPTION: 9876k S, [ 9B.00L — 10222V A | CONCRETE —={l2- " |//1%27 121 44NGZAN 2 e ° LLI (p) >
AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 37937 PAGE 330 OFFICIAL RECORDS. L&DPW BM TAG IN S CB 600MM (2FT) E/0 BCR @ SE COR ROSECRANS AV & OAK AV S &5 SCREEN WALL 10e90 A 43 OGWALL S LOT 267 %i ] \j 120/65FS |59 3 | < To)
P —— S ) Z
(PLOTTED HEREON) SO R 77 § 101.60NG EXISTING BUILDING 0.2 4 S opotere = OIS | 110,497 |2 D Bolfris | ~ SLONG GATE A — N = X
() AN EASEMENT FOR RIGHT OF WAY AND PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 10, 1954; LEGEND L [ & e wALL e - I [Nizasbic 191.86F5 121.7788% * [iz2207Fs il o Z AN
RECORDING NO. 2202 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) fePYYS 1 /;/ 19.771C - ) == o6 A p{20etfs | 4 | LZZO0RM ! r— o D o
APN — ASSESSOR'S PARCEL NUMBER = GAS METER + 169,165 1 107 821C 3" ROOF DRAIN .3 107 S IS 1. rob7 4. IG5V SEFS L AIPE L I— W O
(28(35) AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 38318 PAGE 303 OFFICIAL RECORDS. & e 03 N SR | & 122.13Fs 11391V NLY 8 PIPE < @)
BFV BACK-FLOW VALVE (@) GAS VALVE ) / & AR GROUND =5=3,70.00FS isors <. 121.92F5 Y w >
(PLOTTED HEREON) B TR 000075~ 1056075 70 104055 705 557 5 T0760F, 00 0TS EE o 1) 102265 = — — L yers R O @) <
BIM  BOTIOM OF STRUCTURE TN GATE —— — — — — — A — Pomr T T T S T s, e el | S e — T — — — — — — —uowm el <1 QO <
AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED FEBRUARY 18, 1925 IN BOOK 4824 PAGE 218 BD6  BULDNG o - 100.43F5, L e — ——— A\Egm X UL A st 05 s R T '5 121.2910 - - @)
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) 100.55FS 1 s 10042 P L1775 10230FS | 705506 | \fOAGFS 109585 \ 1073075 hERn = | OROUND ~ S " N L 3 Z D) o -
CAB CABINET — < CUY WIRE 100.00FS R CURB 07121 108707¢) | 1042FS o Bt S A I 121,565 * 1220055 % O uw O
@AN EASEMENT FOR ROAD AND PUBLIC UTILITY PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 6045 PAGE 130 AR T L ANDICAP 100.85FS ~ 5 TOMZES 15 PARKING STALLS 106.76F5 108 32FS 1087306, [P slibe 07Fs RS _— kl\ : o < =
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) . C 101.02F3 g 1097710 ") RigaanG, 107 74Ekl ) < |mm——p 7 COLUMN (TYF) 121.92NGAG” | : z o - < 0O
c8 CATCH BASIN ©) IRRIGATION CONTROL VALVE Ly 074N | | | 7 S VA S S S B 0§ UG Akl e | o o | LL F
AN EASEMENT SANITARY SEWERS PURPOSES; RECORDED DECEMBER 5, 1939; RECORDED IN BOOK ¢ CENTERLUNE = LADDER W. 086, & & O O © & F S o 0 . ol 12 dsic : 2 Z o Z
17004 PAGE 383 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) - & 9¥ o o @ & & & & & F & S 10959 A N T L221INCA ©  P721.06FS g . D @) 0D
CONC  CONCRETE 1t LIGHT STANDARD ~= Tl NS Y X ¢ ¢  Ow e o S or iy 14 s 122,045 LOT 283 z Z @)
AN EASEMENT FOR POLES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 32277 PAGE 303 OFFICIAL RECORDS. = = ' & Q B\ S 105.85NV 6” PIPE " % 108.59Fs, S W=« 102 35INV NLY 147 PIPE 3 AVitF S a (D
@ (PLOTIED HEREON) co COOLING SYSTEM N ! LIGHT STANDARD o NGLOZE (py Sl oE ® of s 105.26FS 107,695, PARCEL 5709.55@ 109615 | R | pssert 0. 4h ¥ 100 27NV SWLY 14” PIPE lSX 122.35FS > d @) < LLl Y
0 DIAMETER OF EXISTING TREE s PALM TREE : Gy x102278 <P : 105. 7363 {PER TITLE REPORT) ; 103055 192 3on A | w L
LOT 2 <H01.56E5 S ® 10.092 X 106.66PS 5] | |EPBN 107.91FS 10,8570 o CONCRETE WALL ——{}.., [0 122 3NGIA & | £ D_ — W
(G AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES, FOR TRANSPORTATION OF GAS PURPOSES; RECORDED N BOOK o DRAIN INLET ® WONITORING WELL 11 J52 0 g LOT 228 o P oy < 105.86FS  x 109.58FS - . 09315 1090065, (S | S| J 121.68F 57 < 122.20F5 ILGES 5 T v w AN
38223 PAGE 262 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) oW DRIVEWAY N e 3| torazs < 2 Losade /A.P.N. 4139-006-011 o, HF;X N N 1y 1 CP104 00t s T ans L bioors 1220062 | 4 |l 107 g7 | 2 : 30 o I
(36) AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 38372 PAGE 433 OFFICIAL RECORDS. EBR ELECTRIC BREAKER —2— POWER POLE W/TRANSFORMER § 0 102.58FS S5 s8Te 106.8010 g7 3136107 9800 /L ;gj;fm E’MMETAZ/% 07)2(75 A T 7] %& /0%95?? s 1.251C LOT 266 B 121.30F3 = 17264 122 7565 § ( l ) I F — LU
(PLOTTED HEREOK) £ ELECTRIC CABINET === POWER POLE W/LIGHT o > 1% oS Tasorse 106 11Fr RIS TY @-— P8 rogieny sty g \ i K00 oRr 150 [’7773'227956 A.P.N. 4139—-006—-046 > ] : - 8 7
- » 2 . 5 i g / v 7 vy g WACA / J2.N. — —
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED MARCH 27, 1957 IN BOOK 54046 PAGE EM ELECTRIC METER © SEWER CLEAN OUT 1029964 F B2 0L =&k |ag2 AN nssore 19 o rg B TOFS" AP _ S agic] 770.0?55?3 /70.257/72[7R 2110.65FS CHAIN LINK FENCE H ¥ | 122.6685 12.66FS 3
S S5 \ = = £ 4 7 oLC 11 r 10:91F 5 1£2.0
362 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) P ELECTRIC PANEL ® SEWER MANHOLE CURE &§ N @ 52 10955 105.12FS 05,7 s 7045;/@0 nosie) e O = 10875 TISES | S WIS 7473 2 ~ GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
GUTTER = S e 108.92FS : [09.50ES / 4 i ° . } o . 122.91F5
AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED JULY 20, 1976; RECORDING NO. 1328 IN BOOK EPB ELECTRIC PULL BOX oo o SIGN 103608 1% | < mll; e B0 05FS P 107.87¢5, g s FULL GF DT e 08010 e 110850 — 0905 12266741 ) | IZ1Ks 75;5’ f « < DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
5978 PAGE 372 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) EV ELECTRIC VAULT Imin STAIRS SHOWING DOWNWARD DIRECT 103,720 Prosll < 106,535 ' ol Il noire 5 B N l=ge— | S| N 2 - 266 KANSAS STREET,
- = it R e / N kls k< S T10. 45170 - - - - — — 123 09NG. PS IV, - — T
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED MARCH 5, 1965; RECORDING NO. 3890 GEN GENERATOR ®) STORM DRAIN MANHOLE s\ © g0 (JO6-90FS 109 93RIM_ 109.855 , 770,386 /10,6475 OIS 0Ty | oo TR R 109.85NV 118.72FS >| | I .! = I— EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) fF FINISH FLOOR O STREET LIGHT a0l | e i : 105.25NV NLY 6° PIPE"107 48FS 1101200 110.31LID, FULL OF pipr 110.601C ? / 7/1%7 0566 U SR . DOOR VENT AREA <4+ @@ 127 80FS 2 .
Fs FINISH SURFACE 104.27F3% S|k X103 8BES g% 105170V ELY 8" PIPE 104290V FULL OF DIRT 1109485/ N027F L JLﬁ 0.20F3 , EBR, 122,970 | ([ 122.74F5x 122.90FS b _I
AN EASEMENT FOR CONDUITS PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 12, 1980; RECORDING NO. 80-772356 @ TELECOM MANHOLE 104 215 F Z 403708 104~ S _ 105.03NV SLY 8" PIPE 109,245, « 109.56rs % 110.50FS 110.96FS == ] | LOT 265 11903FS7A4. @ 121 84FS &
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) fL FLOW LINE S0  RAFFIC LIGHT & i | | I 7 SYORBES_gp 10775 107985 10825 1 OT] 229 1 sgrcll ES Heahl” / e £ ¢s || GASCg/zACﬁZmVI/GS{L 7 Uolnzz dord z :
2 T S o o WANIFOL = 1219273 | i <
@AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 7, 1997; RECORDING NO. 97-1213678 e G ATy <3 TREE. (TYPICAL) s I } | a1l A.P.N. 4139-006—-012 15> 16850/ i < [~ COLUMN (TYP) 122.87N6 )¢ 4— CURB | I R x
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) % GRADE BREAK — TRUNCATED DOME 1050575 e 1k 047285 l2C | § 0B AR *109.05FS g “n.ows AKX WLD] I wars 110,065 i ;;g igg ggto%NG o 20621 B 121675 71 N
100.001 X TR %% (% : e e I M < M1.89FS N W7 e 20 170 80FS 0 84rc . 10F 110.50FS — , % 722. 121 x /122.89FS >
HCR HANDICAP RAMP SN0 7410 < IR 111.57INV 115.50FS 110.80F5 110.64f S| x 18 00Fs] 1182 r 110.53FF 5. 56F 122.98(S x 2400 2
(46) AN EASEMENT FOR WATER LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 17, 1955; RECORDING NO. 3073, IN ° vy POLE 29 Hosom ML I e I Fe 15055 conciire —| | 0567l 6 P o je s it josyr| o 1850 T | 22053 | 122,44 S5 5C0 E
BOOK 48685 PAGE 69 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) v INVERT gy WATER FAUCET [OT 210 | S o s - <109.36FS 109 4565 np e 2 §IHEBSFS 113,085 \ EE 1) | B3| | 75 L ; : %2 Niizaie LOT 284 -
NG NATURAL GROUND B WATER METER 2 ossfe || R ' g A o 114 1155 H 1156005 8| | Niologrs | g TR & T e o PALRWAY 7 22 122.99FS o
@AN EASEMENT RECORDED IN PARCEL MAP 7197 IN BOOK 110 PAGES 96 AND 97 OF PARCEL MAPS. 105.92FS ek RI0BSFS S | i S ACP1O7 x 8 N 115 4IRSl T 110 69 L1078 e Lt olts 95 7070 71 8 122855 P
(PLOTTED HEREON) P PROPERTY LINE ® WATER VALVE et SN uagsIc I < l] HO—770.09F5 H1.40FS, S/ g 112645 HEF"115.57F5\ D , N NITAES %Ogggs\ AN igeirg 1197575 [ 205675\ 121.05FS IR W55 120.71F8 v
SSMH  SAMITARY SEWER MANHOLE BLOCK WALL a0 | ‘@ | Bk 111,200 , - 114.61FS % K 680 776.96F% P14 176775 LOADING DOCK /SCREEN WALL £ (121,055 55‘3’% L/ | 22z | I 121.80FS ] 22.74F% EXISTING BUILDING 4
AN EASEMENT FOR PRIVATE ROADWAYS AND TO LAY WATER AND GAS PIPES, SEWERS, POLE AND o SEWER CLEAN OUT N 2 |06 Y- | /s [ ETAMNe WAL | [98.85WNTY & STy «11582FS  METAL PLATES R L : Ny 7 e 2 iy 877 591 80Fs 192 79FS o)
CONDUITS LINES, SIDEWALKS, CURBS, GUTTERS AND RAILROAD PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 22 D = Sl N |] = 555 | | 98BNV NLY & SLY 112195 11350FS, 1145765, ¥ (IRENC/? I <045/ : o < MBIZES X TIBSFS  [i1999rs  x1{9.61FS "o 121,965 % v Mo 122, 2010 | 127.80F5 s
PAGES 106 AND 107 OF MAPS. (PLOTTED HEREON) SOMH  STORM DRAIN MANHOLE  CaNoPY / 51 Y LR R G B 2N 0 e 478 J14 15 61557 156875 A= S o 2 & 120 705, 2050 KIS 7755;7%3% 21715 1y S0 Y 127755 x @
106.97F5 i A S © ® \ 1655, 115.65E3 SLUDF ! ® : [ y22. N X x 122 172.86FS T [
(5O) AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 6254 PAGE 39 OFFICIAL RECORDS. R/W  RIGHT OF WAY — CENTERLINE A o645 ; | ’i oA S | WA e 7S 5655 | CP106_~ Ji7srs ) Jigiers 1i8.66F | 119.09FS 170 ppfs goss ot 0 A é Lﬁ%ﬁ;& X 27 294l L <
— M « N } = I =—x711. & x . . ) 7% X W 1 I = —Z [22. ‘ 4 laz i : A 17.39IN
(PLOTTED HEREON) TCAB  TELCO CABINET CHAIN LINK FENCE 25 25 2 s e 112.09FS N T15.785 114 89 PUMPNGN 25030 = [Peseem Wizazes o 8S t 720.44F3] T R ) T 20805220003 123 1665 WA S 122,865 > i
, 1PB TELCO PULL BOX CONCRETE/RETAINING WALL o7l | S ~ > I i Sl ST 116,355, HANDRAIL CcoLumw (TvP) 122245 150975 | —gp173 " ) 577 122 26RM z
AN EASEMENT FOR POLES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 32317 PAGE 243 OFFICIAL RECORDS. x g o — eSS = s |22 B — Y 122 11Fs 121,766 162, T
(PLOTTED HEREON) v meowr o ———mm - anpslingl s i % “ZTFS XI22%5 & AT W = T 12088 5 x oy < 120.91FS +x,120.86FS 12203 S|122.25FS g —~ 10286581 ¥ 122.46RM o &
8 (. | S ' ' 126853 T CONCRETE WAL — ' 130.91F5 120.90F5 e ) & ST20BIES |20 9TFSI22.24E5 S 1225578 ' 07
c TOP OF CURB EDGE OF PAVEMENT S bog.osic ¥ = 116.57FS | 20 56F ra0.41F> METAL RACK 190/ 94Fs 7 i 125 20A = 115.86INV &)
@AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 38690 PAGE 364 OFFICIAL RECORDS. 05 0P OF SLOPE & 1076959 | Joasars o o N S | 1aup 114.98TC 116.61FS Ml 115.71FS 115 94;5/& W‘ﬁ AV i IZLO6ES” 11 16rsle <+ | B2 I o m
(PLOTTED HEREON) ——— 108.5265 H107 750 | (B S x 112, 70FS : o J1390FS CORB ~{  7174.57FS\J116.65FS #15.71F3 [12.7IFR) | 12098558 120.96ES 120.96FS 120,985 (T AN e (2253 | 121.90F /éj 57?;714 !
™w TOP OF WALL GAS LINE el 108" | 10° & 2 3120 g | /‘QJ\ / ] 277 = A} [ 7y ASC0” § W THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED HEREIN
@AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED FEBRUARY 27, 1953 IN BOOK 41081 PAGE 329 N : =1 s 3 = 115.765F5] (1715665 tilvi/ vk BFV 12097¢5] T LANDING (127 ] =G4S L/NER‘E © I @ ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA, LLP AND MAY NOT
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) " TRANSFORMER I A Z amai—- 1 El i x ngrEs TNV TGN /) T09FS 120965 136,16 \ 5117 veLisel 2 i i e 123.021C 5 BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN PERMISSION
: = | K x X x N 7 L / 91 1 T \ Ll o 121. . 84F.
TYPICAL — — — ——  INTERIOR LOT LINE = JE HIIJFS x HAOBFS s SR &41B 15 TS e | \120.96FS 727 26F5 02 075 A 122845 ° -
U ¥ | /s o L INDRALS 12289FS Ip2.10FS 12297102 || 5 SUBMIT
WATER METER _—— — — MONUMENT LINE N | 709, | | S I] 114.96TC 5 LOT 264 1212665 | = | 722_755‘:' . POR LOT 285 3 — TAL:
_ SIS 114.48F9) . ./ ¥ 122.91F5 w <
ASPHALT PAVEMENT OL LINE PER RECORD 09airs) | Paesk [ x 113.50FS 2 2% = Q A— l : | A.P.N. 4139-008-022 O
, 09.07FS 113 J3FS & ey 118 725 121, 20FF | q A.F.N. 7
UTILITY STATEMENT RN ~ wasais) |k bioa ages | A e : A g | 122951C . ENTITLEMENT SET
BACK-FLOW VALVE OVERHANG s | o e o s D ez | T 72 08 722,659 e N BT
CAR STOP OVERHEAD LINE N 709.2760% =Dl | § :|] s DS \\\ - \21.09FS CONCRETE WALL |, Hl g . ) 122 57NG < -
BURIED UTILITIES AND/OR PIPELINES SHOWN HEREON ARE PER VISIBLE AND APPARENT SURFACE EVIDENCE, = A/ @ 774 114.06FS ae rack TV ' 121.52F5 ' @ JOB
RECORD DRAWINGS OF THE CONSTRUCTED UTILTY LINES OBTAINED FROM RELIABLE AND RESPONSIBLE SOURCES CONCRETE PAVEMENT - - = FROPERTY LINE - N 2 OV 107 PIPE L 115.381C (AL | PARCEL 6A ziosi) o}, | - 12 8 [—~-—-POP out 3 O 202=R-033
NOT CONNECTED WITH CALVADA SURVEYING, INC. OR MARKINGS PROVIDED BY AN INDEPENDENT LOCATING CONTROL POINT RIGHT-OF-WAY N AN 1, “Olss [  114.20F5 174.90F] x 0 PARCEL 6B 6 ziorsd s i 1215565 N Hae
CONTRACTOR. NO GUARANTEE OR WARRANTY, ETHER EXPRESSED OR IMPLIED, IS MADE AS TO THE ACCURACY OR | 12,087 I > “TEFIFS Q© PER TITLE REPORT 157 2810P N N | <121 ) DAT
THOROUGHNESS OF SUCH INFORMATION. IF MORE ACCURATE LOCATIONS OF UNDERGROUND UTILITES OR PIPE DECORATIVE: BRICK SANITARY  SEWER LINE E N S| 7'37? 704 < . 9 (PER TITLE REPORT) | A(PEI-V 417.73-'5-0,(5)6€04)7 EERY 7 Nﬁgl | ky21.96FS % 7 s al 09.02.2025
UNES ARE REQUIRED, THE UTILTY OR PIPELINE WILL HAVE TO BE VERIFIED BY FIELD POTHOLING. CALVADA DOOR SAMITARY SEWER LINE PER RECORD | I3 112,15 NESA A 1o 11468, E| q4 <K = e KA \ | il Vi " Ve
SURVEYING, INC. AND THE SURVEYOR OF RECORD SHALL NOT BE HELD LIABLE FOR THE LOCATION OF OR THE EECTRIC MANHOLE STORM DRAIV LIVE T 17400 L1215, ¥ 3 x 114,535 T av a5k 50 | | ke z ” REVISIONS.
FAILURE TO NOTE THE LOCATION OF NON-VISIBLE UTILITIES OR PIPELINES. A S I I — = SRl s v
ELECTRIC OUTLET STORM DRAI UINE PER RECORD. | "2 N [ 115.841C % LOT 230 121.19FS a2 2 ars~ 122.00FS W <
FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTION  —— . TOE ——  TOF OF SLOPE m S\ ke . \ | e < 114845 XSS ol 115.57F5 o ?._ | B v odEs \ B E =
FIRE HYORANT s TPORaE g (O/* i {( 5 [ 0 w4 1% 4’! 6‘-T 190" 122.121C — o o
; [ e =" | : : 12221 =
¢/~ Underground Service Alert \ FLAG POST —— — — W(R) ———  WATER LINE RECORD N . b e, 2| Vusgerc 11575 118175 x 0 B 1A <. h22isn I 50 x
1 S 4l . AR . | c
FLOW DRECTION WROUGHT IRON FENCE S 77:7606;5 [N £ 20rs 11295 &l b e o] PP 5 | orors A 4 1| e | 8
5 15.10F S 1otk 5 N 15.10FSx ! L 121.10FS A x B
Call: TOLL FREE FOUND MONUMENT AS NOTED SINFEb i o 115 435S 1150 = < o 5 151 = © 197 3530 e 8
1-800 | ey | NN m{f 15.72FS . LR~ | 121000074, [Nk o (N 12082FSX. ¥ Z
= o ||| 1155310\ 12 2 1205V =5 | & i o curs — <
227-2600 CONTROL POINTS —O |Sidata By < | 1085w 121246574+ KR« K WEZE ™ s : £
CURB & laj‘ & N x775.94%_5 x [15.61FS x775 71FS {:} — ?D 115.16INV SEZ/V 6” PIPE ~_ Eiol = ﬁ” 7272776 D/ 7204]F5 W / 120.95FS he
TWO WORKING DAYS GUTIER :;I ™ e SE— coLUMN (TYP) 115 14NV NLY 8” PIPE ~ S § A 120131D 4% WM 120.56TC w
BEFORE YOU DIG ) CP# | NORTHING | EASTING | ELEVATION DESCRIPTION 116.24FS|; 116 116.22IC|l = A ' 116.76TC < e " 121200 L7 <[ S 119.22INV 120,255 )
. 15585 T () N x 115.81FS © 116.26F2) W PARCEL 6C ROLLING DOOR 2 2079 120.80FS e LOT 286 L
CP1 11940.39° | 871917 95.14’ FD SPIKE & WASHER (M1) 1178315 B I sant I - E g oo 75.94F5 A EXISTING BULDING | AL 12095054 . N jises o
P~ 1770265 | ||| harf| SR CURB & N CURB ——|| ( CAR-CHARGER (PER TITLE REPORT) | |} g | - 7!;% =
PREPARED UNDER MY SUPERVISION: CP97 | 11940.61" | 9049.77' 112.80° | FS MAGNETIC WASHER STAMPED "LS 5411” M | - <N curmer R : : : : A1 S oot 1207 1209075 | 19515 "
s o 116025 x 118.92F5 o3 oty 0 10 20 40 (21177 S 212074 9 119.34ES  EXISTING BUILDING
CP104 | 1174273 | 8874.67' 110.16" | FS MAGNETIC SHINER PSOMAS 116451 o e lIB0HE AN N 16195 $. ' H | LI | { 120.24FS 120.29F S ©
AN 5 7 2 g%g “@-“ NN Szl | I LOT 263 1211255, % H1oB#19.99FS e J 1189771 )
CP106 | 11658.71 8902.20’ 120.82' SET MAGNETIC NAIL 3 T IR S [ x 116.25FS " 16.655, gl QS 12012TC 120 30FS 119,94 119.60FS Z B PA/PM:
’ ’ ' N X 117.71FS I:l Azl Y S BT IO 40 purt 16,2675 \\ "716.595 | NOT TO SCALE o A /20’ |sqliiegers S, o = 19645 8 / PM:
CP107 | 11678.52 8790.35 110.44 SET MAGNETIC NAIL N 116 barstl Wk 177 70ks 117-67FS ||| nzens| B <l Apssers [l1e 42 N zome N PARCEL 1 ORIGINAL GRAPHIC SCALE or A AT 119.95F5 //g'gjfwwﬂm %iﬁ,ﬁ% P S | DRAWN BY:
- : - 117581 ~ [“7760esi | E SI& : 116.61FS, 71N o , v S = | ' ' : 117.28f1 5 '
L.S. 7780 CP109 | 11896.17 8915.22 105.20 SET MAGNETIC NAIL N 3| 1 : N Y775 8 PARCEL MAP NO. 7197 | %785% | mmj 2611 T
117.591C - N GRASS X77652F5 = . 3 % % 2 Y S
CP111 | 11675.81 8921.61 117.88 SET MAGNETIC NAIL NG 117.461C M633FL  116.72FS W}g = .= PMB. 110/96-97 I— —_———— — — — — — — —/ —/ —/ — =T -h—,w% — AT I i AP Q
© 177.90IC  \116.41FS : e - 1.03F5 7% ' LR d10.065 2 .
CP112 | 11660.64’ 9021.93’ 122.24’ SET 60D N (G669 | & (46)|| Sk iZesr lssire % 116.67FS nzi8icq [N 71797 12L17FS 2L As- M 1.0l L T e )”*~BLOCK WALL a SHEET TITLE:
N & |\ uzgers|ey 11767FK 1163601 5 777.77FSH\ Y755 o o i Il/ ' /e z
CP13 | 11656.34' | 9035.05 122.200 | FS MAGNETIC SHINER PSOMAS N / prors] & N IZEEST R A 77 055 | L I ooz e i ®
) 4 . S | |77e#sT - 17 NN SJE <l B ' )
/ CP114 | 11813.47 | 9065.55' 121.53" SET CONCRETE NAIL ’8‘@ Wt g ! 3 T A S I ( 117.16FS byt HANDRALLS 1210575 R s A 11585 z SU RVEY
Armando-D. DuPont - : - I [7ea [ Erit S s ' A AN I 121.00F) A SIS [ L diggmes™ g — [p01H 116.05FS 2
Registration No. 7780 CP115 | 11577.39 9016.94 121.15 SET SCRIBED X \ SEE SHEET 5 / %
in the State of California : : . o]
CP127 | 11899.26 8948.96 107.40 SET CONCRETE NAIL o
@0
I
'_
SHEET
NU,

9/9/2025 10:05:07 AM



5 " n
CAUTION: IF THIS SHEET IS NOT 30"x42" IT IS A REDUCED PRINT
¥
S a8
: 2 §
>-
Z
VICINITY MAP LEGAL DESCRIPTION <
w — 3573 HAYDEN
| | | | | | | | o) 8 AVENUE
THE LAND REFERRED TO HEREIN BELOW IS SITUATED IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE COUNTY OF g O o
LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AND IS DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS: i — CULVER CITY
E MAPLE AVE = = )
& PARCEL 1: (APN: 4139-006-056, 064) o § CA 90232
o THE EASTERLY 66 FEET OF LOT 179 AND ALL OF LOT 208 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY = = =
E OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN ) ) 4 4 S .J “E’ 310:399.7975
& BOOK 22 PAGE 106, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. s
E MARIPOSA AVE WASHINGTON ST EXCEPT THE NORTH 30 FEET OF SAID LOT 208 CONVEYED TO THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES FOR PUBLIC S < £
\ 5 ROAD AND HIGHWAY PURPOSES. - -y -y y o S
E PINE AVE 1 PN = E .
[ SEGUNDO AVE = PARCEL 2: (APN: 4139-006—057) 5 s
PARKS &  /CALIFORNIA ST = LOT 180 ON BLOCK 123 OF THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF 2 «
RECREATIO CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF x c
S THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. o m o
- 3 EXCEPTING ALL MINERALS, OIL GAS AND OTHER HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES WITHIN OR UNDERLYING OR r a
: § EGRAND AVE |2 = THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM THE HEREIN ABOVE DESCRIBED REAL PROPERTY TOGETHER WITH THE SOLE / SEE SHEET 4 \ po
e = hld AND EXCLUSIVE RIGHT TO REMOVE SAME, PROVIDED, HOWEVER, THAT THE GRANTOR HEREIN, ITS W ” T 1 T R Y - S s Q
- & 2 SUCCESSORS OR ASSIGNS SHALL NOT AND DO NOT HAVE THE RIGHT TO GO UPON THE REAL PROPERTY, 2 o sl Vori7rs  Ausssrd @ G HOES NN ; 2 1779.8575 Q o
E FRANKLIN AVE = E = OR ANY PART THEREOF, TO CARRY ON DRILLNG OR OTHER OPERATIONS FOR THE DISCOVERY OR 98,3151 M=k x b769ks |2 |7 62¢] 104075 — 508 \& 11670575 e gl K 111,725 110.:80F%, ® I LA 9 < =
= g w PRODUCTION OF OIL, GAS OR OTHER HYDROCARBON OR OTHER MINERALS; BUT SAID GRANTORS, ITS SERINL | lR | ( o e sz 1 -8 - & K 098me  [10.63FF [7055F) [ 1704675 110.55F5% 121.51F5 e LOT 282 < ]
pe SUCCESSORS OR ASSIGNS SHALL HAVE THE RIGHT TO REMOVE SAID OIL, GAS, HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES LOT 212 o LTRSS TN || @ | & v AR SR < Sls Hagiy ;jg%*g e 20641 | APN. 4139—008—020 = [
EL SEGUNDO BLVD OR OTHER MINERALS WITHIN OR UNDERLYING OR THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM BENEATH THE SURFACE SR ezezr | SN 2 Sy SRR B 1043 T 100571 | 220078 CP114) /v [ il —vves i 9
OF SAID REAL PROPERTY BY WHIP STOCK DRILLING, SLANT DRILLNG OR ANY OTHER MEANS CONDUCTED 98.76FS 98 19 NORREY S o 1 121,346 A o o MBS K151 575 x
I ON LAND OTHER THAN SAID REAL PROPERTY, AS RESERVED BY ESTHER BERNICE BURTIS, ET AL., IN DEED g sy Bl \Boai | (- esne LOT 227 012K 1109565 7 | & b : 121 71FS =
N RECORDED FEBRUARY 25, 1947 IN BOOK 24265 PAGE 210, OFFICIAL RECORDS. ) oo [PE0EH e TR | © CONCRETE —=jf<> [« [24NCA] L
i S | |l sl soreew wat 104.99967} s O i S LOT 267 5| ] NG 2 ©
PARCEL 3: (APN: 4139-006—061, 062, AND 063) | |99.257¢ S 101 60N 105.22NG. SRS 1 S | 1m00xs . . \~—— SLIDING GATE @)
T LOTS 202, 203, 204, 205, 206 AND 207 IN BLOCK 123, SHEET 8, EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL 99.40F 3 198 60FL S 07 o 2ol g - conerere = LHGOTS | 110 4055 o C B s 0
. SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) e "’/ F0L13V6,, 77 e | 0257 I8 [fizasbic igerse 2170y [Nzzows 9
106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. ‘ 4 a0 . L= 121,706 4 [0S | L el w
EXCEPTING THEREFROM LOT 202 ALL MINERALS, OIL, GAS AND OTHER HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES WITHIN 1 9.1665 4 101 821C 3" ROOF DRAIN 2,2 107 SIS 1L y. SRS i T
OR UNDERLYING OR THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM SAID LAND, TOGETHER WITH THE SOLE AND EXCLUSIVE S 77 [ S crounp ST 00075 1h50rs b oAl . 121.92F5 1221375 113.91NV NLY 8” PIPE °
SCHEDULE B ITEMS RIGHT TO REMOVE THE SAME THEREFROM, AND TOGETHER ALSO WITH THE RIGHT TO INJECT, STORE, G e —— - — g st S o s | : = I R B .
REMOVE AND WITHDRAW OIL AND GAS, REGARDLESS OF WHERE THE SAME IS PRODUCED, IN AND FROM —_—— — — — — — — 4l —ij R R T TR AN T D Nl A I G RN D PR S HANDRAR M Iy, — — — — T T T T T um s lhdean —\ T = %
ANY SUBSURFACE ZONE, FORMATION OR AREA UNDERLYING THE ABOVE DESCRIBED LAND, WITHOUT THE 100435 - AT & I ! 2| 121.491d N
: ' 00,45 /199,78 01,6010 TR0 N0901G - 049 NDB.0AIC 07671 00 IS A 98 5506 2 10.46FS N | 1 Q) S
BASED UPON TITLE REPORT NO. 00104439-016-NJ-DB, DATED NOVEMBER 12, 2019 AS PREPARED BY RIGHT T0 GO UPON SAID LAND, OR ANY PART THEREOF, TO CARRY ON DRILLING OR OTHER OPERATION 100.55F5 g 100 LA SN i R N 073005 R ol % N > 0 P
CHICAGO TITLE COMPANY. FOR THE DISCOVERY OR PRODUCTION OF OIL GAS OR OTHER HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES OR OTHER OOk Ol PS lonasie CURB oz1oic 108701/ | 109218 /) S L 2 2 | 121,95 * e 0 £ 2
MINERALS ~ THEREFROM, BUT WITH THE RIGHT TO REMOVE SAID OIL, GAS, HYDROCARBON SUBSTANCES AND 100.85FS ~ SISO 15 PARKING STALLS 106.76F5  108.32FS 1097306, [f= <16 07ES s S S P h\l : 20L5 & . g £ 8z
_ OTHER MINERALS WITHIN OR UNDERLYING OR THAT MAY BE PRODUCED FROM BENEATH THE SURFACE OF . = Ao 109.771C : 107.74ESd MO0 S| = | mm—F2 121.9N6 2 e gES B
@Q&ESEEME':.Q %TSOEVEL"‘NES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 5203 PAGE 157 OF DEEDS. (PLOTTED THE ABOVE DESCRIBED REAL PROPERTY BY WHIPSTOCKING DRILLING, DIRECTIONAL DRILLING OR OTHER 101,025 Wy |§/ =\ 1007473 | VO | ey 100 s Jon O e | ofl Ewoud ETS o F
- ) MEANS OR METHODS OF OPERATION CONDUCTED ON LAND ADJACENT TO THE ABOVE DESCRIBED REAL W I %F 101.88FS/ &5 5= %{? & © & H P P P O %\g%xzog.ggr 109.12F5 : o 1IN Ll 1214870 [ 3 £ E 2§ T g9
() AN EASEMENT FOR PRIVATE ROADWAY, RAILROAD, SDEWALKS, POLE LINES, CONDUITS AND Y e 2l e RS SN © @ ¢ & & ¢ &S B = 109 EXISTING BULDING 2IheA - Rigi21.06eS TPl 5855 TERQ
: : ' ' IN DEED RECORDED MAY 27, 1952 IN BOOK 39025 PAGE 243, OFFICIAL RECORDS. ol IPVRE TR NN O DAL A G R 109.941C 707 63110 , g [ 109.070 = & geE2ss JEOI
INCIDENTAL PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGES 106 AND 107 OF MAPS. (PLOTTED HEREON) =SV THrsrt ||, T Joreors » & RS & Oera PARCEL 5 105,85V 6" PIPE Y 2, 1085955 WSV 102.35mv N1y 147 PIPE = 122.04F5 ) LOT 283 > 8 &8 0T = E A
PARCEL 4: (APN: 4139-008-010) ot NGt el | Y ey e (105.26FS &I107.69FS, 10968FS, " 109.61F5% | R 08ees U 2t0.49t sy 102.27mv swiy 147 pie &) 35 0
@ AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED MAY 22, 1950; RECORDING NO. 2171 OFFICIAL LOTS 226 AND 227 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS 1.05L | @1z Gy *102277 o {0573 o oo ll Y {PER TITLE REPORT) e Y —1.. 110.30Fs 122360645 | | Z
RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, LOT 211 e | IW g LOT 228 e L L IS aggssrs xrogsers  HOSSIE  O® S hgers |5 - A5 121.66FS% ¥ 122,205 EXISTING BUILDING i
x (7 N ' ‘ llf S x 7 :
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED NOVEMBER 23, 1956; RECORDED IN BOOK IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. S 2 I W A.P.N. 4139-006-011 /7007'74;55 ﬁ S S 11017 CP104/0\ 0 o < HANDRALS ~ofo0 575 S 0 505 1220M67% | ! 121.7814 | 5 UESS
- 73S : . 4078 SRRASES = 5F 9) 258
52931 PAGE 326 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) PARCEL 5: (APN: 4139-008-011, 012, 018, 046) = (E |0302.07Fs 102,58 el 106.6070 109.50RM 110 72TF "% g e 1058100/ 0939 Kot — 10 75 10 —— 121125 g R sl 122.75F5 : 282
3 oz 10101 - ' 107.3176,107.921C 1078455 104 1INV £ YMETAL BOX, T0.T0ESW Aotk | il 1077 LOT 266 122.06NG, < 122.44FS < 8%
@ LOT 228, 229 AND 265, 266, 267 AND 268 IN BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, 073600 108337 SX o apr I 42 SR RCe 05170 1 , el 192 385 > S 388§¢
AN EASEMENT FOR PRIVATE ROADWAYS, POLE LINES, RAILROAD CONDUITS AND INCIDENTAL 102.911C | 102671 Pt . 106738 % 10z18my sty o ' . 00,6970 |10295 - : Z S5 S
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106, OF 2o > roria 6RASS 2200, D\ 105.50FS EPB 7 AT SGTC\ 110243 710.701c  per 19289ICN 100710 AP.N. 4139—-006—-046 < ~ 28
PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGES 106 AND 107 OF MAPS. (Pl.OTTﬂ) HE!E(N) MAPS. IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY 102 99F K (702.33FL & . 2 S 106. k x 14" PIPE 0. 4310 110.09ES, 1710.25TC 4 r of o0 < g
, IN THE E E ECORDE D g 02.99¢ 102675 <T & | 202785 ko £ ; 705.601C 10762708 7OFS Pracdet = S S 10,655 CHAIN LINK FENCE— | | 122.66F5 122.66FS Ui O
. A | - 5 { A ZTC 110 O()F 10: . 050 - -
AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES AND PUBLIC UTILITIES PURPOSES; RECORDED MAY 4, 1926; PARCEL 6: (APN: 4133-008-047) 7 CUFe. & N 2 SR\ Josers 1051 s - 45;/3 HO2LL 7 a LETEA IOHT s 1G9 L o, W2 122175 = Zs 3
RECORDED IN BOOK 5632 PAGE 325 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) PARCEL 6A: CUTIER [% | SES 0 107.87F5,, B2 it oF DR\ e ads0ie 4 10.85FS 177 gr g 192 65NG 122.12TC % Fl : | S N > 283
LOT 262, 263, 264 OF BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS 1036884 | wsf 106.44FS ' 106.87FS 109,26FS 110.07F 110.14E5 | 110.94ES " 170.85KS GEN | 00N 7k ¥ W21 785 =121 756 12L90FS N .12z o) W g9
@ THE RIGHT TO LAY, CONSTRUCT, MAINTAIN, OPERATE, REPAIR, RENEW, CHANGE THE SIZE OF, AND 10572650 o kps x 106.53FS T0I3FS [ 97 L=V 710.445 T —e— | ! 122 64ES 9 bR
REMOVE A PIPE LINE FOR TRANSPORTATION OF OIL, PETROLEUM, GAS, GASOLINE, WATER OR OTHER ANGELES, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, S e —— = —_—— = — | — B1C — — Ve — — — — 123.09NG y 1 a_APN. 4139-008-021 || w o5 D
’ . ' IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. 0107 AL T TS JO6.90FS 109,93k 109.83FS Ty | ZoF=% \ sV 709 85V 718 7F) N T @@€5
SUBSTANCES OVER SAID LAND; AS SHOWN ON MAP OF TRACT 2028 RECORDED IN BOOK 35 PAGE 104.02¢ ] 0 & Mtz P x 10,3665 /110.64F 5 LI0A4ES] 110 TS oA (1097 ' () ! = = & ek
37 OF MAPS AND SAID LOT 202, RECORDED IN BOOK 15938 PAGE 176 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED R A 0s1268] & |l = ’ JOS.25WV NLY 6 PIPE'107.48F5 1101200~ 110370/ FuL_QF kT A2 mosers U i || - noor VENT AREA —- (469 145602 S|nsés
: ~ ANGELES FOR ROAD AND HIGHWAY PURPOSES BY DEED RECORDED IN BOOK 6017 PAGE 93, OF DEEDS. 1GE59R) S\ ko3 does 22 g 105.17NV ELY 8” PIPE 104 20 FuLL OF DIRT 10345 / MOTHF 102075, re 192 GING | [ 122.74F5x Y1 22.90FS 3 nsce
HEREON — NO WIDTH GIVEN) . 6B: 104.21FS *}’Z 05T 104 RRR 105.03NV Sy 8" PIPF 1090475 «109,50F5  * 110.50FS ~ 110.96F5 ppemmc—mppec = T os 0 LOT 265 concres i ok ,’/ &) 121,645 a -
| ‘ s : x § x x 111.38FS 110.04L1D| : : [ s 3 m
AN EASEMENT FOR POLE LINES AND CONDUITS PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 21122 PAGE 8 LOT 230, BLOCK 123 OF EL SEGUNDO TRACT, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, E% 104.121C 7 = 108 1077365 107.96F5 108,235 LOT 229 111.58FSx 109.05INV o WANIFOL & GAS CONNECTIONS 44 /7754 {—%nggggl m c
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON — NO WIDTH GIVEN) STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AS PER MAP RECORDED IN BOOK 22 PAGE(S) 106 AND 107, OF MAPS, IN THE ¥ & Q |] AP.N. 4139-006—012 *11185 100 0/ | -~ L com () 122.8ING e CUR3 | | N i J
‘ . OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. | S g x 108.58FS % % <111.04F5  BLOCK WALL = 109.83INV TS | Plozees ~ROLLNG 157 5665 [ (2755 122.45FS >
@AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED DECEMBER 24, 1953; RECORDING IN BOOK 105.05F5% M 1k K04 7265 & 109.05FS ce S T 89FST i W s o d 1A W T 118.10FS [ DOOR 7105055 e . T hoob2r 121876~ L& 77122895 w FOR AND ON BEHALF OF
43469 PAGE 98 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON — NO WIDTH GIVEN) PARCEL 6C; AR N 74;0 i) = CHAIN-LINKFENCE 109 £ I] 5 SR N [ 115-20F5 oeerel | cs 1009\ Y I718.00FS[ 118.28FS 143,475 125.0605 ., 122.98, | L2z azrg | Y larstsco VT @ WARE MALCOMB CIVIL ENGINEERING
PARCEL 1 OF PARCEL MAP NO. 7197, IN THE CITY OF EL SEGUNDO, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, STATE OF &, Jf 4P 46 i 85 T [~ © « RS 113,085 | CONGRETE —(io) Iy L I / o2 15 2 7 i Niggdlde LOT 284 2
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 10, 1954; RECORDING NO. 2201, CALIFORNIA, AS FILED IN BOOK 110, PAGES 96 AND 97 OF PARCEL MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY LOT 210 8= B &f109.30FS : x 1094565 *1pg zare S W ' WALL  [I° [453/? . R EBR / 2 4 v 2005 <
IN BOOK 45277 PAGE 179 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) RECORDER OF SAID COUNTY. ) 105.347C SIS < X zb 114,118 11562FS S| | N10.95£5 - $ G IE L |WALKWAY . - [W22.1068 122.99FS #
105,92 S ook X102.5FS =3 ACP1O7 N X s | 175 IRl T T10.69F5 1107753 o 125.51F5) {24508 L S5 @
_ . BN i N7k 1 10— 1407 S . 8IS X115 37FS 173 54F, 7757075 AN AR 11861FS 119.7575 ™ { J20.56F5 T21.05FS 2 55 : 120.71FS
(19) AN EASEMENT FOR RIGHT OF WAY FOR A PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 10, 1954; BASIS OF BEARINGS 106.11751 S o5 4tz 5 110.09FS 111 20em @ ¥ 12645 o > o 1j680rSH 1169655 110.95FS \  118.41FS CREEN WALL J‘ N o, 157 9177 e VZZ%JQ% | 121, 80FS 120 74FS [ EXISTING BULDING Z >
RECORDING NO: 2204, IN BOOK 45277 PAGE 250 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) & Sok= TRETA/N/NG WALL BESNNTY & sty EFB I 8FS METAL-PIATES o635 N CP111x7/7.87Fs ~ LOADING DOCK S 2955 |N |y, s L I 521, 80FS. 192 79FS 9]
Sad S 3 110755y | | 9882V NLY & SLY _~{11219F5 11330FS ' TRENCH, | % 116.04FS x 117.20FS x118.12FS  * 118.59FS ’ L2115 101 9Fs < 1N & 54l 195 by 08775 ' 22 z
; ; Bl b x|/ 9% : ; ] - / x 1{9.81FS : o I=lo .29 177 80FS
AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED OCTOBER 1, 1954; RECORDING NO. 3341, IN THE BEARINGS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED UPON THE CENTERLINE OF KANSAS STREET, BEING SO0'06'36"E / 5o 105 ors | _ ) mazer {0 ElE SF, 311078 T AT 1 x J1437FS, wo (TN 4 & . e 3 11899FS < QIBISY o) 220y =% | s | 0 o o LIJ
BOOK 45734 PAGE 407 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) PER TRACT MAP NO. 53175, FILED IN BOOK 1278 PAGES 10 AND 11 OF TRACT MAPS, IN THE OFFICE OF 106,975 : 50’ ;—l—’IOE.ZQFSI s a1t : o) 116,169 1 17 17FS, ® » . & 122.5]1¢ O 8122 & LIRS 300 435S XV 15786 z >
@ ' ' THE COUNTY RECORDER OF LOS ANGELES COUNTY. =W Y106.645 ™ I o gl] S A119.960 oo W5 7IFS 115.65£5 CP106 117.35FS 118 18FS 118.66FS | 119.09FS 190 20fs 121.08A5™ ks L 1225\\ || .| 22275, N 121.79FS ] 121.94RIM ¢
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED OCTOBER 4, 1955; RECORDING NO. 3605, 25’ || 25°] >/ T y e 115,366 hozk pmm— . ey A ; ——— 4] TZ22IFS 175 96 -+ 122123 W22 s N 117. 39NV = m
IN BOOK 49137 PAGE 281 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTE) HE!EW) l I Q@— x 112.09FS A g 114 69F5 HOLF 115 69FS| i ‘W’/ 5720‘ 7965 120.83F S| 120.84FS, 120.81FS EJZO. /8FS 20,50572224F5x71]_/555 ! A 7|27.85F5X N\ Sf ZZZ;Q&‘? o
BENCHMARK o7 e F < N 115.00LI0. S (e T 146.590°, it L COLUMN (TYF) e 22200 ‘CP113 121.78Fs 122.54 4 o m
AN EASEMENT FOR ROAD AND PUBLIC UTILITY PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 6045 PAGE 130 S = o 12 114.06FS i Wl 2 ez | Y cloges " oepogmst L s o 1 Lo dEes==ezrs T 2297 (9 /AT — = D
— T T TR -5 = — o e = 120.88F5 = . . e —L' 0P SES| 122255~ ¢ ] = 86151 Y /102.46R1
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) E | )os OBTCl < NETES TR T pefs 3 TS CONCRETE WAL —{ 116,577 i 120.%6F HR09IFS A META]LZ 0)?%? 05 Nl o1Fs s /720@3#5‘%564@ 12% 208 722.55;5% I R284, ;jg 25255 Q (D
(@) AN EASEMENT FOR SANITARY SEWERS PURPOSES, RECORDED DECEMBER 5, 1939 IN BOOK 17121 ELEVATIONS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED UPON LOS ANGELES COUNTY BENCHMARK NO. 8Y11740, SN oresese 1 ozserst | £k A G | 174.987C 116.61£5 W 1157175 nsours/ | ﬂ e N B s 1™ 228 I 122,79 i
PAGE 74 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON ELEVATION 165.09 FEET (NAVD 88). N 108.3265 +107 74FS | o = x 112.70FS . o JII390Fs CURB~_ 7745 7c\l116.655 715 715 175 71 0 08ES) 1209653 120.96FS 120,985 121718F5 (2255 | U 122.79F u
! ) B[ wlie | 2 i 77 ¥ ' g BN i el W
, / S i S = i 787 G G \ o f | N 217 115, 80NV
AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 37937 PAGE 330 OFFICIAL RECORDS. DESCRIPTION: N 2 q 13 N e Haas) ™ aeets Vel By &V Vel e 121.79FF) —loss e B 8 \23027C 5 < >-
(PLOTTED HEREON) L&DPW BM TAG IN S CB 600MM (2FT) E/O BCR @ SE COR ROSECRANS AV & OAK AV N 1Z curgl— = « 1877k ITAA2NT LAY 95 \ 122 136.16F5 \ iz | | — 021 9 1 — Te)
l; | L <NI31FS  x1I06FS e o T5T7FS 120905 \120.96¢5 177 26F% b2 4075z < antrs 22645 m (q\| <
S ' & 15 122895} B W S-oalp2 10Fs 1229712 |—
@AN EASEMENT FOR RIGHT OF WAY AND PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 10, 1954; LEGEND N | 109 : I N S I 114.961c] B 7 HANDRAILS LOT 264 121 2815 | =i o Y POR LOT 285 g o ZL (q\|
RECORDING NO. 2202 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) AN 1094587 2 S TR 5 1T4.46F3)) . ./ | 122.91F5 | | D Y — » D =)
APN  ASSESSOR'S PARCEL NUMBER = GAS METER og41es) | g0 i ' 113,755 S 118 7265 | zz0c| | A-P-N. 4159-008-022 § « I_ L O
(28)35) AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 38318 PAGE 303 OFFICIAL RECORDS. AN 109.94h5 i B ol S s [y isseers 52 I e ’ W <C O
(PLOTTED HEREON) CAZ LS AL S CAS VALVE N 109.26f L y&@/} A Kl e S\ \2uoas I CONCRETE WALL M 122303 % g QO = <
BM  BOTTOM OF STRUCTURE AV GATE 109971 ~D-1oL'S 7. P 774,065 \ [21767F] CURB | To1.5075 12 FSF=t7 < N O <
AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED FEBRUARY 18, 1925 IN BOOK 4824 PAGE 218 AN bilonny fo” PIPE | | i Rt 4 BIKE RACK \121.14FS S0 | [1223008> N 4 O
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) BLDG  BULDING ® GUARD POST N ) | : | [ = |] LSBT0 PARCEL 6A zé/%; o = N += PoP ouT 2 Z ~ N N
S [ x A 1.011 S %
CAB CABINET — CUY WIRE Qll f112.088 & /i x114.20F5 x 0 157 % > x 121.55FS P
(3D AN_EASEMENT FOR ROAD AND PUBLIC UTITY PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 6045 PAGE 130 L N | Elirrsm bl o (¢ I S nazrs I €y PARCEL 6B | (PER TITLE REPORT) 15728108 SR I T 122 831C o o ul Z O
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) CATV CABLE T.V. VAULT C HANDICAP 112 1555 = /11.468F5 111.46FS, | 770966t it P §|] < = (PER TTLE REPORT) A.P.N. 4139—-006—047 gt ¥ | | x121.96FS I 12 2;86{ " Z D — < D
c8 CATCH BASIN @ IRRIGATION CONTROL VALVE B e 1 1z | |5 Sk x 114,555 . B Sk o 1 ' e/ 9 - LL F
AN EASEMENT SANITARY SEWERS PURPOSES; RECORDED DECEMBER 5, 1939; RECORDED IN BOOK 112.44FS 112.057C e L3 S 174.59F5 BV —1@ | SSR I CURE 7 Z o Z
0 : : ¢ CENTERLINE (gl LADDER R = == RETAINING WALL 121.10FS SRRE z
17004 PAGE 383 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) (GG & 115,841 ¢ LOT 230 PHEAB NSRRIl o j21.276s . m . ) O O]
CONC ~ CONCRETE 1t LIGHT STANDARD R, N \ \IW ﬂ C1484Fs  *TIASOFS 115.5/FS P LI, 0l | 217 5 121.64FS 122.00FS s =
@AN EASEMENT FOR POLES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 32277 PAGE 303 OFFICIAL RECORDS. co COOLING SYSTEM e o3 LIGHT STANDARD < S\NIZEE8 — CLi- BFV 2o 11487 il —_ + — L L _.E-_l —_ — — — e —_—— — — — 2 (D @) LLl O
(PLOTTED HEREON) p DIAMETER OF EXISTING TREE O 112 6860 TR/ ELE 2127 A G4 L6 | 19.1" 122101 ¥ 55 577 w - LL < L
¥ FEI ixtiie nsurel 117 | bisgore MONUMENT NOTES 7o o l o O =
(G AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES, FOR TRANSPORTATION OF GAS PURPOSES; RECORDED N BOOK o DRAIN INLET ® WONITORING WELL < o HI991C 115 o3 G0 B M I AR PEI7ES 0 19T 03Fs NI A 121795 = N 7))
O 146675 1742085 112 of~ M4iss7s £PB [21.06F5 2 . N
38223 PAGE 262 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) oW DRVEWAY N POWER POLE < 115.10FS TS sLoA 115.10FS 116.297C ¢ inia M e RO l > 1 0 0 -
Rl N 22 W S e : 8 MON.# DESCRIPTION LIS 74 S S B . , (j)
(36) AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 38372 PAGE 433 OFFICIAL RECORDS. EBR  ELECTRIC BREAKER —9— POWER POLE W/ TRANSFORMER Sl [ ¥ = xuzﬁ 705 11943, 10.8203 T | oW P LS I 18 ZIC)| | 21455 g 0 — ‘ ~— L
(PLOTTED HEREON) . g POVER POLE WAIGHT é ' . I': ;;45 gg;g \li |] g = M1 FD SPIKE & WASHER, STAMPED "LS 5411”, PER PWFB 0816 /561 12057V f— ;(:l I[;:% ||]2 o & ouRe —| 9
- : : TIOSRIM 121.24FS Qs B Ak Z
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED MARCH 27, 1957 IN BOOK 54046 PAGE M ELECTRIC METER © SEWER CLEAN OUT CURE & ! 2> x 115.61FS . S | M43 FD SPIKE & WASHER, STAMPED “LS 5411”, PER PWFB 9816/55%| rpr —— NS 1212868 120891C 120.95 Z
115.94FS : | | 4 ’ ’ V. 18RVEPP 6 PIPE ™~ 9 Qhzigra Dl 120.95FS <
362 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) £P ELECTRIC PANEL ® SEWER MANHOLE GUTIER 5 o i RN g S £ s éD COLUMN (TYP) TR e S| 120.131p 20210 567 s =~ GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
16 24Fsp 16— TGl = I o 116.767C < 121.20FSA | | i Y P % DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED JULY 20, 1976; RECORDING NO. 1328 IN BOOK EPB ELECTRIC PULL BOX oo —o— SIGN . V16,865 & e N ) RS ° 776.26FS W PARCEL 6C COLLNG DoOR 2 A 21120.73(S 00 wure LOT 286 ¢ <
5978 PAGE 372 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) v ELECTRIC VAULT I STAIRS SHOWING DOWNWARD DIRECT! 7. 11765401 Ir M = OEENGS H5.94FS EXISTING BUILDING - A | 12096759 120.59FS ) 7 2 . 266 KANSAS STREET,
[~ 7770265 | 1 HE S CURB & w6 CURB —|| ( CAR-CHARGER) (PER TITLE REPORD | | FR || e 0s T EL SEGUNDO. CA 9024
AN EASEMENT FOR PUBLIC STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED MARCH 5, 1965; RECORDING NO. 3890 GEN GENERATOR @ STORM DRAIN MANHOLE \’ZQ 1 =~ S Al eurrer . | L1 S lbdTirst 100 728 120.50FS 119.51FS = I_ U ’ 5
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) FF FINISH FLOOR A STREET LIGHT \ 118 14,5+ S5, 118,047 & 116.02FS \ < 118.92FS 176, 75;5;,3 0 4 121.17FF | < 1 00 7S 1202955, 119.34FS  EXISTING BUILDING E =
S ; 5 5 : < | 1901 198 ] : 119.14FS
(32) AN EASEMENT FOR CONDUITS PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 12, 1980; RECORDING NO. 80-772356 s FINISH SURFACE @ TELECOM MANHOLE N N - \g'i% <1< N A N LOT 263 iz S ,779‘54;577@5??;5 119945 Y s i —
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) f FLOW LINE S0 TRAFC LGHT N S W s 117 71ks ||| wrrc) YB S0 rizozie T e N TR oLl S Sio"| o {idsee Z ool — 1136475 o -
|| T16:82FSY L= , LAl ' 121.02FS78 [ & |3 2 119570 < A 119.56FS W <
(59) AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 7, 1997; RECORDING NO. 97-1213678 B LIS &3 TREE (TYPICAL) N nebarsyl et 17,7088 1176765 ||| 17670) B < N mzr B PARCEL 1 oors 4 g H9.95FS ¥ T18.8INV, g e (ol i 5
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) 68 GRADE BREAK = TRUNCATED DOME N NIZ58LE 3 ||I 11260FSIN | |E R ‘ 116.61F3, \77779;5 o PARCEL MAP NO. 7197 | ; = | Al Ss | e LY 708 <
HCR HANDICAP RAMP ) UTILITY POLE -— R I s N Hia 7RI S : 121.02FS || I 119.16FS WEAT *WWSJ A o
AN EASEMENT FOR WATER LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED AUGUST 17, 1955; RECORDING NO. 3073, IN AN 117.81FS e CIIZ6NC_ZR) 0655 116,795 * S 110 » _— e — — — — — — — — — — — = — 4— — e AP.N. -4139—-008-023 ||
BOOK 48685 PAGE 69 OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) v INVERT = WATER FAUCET N \w e T "775,47#5 ' 17,0785 e P.MB. /96-97 | . T 1T T Tadorss 119 1465 (3B ¥ 055 b
NG NATURAL GROUND H WATER METER (G064 | & (49 S| IZegL - UI6EIC x 116.67FS ] N 77 J21L17ES L Tl ' 19718555 « ~= BLock waLL 3)
AN EASEMENT RECORDED IN PARCEL MAP 7197 IN BOOK 110 PAGES 96 AND 97 OF PARCEL MAPS. AN I 11767 116381 . IIZ17S Y755 . s 1 > e X
(PLOTTED HEREON) 4 PROPERTY LINE Q WATER VALVE / o | 257l 116.89FS o S | e 117.45F1 180575 v
SSMH  SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE BLOCK WAL N e e B ||| M2EHST Ol [768rs % x116.61Fs 1171816 R HanoraLs | - SE =y g e s AT, 176605 4
AN EASEMENT FOR PRIVATE ROADWAYS AND TO LAY WATER AND GAS PIPES, SEWERS, POLE AND K 118191C & o —ar 116.95FS % 117 o T1716%5) X ' il 116 T1BIOFS 70 % 117.62F5 <)
CONDUITS LINES, SIDEWALKS, CURBS, GUTTERS AND RAILROAD PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 22 Sco SEWER CLEAN oUT BRICK WALL 11764 s : s S 121.00¢F SIS | 11797FS* 8| 7 116.06¢5 s
PAGES 106 AND 107 OF MAPS. (PLOTTED HEREON) SOMH  STORM DRAIN MANHOLE o Canoey N K [761es Lzgor; 282 e 097N I2L19FF] 1 o l?i ol : 117.945S ™ 117.39F) & %
- 7o < 117.17FS 5 1174815 ViR Ty 2 " I 1Z11FS T 4
(5O) AN EASEMENT FOR STREET PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 6254 PAGE 39 OFFICIAL RECORDS. R  RIGHT OF WAY — CENTERLINE LOT 209 N v L HZBICR Yy | 1779300 : 117.22F$ 121l - s | i WG T [ GRAGE BREAK At e 117.00F X 118 11FS 5 <
(PLOTTED HEREON) TCAB TELCO CABINET xx——x——x—— CHAI LINK FENCE S l\ciizasrs)| o / plli s ~S Y ] 121.1568 LOT 262 iz f i T_‘] S assrs, 17055 g0 2 =
7 & L00ik : : 117.37s|| S0 115:06F S W21 1265 Yo/ | =N 116.98FS*—117 ==z Y SRR z o
(5D AN EASEMENT FOR POLES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 32317 PAGE 243 OFFICIAL RECORDS. Lh CONCRETE/RETAINING WALL | 5 777% lonzm) &/ PR DA 117,335 I 18 | o aqs o ANORAL ; =g (17025 o 2opd 00T LOT 287 <
(PLOTTED HEREON) v ELCO VAULT ——— — — — — — EASEMENT LINE 114 44Fd Y17g6re X g f - 119.90NG | 119.96S 1all EE 176.64F9 5
7726]%?/‘/@’ " . CURB — §T o [k 77763 = 117.46FS 117.47TC HANDRAIL D 1 . 54 ) <
c TOP OF CURB EDGE OF PAVEMENT , o "y 107D ——_|| 118.307C | Sk vy \ : § = m 8" DI 118779F 20, 44/Lé 117.0ING. % /16.497C €] 118.17FS [a]
@AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINES PURPOSES; RECORDED IN BOOK 38690 PAGE 364 OFFICIAL RECORDS. 11013V SLY 12°PIPE — | 7776 | S S -9 117.46FS% ~ lcP108 IRVl (o ~ 1>l S g oS | oo a7 97 b
(PLOTI'ED HEREN) 70S TOP OF SLOPE FLOW LINE 110.12INV NLY 12" PIPE l\é} | \ oy _g 117.55FS /0. % 24l OF 120 120 J ) 1168 ? |L§’ [ 6. 34F] M g
w TOP OF WALL CAS LINE | RIS T T T 117.54F5* 11759 = B 3 D 116.90NG | Shd 2485 b 715 G671 F,M[ BLOCK WALL 0 THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED HEREIN
@AN EASEMENT FOR PIPE LINE PURPOSES; RECORDED FEBRUARY 27, 1953 IN BOOK 41081 PAGE 329 | 118.17FS I ‘ : ’ L 117701 1"y | ) wdzﬁ%ﬂ’u AN coLuM (TYP) 112.34INV SWLY 12" PIPE \ S|SB 2175, 89F5 J1557S 116 01 10 - m ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA, LLP AND MAY NOT
OFFICIAL RECORDS. (PLOTTED HEREON) il Al i GAS LINE RECORD aard AEH ngogrs 77754f& = BT T e | 777 R o I e I L0 151.34107 o L 775.935‘ A ) 5 BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN PERMISSION
16. O, ~ [ . I17.90FS W7/ . 4 UUTh 15 16.67 Y ) : ~
TYPICAL — —— —— ——  INTERIOR LOT LINE o ssh LB OFES ~_; PR Sy o e 19P%S TROENG. < e W, o0 717.00NG 116,796} 2 13115 Mg e 22 115.95TC z pepee—
TER WETE 118.59FS =) INI1EA4ZIC 77772# NIRIING \ NG, J118. 118 T5NGK ey 119.26F5 \ 77 95NG 17765NG 117.56NG 4 5 117.4ING 117.50NG AL N7 09NG e Igg | 15 115.817C 1\7/5,5776 L - SUBMIT
WATER METER _— — — MONUMENT LINE 118.66FS o ;;ggg% CHAIN LINK FENCE GRASS 7’77('92ch 77 9ING| 118, WNQW - 7 24ﬁ7575“/75§/g}N”X77727[Q /7.76 ééﬂg i |j 7P5f77.57§g@ TR HZ38NE%1 ¢ oprs 775.9/5}5X 7 ﬁfj_@zrg e 1185855 115.06F5 6 ;gé?;g 115.22FS CURB 7 115.24FS 140200 b I_ TAL:
LT PAEUET P INBEE e N e g 2017358 | [T T4, 180G TIZAES 3 o1ls HBSFES, o & 1PB— i S i R Tt oY P AL 570G T adl n'g 114,608 114.555 5 | O ENTITLEMENT SET
UTILITY STATEMENT BACK-FLOW WALVE P 7205775 95T o . 1192000 /e 18.151C T UG0S TS e 11770 1573 S 14, . ICAB \ N SIDEWALK - £PB 1'75’5/”5@17 154805 HOR Z TTZZT"=="\ " D (ACCESS) H_W SDEWALK — \ ol L
CAR STOP OVERHEAD LINE P Ryt CPI0E: 7777299'378%‘ gk : z {SELES i J — = = : 6.341C 1761010/ L0 o : 7/? ;725.721;5 K= P e Lt TR0, ——— [14.361C & < P )
; L _ S I TT7811C] 1T7451C) 7171010 76,090 : , 115, 891C . 487 TSI 114455 TT4.10FS x \4431C \_, LAIEIC
BURIED UTILITIES AND/OR PIPELINES SHOWN HEREON ARE PER VISIBLE AND APPARENT SURFACE EVIDENCE, e PROPERTY LINE pyusl oS WW & | : ik N 17rs 7 N\ W 176.73FS e AN R ol 75 RIS 1835 151578101 \ ouck moeax 117907 CURB 2 JOB
RECORD DRAWINGS OF THE CONSTRUCTED UTILITY LINES OBTAINED FROM RELIABLE AND RESPONSIBLE SOURCES _—_——— L , AL — O = 117.911G 117.891C 2 MITE STRIPE N . ,9) 11208 2. 115,398 NIoZZIC 174903 3 5 O 2OER-033
NOT CONNECTED WITH CALVADA SURVEYING, INC. OR MARKINGS PROVIDED BY AN INDEPENDENT LOCATING CONTROL POINT RIGHT-0F~WAY LR ~ SIS 117575 ,,3‘7725/;5 @) < 76 {55 174.64fL_114 = l lea
CONTRACTOR. NO GUARANTEE OR WARRANTY, ETHER EXPRESSED OR IMPLIED, IS MADE AS TO THE ACCURACY OR DECORATIVE BRICK SAMTARY SERER LUNE L = | = Sy 177268 Y odIZ.55ES > x - - - = X x x x ALLYIS x114.51FS - I 14.2955 % 114.09FS z DAT
THOROUGHNESS OF SUCH INFORMATION. IF MORE ACCURATE LOCATIONS OF UNDERGROUND UTILIES OR PIPE 202455\ 11929 gVgral  |118b6FS 116.42¢5 (18.035117.83S 117.79FS 117.40FS 117.265 117.06€S 116.72FS M6.36FS N\ 116,02FS 115,706 115.39FS (15.00FS ' H14.9765 . B =3 Al 09.02.2025
LNES ARE REQUIRED, THE UTILTY OR PIPELINE WILL HAVE TO BE VERIFIED BY FIELD POTHOLING. CALVADA DOOR SANITARY SEWER LINE PER RECORD R = | ‘ . S \ ‘ 3" GAS LINE PER m Uz,
SURVEYING, INC. AND THE SURVEYOR OF RECORD SHALL NOT BE HELD LIABLE FOR THE LOCATION OF OR THE R T STORM DRAI LIVE \ — YELLOW STRIPE N 8 & \/ PLAN NO. E-232 x " REVISIONS:
FAILURE TO NOTE THE LOCATION OF NON-VISIBLE UTILITIES OR PIPELINES. T 118 76F5., | _\Srsars | 11765, \1 117 61ES 117 48FS T - 117 3765 117,195 L6 116 92Fs 116 5265 116 1IFS\ 115 76£S 115 26£S 145.02ES 114.76£5 114635 114.44FS___11409FS 2 5 '
ELECTRIC OUTLET STORM DRAIN LINE PER RECORD i e T — — T T e — < —Q e — == — - ——— — — 7147975 s L
- ~ : ~ : : S ) hr521Rn® -
FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTON ~ ——  TOE -~ ——  TOE OF SLOPE STORM DRAIN LINE PER 1 N GRAND AVENUE AN 106.04INV NELY 12" PIPE © E m
FIRE HIDRANT TS 70P OF SLOPE PL; 2 \ 1 75;5\\6 117.17FS WHITE STREZ psses BT i e 114.88£5 114.60FS  114.49ES 114.34F5 114.14FS 5 .
- 120.26F '19.23FS_ 118.87FS , 5 2 116.92F: ; 116.40F 115.94FS b : 119, w14 g x!1, el it x IF x
(" Underground Service Alert ) ) e e e A PR e L T L e, R ey P22 T Sy = — | R ey T ==Ly — — T Y ) 2 2wy ==Ly S ey ==L By LB wy =i iy | €
FLOW DIRECTION WROUGHT IRON FENCE 120.01F]) 119. 47z5§5\ ﬁ]zgﬁgﬁg% (755‘?575 | &I’ ‘ % é% R/W N nrilie N % 7777597% ;;jggfrg %g% 114 &
& A L 3\ 1 o : J Q .
Call: TOLL FREE FOUND MONUMENT AS NOTED N A0S ol 11894106 (R 177828 sl S 116,855, 117.431C 117.351C cRgH730Tc) N\, 1685 116.907C 116.741C 116.537C 116,181C 115.851C 115.591C)) 113.251C 114.787C //j‘;gﬁf Acpg5 114 751C0N ~CuRg— 114A8TC 114.351C 174 ZOHC 8
1-800 O | LTI ﬁ,ZZO.OZFS_V:_;‘\ 775903 \777,5 AL = 116.83ES {zzagffs T T =y - [116194ES N [116.64FS r [T1643FS 716.26FS [115.89FS [15.49FS 715.09FS 71774.%5& > 772;/55&774.7% 1142765 /. J14.076S JI392FS 17%% 2
T TTBR5rS - i, i 115.24F5S I EbF
227-2600 CONTROL POINTS ~ Bl PV vee > ow o = // JI6.99FS o JiZ40ESy 1174765 oBDEWALK. _1iguors 4 « 117085} — HESHS HERES 11667 1161345 HOVHES @it {—2r5mqrs 75 426 S 1451865 >\/ 1254, 148869 o POV §154rs 114455 114365 \_ >
= : g Yrs LISIATIIFS o TS e 1709815 H570FS—T15.63FSN 17557 115.27FS N
TWO WORKING DAYS 20.36E5 \ < 11711FS N 5.97K: i w
R V51740 123.03F5) * \ & 116, 74f [ STORM DRAIN LINE PER AN 175.34FS o
BEFORE YOU DIG ) CP# | NORTHING | EASTING | ELEVATION DESCRIPTION 121.13NG, = = 119)29F5 P N 116/44F 5 PLAN NO. F-248 o )
n| 125.08F9 | |+ & 117.39FS = 116.26F- _ — — — — — == ~
120.67FS 1 _ e e £.26F5 4 _ — il § T
g ' ’ FD SPIKE & WASHER (M! R | 280907 N 73 oo 124.92N6 vizzere ) Tt =
CP1 11940.39 8719.17 95.14 (M1) =5 725.05?7' W%%%;S s 17.36FS /& ® e LINE TABLE N N :
PREPARED UNDER MY SUPERVISION: CP97 | 11940.61° | 9049.77 112.80° | FS MAGNETIC WASHER STAMPED "LS 541" 0|z /MM 129,906 CP133X T =22 s s AN AN E
280 NN 1o] e 116.05F5% 63FS UNABLE TO LINE # | DIRECTION | LENGTH W
CP104 | 1174273 | 8874.67' 110.16° | FS MAGNETIC SHINER PSOMAS | (RiezioiG . §§m% = | o IBBERA. | {11665 UNBLE 10 0PEN AN - < o N <
g 32 } t o 115.62FL L1 NOO06'36"W 40.01° 2
CP106 | 11658.71 8902.20’ 120.82’ SET MAGNETIC NAIL I s I | 775359%0 : © N 5 PA /| PM:
’ ’ : 122N 4 C . p B Y W L2 | NB9BIB0E | 3500 LINE TABLE l\ > AN 2
CP107 | 11678.52 8790.35 110.44 SET MAGNETIC NAIL overaane | rasis | L ppe E 0N 1 N < < N DRAWN BY:
) ) ) & = | ™ LOT 232 L3 NOO06'36"W | 30.01" LINE # | DIRECTION | LENGTH N e :
LS. 7780 CP109 | 11896.17 8915.22 105.20 SET MAGNETIC NAIL 7 I RS o o iy U n
Date: 02/11/20 - : - 7 RN ] % <o |1 | I W 14 NB9BIB0E | 293.50° 110 | N895248°F | 2501 N 0 10’ 20’ 40’ Q § JOBNO.:
CPM1 | 11675.81 8921.61 117.88 SET MAGNETIC NAIL D P olNNnsae o ME7FSIZIM| 1173070 s AN N 8
120255 T = 1168255 16.44FS L5 N89BIS0E | 29350 L S0006°36°F | 12330’ | :
CP112 | 11660.64° | 9021.93 122.24' | SET 60D L23.J0NeA @ S \ TRE ,l% R AN N o g SHEET TITLE:
& 18 5166 S ~ 1157845, L6 N89EIS0E | 328.50° L12 | NOOVE'36"W | 12329’ <
CP113 | 11656.34° | 9035.05' 122.20° FS MAGNETIC SHINER PSOMAS 122780648 s | S NSI2038IC g & SO oo DRAN LINE PER N N ORIGINAL GRAPHIC SCALF »
v 12258NGIA " )y ond ' S = —T7] 7| noooszew | soor 113 | NegsZME | 2500 N SORAELS o]
CP114 | 11813.47’ 9065.55' 121,53’ SET CONCRETE NAIL 12L9NGKA° s ¥ J18.26FS ™ I CURB & < i CURVE # | RADIUS | DELTA | LENGTH N S
Armando-D. DuPont : : : 5 N 1 ol GUTTER 18 | NoovE'IEW | 489.89° 114 | noovsss'w | 16330 N N 2
Registration No. 7780 oIS | mo7r3s o e T ?22’56%“& S ot - L9 | NOOVE'IEW | 356.50° 122 | S000647°E | 10215 N G 000" | 893954” | 1571 N 5
Lol SR eelieie CP127 | 11899.26' | 8948.96’ 107.40' | SET CONCRETE NAIL 7 UG . e |2 : : | N N
121.58NG 118.76FS .07 b = LBTIFS o S N &0
I
'_
SHEET
NU,

9/9/2025 10:05:11 AM



% % % % % i NOTES
01 100SF BICYCLE WORK SPACE
02 SEE LANDSCAPE DRAWINGS
R (2N 4 ("5
HOLLY STREET <&
3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
BIKE PARKING | CULVER CITY,
| i e CA 90232
\ oo ===uuaue= I Y T i Y A s e $16:399.7975
e e e [ N —l 4 _ Y I ) o s I A A W }\__
- =T S0 e emt i Y Y i W e R . B
h | x - CURB LINE ABOVE
1BR UDIO POOL EQUIP gy — BUILDING ABOVE
= )
| - N —
| UTILITY i |
h | N LV - TR | Z
]
STUDIO 2 BR STUDIO || STUDIO I m
|
|
| o 1 % | | E
| N — 1BR | | |
N | 1] UL | ? %% | = |—
|
STUDIO % | : m
. L 18R | : <
— 7 o all
N I&J 1BR COURTYARD A g ]
@p) |
a7 — i 1BR o | W
< ||| 7 | m
N § 1l ||I 1BR | : A <
N | i ‘
A | ‘ éé [ ‘ GYM . |
: Sm=enEr el o ol s : a
= 1BR |
| | | | Z
| COMM ROOM STUDIO : ! <
N I ' | m
UTILITY L -t
e e o l @, 3
& IR o8
| o e > <
| | = — LL] <3
| IR | -
| ¢O| L |
| H =Z| W Z 8
| | | : E: |C£ A w E{E Z
| ' @p) O I D
| N <~ E”D(La
L | | : ; m & 7))
| | | | — Lo d
T L | | | : :
L ] SHEET NOTES GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
| B 266 KANSAS STREET,
| | 1. SEE SITEPLAN GO1 FOR MORE INFORMATION EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245
: |r l, :
| /| |
\ \
| o
| |
: \ : : | :
|
BUILDING ABOVE | |
/ S \ N
777777777 ] | | : |
\ \
% ‘ ‘ | | : THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
s N | | L\| ' EZEE%ﬁEEE”EESSSZ@ED”JV?TDHV&S?‘JV%T#EQ’LLP AND
s |\ ‘ SUBMITTAL:
§ | | - : f‘ | ENTITLEMENT SET
|
‘ l JOB NUMBER:
§ » N 2021-033
——————————————— — | | DATE:
§ R | | 09.02.2025
N | " .
N ‘ [ : N
| |
\ * N N
§ o R
N | It |
| | 1 |
|
| |
| \
| |
| ||
]
iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii Y |
_________________________________________ | N
__________________________________________ ot N
- I . i, i, i, i, L B2 FLOOR
S - T - - T T N PLAN
AN GRAND AVENUE A A @
\A30/ \A30) \A30/ .
] ] ] ] ] ] ] ) ) ) ) ) ) B2 FLOOR @ E
1" = 20'-0" 1 0

9/9/2025 10:05:13 AM



% % % . % ey NOTES
01 SEE LANDSCAPE DRAWINGS
/A (2N 40 ("5
& @ HoLLY STREET <&
3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
| CULVER CITY,
\ | CA 90232
o N I 316:399.7975
||__:::::::::::______ __________ 0 —1  — _ — ] o
N\ | | | |
| | |
N | ),
[ | CURB LINE ABOVE
4N h
AN\ | || UTILITY | / | \
AN | | | | | Z
|| |
|| STUDIO 2 BR STUDIO || STuDIO | STUDIO o | m
o ' =
| | A 1BR | |
e |
N | T | F
| |
. |' STUDIO | m
- . e ¥ | <
LLl ||
N LL | 1BR | ﬂ.
o | |
5! ' NN <
1BR
5y ' LL]
= | 2BR | N >
N § | ) 1BR | A\
i I | | | [T \GP\EN-LO/ | <
N | | BELOW | |
. e | LEASING 7 |
. —_—— |
) | n l 1BR | Q
S i i s | <
2 | R i |
o | i 2BR STUDIO : | <
e s w — o LOBBY
| ' > 7S __ 7COURTYARDB I | m
al o 1 2
| | | 1BR 48 | | w S
4 | o
A3 |l : H | CO-WORKING CZ_) > 2
ms - 7 | — LL] <O
[ | | = % Za
l ke E N | IE ™ 52
| 1BR N w 0D
I | i N <§E (N w S
N e [ = | T 50
= ] | 1BR : | | . 0 -
— | ‘ .
| I i val I i | |
RE 1BR |1 SHEET NOTES GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
H DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
| | 266 KANSAS STREET,
o 1BR 1BR STUDIO 1BR B 1. SEE SITEPLAN G01 FOR MORE INFORMATION EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245
| | ||
| | |
LT SR S o
s 1BR .
| gy |_| | | | —
| »'I |
e |
_| : |
\ L - |
. ‘ | N N PERMISSION
s W \ | : : | ) @ SUBMITTAL:
§ L : | ENTITLEMENT SET
| b |
| JOB NUMBER:
§ | : : R 2021-033
N . | 09.02.2025
\ \ o | REVISIONS:
s T I |
N b § | N
N | | l\ \
N o |
\ ‘ | | | |
\ « |
\ \ | | | | |
| ] | 1 |
| N o
0 | \
| | | |
| : | |
\ L__________________________________________,| : .
+++++++++ Tt N —
J AN o . 3 3 3 B ] B1 FLOOR
A S - — o~ e - PLAN
N
AN GRAND AVENUE A @
A0/ (A30) .
- - - - - - - - - - - - - B1 FLOOR 1 NV
A11

9/9/2025 10:05:14 AM



NOTES

01  SEE LANDSCAPE DRAWINGS
02 TRANSFORMER
(2N 40 5\ 03  PULL SECTION CABINET
\A23/ \A30/ \A30) \A30) 03.1 ELECTRICAL SWITCHING SECTION
HOLLY AVENUE 05 SWITCHING STRUCTURE
06 FUSING STRUCTURE

5. 0" 3573 HAYDEN
SETBACK AVENUE
- 0" | CULVER CITY,
| DEDICATIO CA 90232
__________________ e 316:399.7975
___________ - - R - -
el 1] = Lo L L L |
2'-0 = PER [AND SWAP
| | EXHIBIT
I
|| 3 BR 2 BR 2 BR 1BR 1BR |
e | N
| |
_ | I Z
|
| - LLl
%
|| STUDIO 2 BR STUDIO || STUDIO| | STUDIO 2BR | |
— | -
L s SN |
o | a8 BR R |
o’ Al > F
CITJ |l 1BR REMOTE
| STUDIO - |
N | RESIDENTIAL METER
@ || ROOM STUDIO Igl] |
> R = = 168 | I N <
=z ) I o
N || 1BR 1BR -
| 1BR
| Igl] |
: | = P 1R i |
1l a Lo 2 LLl
. | 2BR 2 BR 1BR @
| I’ |
REMOTE 1BR ~
| || a RESIDENTIAL METER | <
| o | ROOM " |l |
stupio & =
| | ) I. | @
_ 1 » | O wl
= | I — L
= | g =1 =
iy |
Q9 | | | N 1BR ” | : I — !
2BR STUDIO RGN <
|| | <C
- — b | = 14
— = = . |
| - ] M &
] | ~ [T / 0 0 o o o o |l | W
i J T = TTES
| | - = ‘ ¢ o 4 . O | a -
N <X -4 go |7 " 23
I oo
4 ST | ) wan
' . E 77 oge |11 R
|| o S w?
| P c . 0 o
| RESIDENTIAL METER w w ~
|| || || ] | | | LO _l
| || o o | | | | A wn — W
| || | . |
|| o o o SHEET NOTES GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
| ] DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
| 266 KANSAS STREET,
o STUDIO < © | 1. SEE SITEPLAN GO1 FOR MORE INFORMATION EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245
[ (] ] [
: | | IP \ o o | :
| | /“ /W\ |
o o |
| 5 S B i
o Lo |l - ° |
| “ O O | | _—{06] S—
| [ 1 18R STUDIO 1BR |
N = ° ° | T |
| 1 . 1BR o o |
\ é o o |
] O O 5] | :
I THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
‘ o o ‘ HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
j f @ L/IEA':NH\:Q;SE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
/BN | PERMISSIO
’+ 2 BR |
W ! N © o | SUBMITTAL:
COURTYARD C | - o _ (P
‘ e ENTITLEMENT SET
| © RAMP RAMP | | |
‘ DN UP JOB NUMBER:
| S o I ELECRM| | 2021-033
| — — i TRASH i | DATE:
i ] — Ed 09.02.2025
% 1BR Q < |
REVISIONS:
Q (o I o O N clele | |
O |
n 1BR = RES RES|RES | SN |
| oo o oo | 2 0 O
- A e '
UTILITY |
NV NP NP ! |
I
118 - 4" Tl |
|
|
| RESIDENTIAL
| MAIL ROOM 2 BR STUDIO 1BR 1BR 1BR 1BR 1BR  froaroinal
|
\ SHEET
KW FIRST FLOOR

N PLAN

SHEET

: 1ST FLOOR ) A
1" =20'-0" 1 2

9/9/2025 10:05:17 AM



R (2N 40 ("5
\A23/ \A30/  \A30/ HOLLY AVENUE \A30/
|
|
«c L - — - - - - - - -0 =
- - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - =-—=-— == - o o
|
|| | | | |
|
| : | 2 BR 1BR 1BR 2 BR |
| |
] |
| | == ==
| i I
| | | = L/ | I |
|
| STUDIO 2 BR STUDIO || STUDIO STUDIO 2BR |
|| | ROOF |
— < |
| ! - 1BR ! |
LL] | = | |
e |
[d)p) || = |
N | STUDIO -
2. | STUDIO |
= 1BR
(@p) | |l |
pr | | | | | ;
§ 1BR
| : | 1BR |
: | i 1BR :
| |
| | - I |
| . |
| | 2 BR e 1BR |
| : | I — 1BR |
o o : I
| - |l = |
) I STUDIO
|| | | 3BR = | IC—) _
]! I‘ 1BR | O w
1] | = B
] m | T ~
| 2BR STUDIO N w |
| ) 1BR 2 BR | <C
| - Ly L
| =|=2 ks = =
| 1BR : > T -
| i T MECHANICAL |
| | | | 1BR [ A 10 00 00 ST
|| / *****
I S
| ) ||
| | 1BR L] owo | |
| i 1BR e | |
I ouwo | I
al | i
| | o RAWP *
| | UP owo |
| || || |} ] || |
| | 1BR L - I o o o o | |
|| wal Il || I —] | |
| — 1BR o o o - ||
| |
| | 1BR 1BR STUDIO 1BR © © © © |
| | O O O O m
| | | o o o o \ :
|
| | o o o o |
| | | 1 O O = = O | |
1BR o © © © © | |
| 2 BR STUDIO
| | | 1ER o o o o :
| ‘ ‘
é o o o o |
| | - ] = ‘ O = | :
o o o I o
| I |
1 2BR T o o o ) \ o K= |
| | | O O 1 \ H;LI
| S | ' 121'- Q"
RAMP .\ RAMP ;/Fﬁ} |
| DN RN T |
| | ? o #23'_6" } \\ 10% 12%\\\”:44i: *****
I | N — — | \\\
| % | N RAMP UP
B owo | -
a2l= 1BR o | - | GARAGE ENTRY
| =8 —, . TRASH - . A N
2BR 2BR DY o - __ __ "= _
1BR c g -
. ' 1 RESRES RES [T RN
| II} | o 0o o oo 0o 5% 0 i il | \
| n \
ol /| I ﬂl e d | \\
| UTILITY | |
L/
. e
|
| R 2BR 1BR 1BR 1BR STUDIO 1BR 1BR 1BR 1BR 2 BR |
i | —
\L _______________________________ -
CTN AN 5
\A30/ (A30/ \A30/ \A22/

2ND FLOOR

1" = 20'_0"

NOTES

SHEET NOTES

1. SEE SITEPLAN G01 FOR MORE INFORMATION

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

SECOND
FLOOR PLAN

SHEET

A13

9/9/2025 10:05:20 AM



1Y ("5
() () (&0
-
| l_l__::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::l
o N
| | ROOF |
|| | |
| | |
| | ) ) ) |
|| |/ |
] |
|| | 2 BR STUDIO || sTuplO || STuDIO |
1] B |
] =18 1BR |
|
| | J |
|| |
|
| |
] 1BR N
| |
| | L |
| B |
] |
| | | ROOF 1BR |
|
| s |
| | |
| [ |
] |
| | | 1BR |
|
| | % |
| | | 3BR STUDIO |
| I
|| | 1BR |
|| | g |
| |
| | 2 BR STUDIO [
|| | | 1BR |
| : | | A I |
| | |
| | | } ]
‘ \\ //
N :J | | . 0o 0 o o 0 o | :
e 9+ - 1 == -
3
N | ] 0 . |
] %o |
| o |
|| 1BR e
| oFe |
| & RAWP —
| | UP owo |
| ]
| | 1BR o o |
| |
| | | 2BR STUDIO 1BR © © |
| | ' O | O O
| |J O -
| | | ROOF o o |
| | l o o |
| | !ﬁ 1BR O ] = O |
. 1BR STUDIO o o |
|| | 1BR o - |
| ‘ ﬁ'ﬁ]_j |
Q o o |
| | 0 | = = |
| | o o |
|
L 2BR T o . |
| | | | ) |
|| < RAMP RAMP < |
DN UP
: | = |l - o |
| | |
|
| == 1BR e °© |
. 2 BR 2BR o T i C c|c |
| 1BR o RES|RES RES |
| olo o/l o ol o (0]00 |
| | ‘ T
| ;' UTILITY |
o N N N L/ |/
|
| | |
L | 2BR 1BR 1BR 1BR STUDIO 1BR 1BR 1BR 1BR 2BR |
] | |
| I BN} BN - JUTIT T . JUTIC N
t_________________________________________'_J
2N 4 ("5 (1)
\A30/ (A30/ \A30/ \A22/

3RD FLOOR @
1"=20-0"

NOTES

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED

HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND

MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

THIRD FLOOR
PLAN

SHEET

A14

9/9/2025 10:05:22 AM



R ("5
NEUL) (&0
S
| l_l__::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::l
| | |
| | B
| -
e
| |
| |
| ‘ : : :
|| i |
| ‘ |
] .
1 ROOF |
|
|| | |
| | |
| | |
| | STUDIO |
| | N
| |
| | |
| 1BR
|| |
]!
| |
|| | R
| | 1BR |
|| | |
| |
| | B
o | STUDIO
| ROOFTOP |
|| | DECK |
| [ ] |
e 3
N : COMM ROOM 2BR |
| : | |
| L
e —
] | 00 o 0 0 0 0 0 e |
| | | ***** - |
| | F 0 . = |
| | — |
| it S
| o«
| O |
| o RAWP —
| | UP owo |
| |} || ] |} |
| | | o © |
| B
| | | o o |
| |
] | STUDIO © © |
| | O O O |
o |
| ° ° |
||
| | | = © < |
| | | == O =) ) |
o | 1BR STUDIO 1BR 5 - |
] | 1BR N - :
|
‘ ‘ C © ° |
| | O O O o |
| | o o |
| 2BR o o |
| | | | | |
|| e RAMP RAMP e |
| = - DN uP - |
|| |
| mE 1BR e © |
| |I E=|= S TRASH
I 2 BR 2BR 1BR C C | C |
| RES|RES|RES |
| o o o/ 0ol 0o o] 900 |
[ I [T
| [ ﬂl
| |' UTILITY |
) |
| |
I |
It 2 BR 1BR 1BR 1BR STUDIO 1BR 1BR 1BR 1BR 2 BR |
I |
e — AT = AT T e NI Mheead |
\L_________________________________________'_J
(2N 4 ("5 1
\AS0/ (A30) \AS0/ \A22)

4TH FLOOR @
1" = 200"

NOTES

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST

DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND

MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

FOURTH
FLOOR PLAN

SHEET

A15

9/9/2025 10:05:24 AM



NOTES
01 HVAC CONDENCER WITH PAINTED CORROGATED
METAL SCREEN
02 PHOTOVOLATIC PANEL
i (2N 4 (5
VEVARVY (A% 03 COURTYARD BELOW, SEE LANDSCAPE
3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
| CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
___________________________________________ $10-399.7975
l_,__::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::l o
|
|
|| |
| | | |
|
| |
| | h
' } ' -
| | |
| | LL]
| |
| ' =
| |
| | | | F
|
|
| . | Y
|
| . N <
| | | | \A23/
| al
| |
| | <
| |
| R | I-IJ
: ROOF | >
| |
l T ' <
| | |
|
|
| |
Bl 2
| = | |
| a | <
| |
| | Y
|_ @)
' e — O
\\ // o
| PET SPA o o o o0 o o o o [uel | ws
| | | m <>E g
| | AP
[
| _ | Z 3
| < oo | | | o 5=
| ORe | | N )
RAMP W 1
DOG RUN o %
| B WITH ARTIFICIAL UP O§O | m Xl CD
| TURF SURFACE (] | LO _I
| o ° | | T — L
| | |
| o o || GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
| | DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
5 5 266 KANSAS STREET,
| ROOF A | EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245
| 1
o o '
|
| — — ||
| © e |
| o o |
| = | —_
|
| 1BR - - | |
|
| 1BR N o |
|
‘ é o o |
| O 3 | |
l l THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
| o o | HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
| MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION
| 2BR N © o | SUBMITTAL:
| | 0 0 |
- - ENTITLEMENT SET
| RAMP RAMP | | |
DN UP JOB NUMBER:
: -l ° o | 2021-033
DATE:
ESE 1BR owo o | 09.02.2025
| =g —rRash i : cevsons
2BR 2BR Y C|/C C I
| 1BR RES RES|RES ] |
| I o/ o0olo/ o 0o o 9]0]0 | |
]
| /] Tﬂl |
UTILITY
I 2 I '
| |
|
o |
| 2BR 1BR 1BR 1BR STUDIO 1BR 1BR 1BR 1BR 2 BR |
| |
|
________ = —— = D o e = e ~ = e e _, | |
I__________________________________________I__l'
\ ﬁ
N PLAN
(2N 4 ("5 1) @
\A30/ (A30/ \A30/ \A22)
SHEET
5TH FLOOR 1 NULR:
1" = 20'_0"

9/9/2025 10:05:25 AM



NOTES
01 HVAC CONDENCER WITH PAINTED CORROGATED
METAL SCREEN
(2N 4 ("5 02 PHOTOVOLATIC PANEL
\A30/ (A30/ \A30/ 03 COURTYARD BELOW, SEE LANDSCAPE
3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
| | CULVER CITY,
| CA 90232
__________________ L 310-399.7975
——————————— T T T =1 — 1 [ — | ___FEF_:I
| | | | 1 ] ]
: <$1>18|_4" Ly <$1§8|_8Il | : :
|
1 01] |
TYP 0)
| | Z
N Y — N Y — I Y o o s v
% 148' - 10" !;?9' -0 | m
118'- 4" AR
{f Ed , | |
l ' [ ' =
| | | 00 I | |
| P | : f U0 F
| sEica | ' B |
| \ l |
| 0o | | | 0 | m
P | 7 |
00 o | | 00 |
| | oo o | | N |
|:| |:| P | [ | |:| |:| | I
[ |
' g S ' all
| )&138"8” ’ | |:| |:| |
[ | \ \
| TN ! : ! Il |
| og | i
| { | \ \
| | 00 | | 00 | | |
) | P |
| og ‘ D00 | LL]
\ | i | _
| g | EEEEES | >
| | \ \
| | | | | |
L | |
| | | QgL | | | <
| | |:| |:| | |
? |
| = | | 00 |
| | 0O |
| | 0O
SESREL I 1 | 2
I e e ey e —
| | H H || | <
| | o e e e s [ |
o)
| = | U _ Q
| | J
| H 00 0 0,0 |0 00 | | IJ>J o
<
| | ' L =0
l | et
| 0 >0
| | { 1 % | < 0O
' 159' - 0" e | | )\ X Z
| o© $L %) ' | D)
| owo || N O O
LU
| ] o oéo 7 | m - (LH
: o o o o | | Y ~ LU
| | | !
== Tt e T © © o o N SHEET NOTES GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
~ Bl | DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
| | } o o o o 266 KANSAS STREET,
| | | I— | ROOF AREA: 89,770 SF EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245
\ \ T T
: | i Tt . o o o o | :
| __ | | PV AREA: 89,770 x 1.5 = 13,466 SF
o o o o
|l o} o TTTITITT 2 | PER CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE , SECTION
vvvvv 5.0 | 00 | 110.10(b)1B, SHALL HAVE A TOTAL AREA NO
| T & ool N ° = = LESS THAN 15% OF THE TOTAL ROOF AREA OF
| ||l | | | 00 | | THE BUILDING. —
T : B I EEEERS R, S ° 8 s 1 |
N P N A (s U B S N N R Y 11
| ! Q;?B'-SU 00 © < 3 S :
] ( - il
-l 00 © < o o |
|:| |:| l l THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
| | © © o o | HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
| | Mé;“mg;gﬁ REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
| | [ © © o o | SUBMITTAL:
| — —
00 ENTITLEMENT SET
: | 00 ° RAMP e | | |
DN JOB NUMBER:
| : 8 H H © 164' - 2" < y 2021-033
m DATE:
|[|J o TRTY] k4 - | 09.02.2025
| i |:| |:| H H - | REVISIONS:
0o o0 C clclc | |
| 0o ! 00 RES RES RES|RES || |
| 00 : RooE 169'-2": 00 0190 o 0 0 O 0100 [T | |
[ ]
\ \
| | |:| |:| I T T e T e T T L J |
N A Y I v v v v v v v v Y v | N Y S v v v v Y v |
|
|
U T R e e e . N
I | | |
I B oo T T T ’ |
| W ] | |
H—————— R e | e — — — = — 3 — = — — _, | I
|_ _________________________________________ - |
SHEET
\ ROOF PLAN
N
\AS0/ (A30/ \ASU/ $
SHEET
ROOF PLAN @ ”UER: 1 7
1" = 20'_0"

9/9/2025 10:05:27 AM



MATERIAL BOARD NOTES

EXTERIOR PLASTER COLOR 1
WHITE
EXTERIOR PLASTER COLOR 2
BEIGE
EXTERIOR PLASTER COLOR 2
DARK BROWN
3573 HAYDEN
PAINTED METAL RAILING AVENUE
BRONZE CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
PAINTED METAL RAILING 310:399.7975
TAN

PAINTED METAL SECURITY SCREEN

VINYL WINDOW TYPE 1

VINYL WINDOW TYPE 2

Qe
Q2>
Qs
Wi
w2

il |

TO PARAPET

o 1 <{< +173.50
ROOF TOP

+169.17

5TH FLOOR
+159.00

4TH FLOOR
+148.83

3RD FLOOR
+138.67

2ND FLOOR
+128.50

1ST FLOOR
+118.33

B1 FLOOR
+108.17

B2 FLOOR $ _
+98.00

4

= |

| A%
L

e
H ]
= .
H ]
=
H 1
H ]
] H 1

] H |
H |

] d 1

] H |

] o 1

] d

] |d

J

75'- 6"

[
[]

=%

]|
110" - 2"[10' - 2'[10' - 2"[10' - 2'[10' - 2'[10' - 2"|10' - 2"

/
PL1 W1

SOUTH ELEVATION - E GRAND AVE @
1"=20'-0"

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

-
TO PARAPET
] +173.50
|| | o ROOF TOP
E T 1 n T M [T o 2 5TH FLOOR
T — &~ +159.00
Q s Q Q Q Q £ T u B T M S| 4TH FLOOR HEREIN ARE THE GOPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFALLP AND
_ _ _ - E\] +T4883 ll\DIIEAgNll\:g;gE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
H H B B — = = j é 3RD FLOOR . SUBMITTAL:
] - TR +13867 <
ol SNE 100 " o ENTITLEMENT SET
j <, 2ND FLOOR
I vy &N +128.50 JOB NUMBER:
SHE ] WA ] ; R 2021-
- N : _ = 1STFLOOR DAT? 033
— f SR 09.02.2025
¥ ] — o
| ~ +—| B1FLOOR REVISIONS:
S S ~ +108.17
= h =
s ~ +~, B2FLOOR
+98.00
PL1 MT2 W2 W2 MT?2 W2 PL1 MT1
EL
WEST ELEVATION - KANSAS ST @ i
1" = 20'_0" 2 2

9/9/2025 10:05:34 AM



MATERIAL BOARD NOTES

EXTERIOR PLASTER COLOR 1
WHITE
EXTERIOR PLASTER COLOR 2
BEIGE
EXTERIOR PLASTER COLOR 2
DARK BROWN
3573 HAYDEN
PAINTED METAL RAILING AVENUE
BRONZE CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
PAINTED METAL RAILING 310:399.7975
TAN

PAINTED METAL SECURITY SCREEN

VINYL WINDOW TYPE 1

VINYL WINDOW TYPE 2

JEEEHEEEE

_ 4"

TO PARAPET

V +173.50
] ROOFTOP
I +169.17 $

5TH FLOOR
+159.00

4TH FLOOR
+148.83

3RD FLOOR
+138.67

2ND FLOOR
+128.50

1ST FLOOR
+118.33

B1 FLOOR
+108.17

B2 FLOOR
+98.00

_ 2"

_ 2""1 0I

_ 2""1 OI

_ 2""1 0I
i 6“

KA KIS

75

_ 2""1 OI

_ 2""1 0I

L10'-

MT2 W2 PL1 MT2

NORTH ELEVATION - HOLLY AVE @
1"= 200"

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

_ 4"

TO PARAPET
+173.50

ROOE TOP THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
+1 69 1 7 HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
' MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN

PERMISSION
5TH FLOOR
+159.00

4TH FLOOR ENTITLEMENT SET
+148 83

3RD FLOOR
+138.67 DATE:

2ND FLOOR 09.02.2025

+128.50 REVISIONS:

1ST FLOOR
+118.33

B1 FLOOR
+108.17

-
-
=
\\
d
|

=

SUBMITTAL:

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

i A ] : | ﬁ :
T

w1

.\

65! s 4"

10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" >x4'

PL1 MT3 PL3

SHEET

ELEVATIONS

SHEET

EAST ELEVATION - WASHINGTON ST 9 "N 23
1"=20'-0"

9/9/2025 10:05:45 AM



TO PARAPET <
+173.50 3t ~
w T = —
- e
ROOFTOP | = e
+169.17 | ~ = e
! o -
5THFLOOR _ | 2 lo 1BR COR
+159.00 | & i
¢ ATHFLOOR | 2 5 1BR COR STUDIO
+148.83 | N \ =
3RDFLOOR | 2 | 1BR COR STUDIO
+138.67 I c\l |
2ND FLOOR | S 1BR COR STUDIO
#2850 | & =
ISTFLOOR | 2 { COR COURTYARD C STUDIO
RS e e e - — - e B O T I e
S EEEHEEEE S E S E L SR I E ST = = ===
B1HOOS,4—LHEHELE;EHEMEMEMEMEMEMEMEJEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEmEm;m;m;m;m;m;m;l;mzj;mgﬁ 777777
+108.17 | =TS T = =TT T T T =TT =TT T T T =T = T T T == T T T =T == = = =TT T T ] == M= =T HH ==t e ]
I=THET=EHET=TEIETEIET= =R =TET=TET=TET=EIENEIEN=EIETEIENEIENE =TT I==E === IETET=TET=TET=1E=1 =TT == e =i
B2 FLOOR ===
+98.00

o
j
NUE ™

—wE = S E S E S = S S S S R S S S S = = = S S T S T E E I I E T E T T S = E T EETED - il

0

0]

0]

0]

STUDIO

STUDIO

STUDIO

STUDIO

STUDIO

|
|
P
|
L I
<
> |
s '
| T I
§§§§§§§§§§ |
ﬁﬁ*““§§§““““ |
“““““““““ |
I |
I e I I 2
~~j_| ' @
] STUDIO Y ‘ I
o i \ |
z |
i 0
i STUDIO 3BR | |
— ‘I I
COURTYARD B —
I STUDIO 0 | |
il T COURTYARD A STP : - I

Il
[0
Il
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
M
I
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
Il
I
I
1
1
I
1
1
|||
1
1
1
1
Il
Il
I
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
Tl
1l
I
I
I
]
Il
I
il
I

\
I
l
|
|
|
l
I
!
|
|
l

I
!

!

I

l

I L L L e L e L o L G M o TS e ey Py o s L
| T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T AT T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T T e T T T T T T e T T
| T T i D1 T T T T 0 T i 0 i 0 T T D i i T i T T i T e T e T e T i D T i D i T i i 0 T T i 0 i D1 D i S T i T i D T T i DT T T T i T T T T T T T T T T T T T TR T T DI DT T T T T T T

e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e ] e e v e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e _j

T N e T N Ve e T el N Ve T e Ve e = e N W e = e el Ve Ve T e N Ve Ve et e T e WV e T T N e NV = Nl Nl Ve = e e W e = e N Wl Ve e T Tl Wl Ve e T Tl Ve Ve T R N Ll e I e T N = e = T T T

NORTH - SOUTH SECTION A

@

NOTES

1 [1] = 20'_0"
P g
I L = TO PARAPET
e I — " ey |2 g +17350
B _— T T T T = — T L
P T T _ = ROOF TOP
| T T T T T — — = | 2 &~ +169.17
e - IIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII|||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||| Iﬁ 1 BR T T —+ - T T !! -‘ 1 BR !!”””” é -CI> 5TH FLOOR
____________ ___~——————‘——_’—4——~ i - — (@) A _ J 1
: e e = | 10 of 1w g
<C N R = -
> [] | T (@ | T [T 1BR 1BR T [ an nm T ] I < 2 4TH FLOOR
= - == — — I — — ] ] | | | .O %\l +148-83
= IR s s L 118 S = I S T = I S
| il | O M 1 @ [ T [T ] | - 3RD FLOOR
= i — i . o ; ~ +138.67
o | - m P S T I i T T --
= i m o [ T e
N T 0 m o 0 e |0 Gt 0w B LD
M C ] ] - ] - — a— m— —1/_—“——\\;%*\\\*\\\* :9 - 1ST F»]L%%z
| 7 = e | [ L — - - — — miiEr s EEEEEE EE E EE E E EE EEETEEEE EEETET N +110.
| 3BR R ” 1 E DE‘ COURTYARD B-, LTH- als 1BR R \\‘zmQﬂgﬂéﬁgﬂ%@u,\‘zmz‘mgmgmgmgmgmgmgmgm%m%m% jgmgmgmgmgmgmg‘mgmgm‘%mgmgmgmgmg !
| [ 4 = | 1L | -—-17 — = "LﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁ:‘MmMmMmMmMmMmMmMmMmMmMmMmMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁJﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁm 2 B1 FLOOR
\ | B S — . B . _______________________________________________________________ |}’ S I I I N I I A I I I I I I I I O O N I D I (Y ) = - -
= Al | = =N === T =TT === =TT I=T= == === =TT === === =TT & +108.17
ﬂ' Ol ———— —— - H_ COURTYARD A 2!
_____________ o s i = e L e e e e e el e e e e e e e E e e e e e e e e e e R e e e e e e e e e e e e R e e e e e e e e e e e el T e e e N R Tl T = 'B2FLOOR
T L o L o000
= EEEEEEEEEEEEEEE EEEEEEEETEEE T E EEETEE T ETEEETEEE AR ETETETETEETETEE D EETEEETEEEEEEEEEE T ETEEEEEEEE EEETETEETETEETETEETETEEETEE T EEEETEEEEEETEED
e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e s e e e == s
e e e e e e e e e e e e e s e e s e e e s e e s e e e e e s e e e e e s e e e e e e e e e e e e e s e e s e e e s e e s e e e s e e s e e e e e e e e e e e e e s e e s e e s === == =]
e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e s e e s e e s e s e e e e e e e e s e e e e s e e s e e s e e s s = == s =
e e e e = e e e e e e Ve e N e e e e e e Ve N I e e = N e e = e e e Ve e e e Ve = e T e e e e Ve e e Ve T e e e e e = T =V T
NORTH - SOUTH SECTION B
| | [— ] n 4
1" =20'-0
P P
TO PARAPET = wl|
+173.50 = 2 -~~~ "~~~ T L
1 w o .
é ROOF TOP _ < T T T =
+169.17 e\ A1 W || mssNstevete 00 ... T T T T T e e e 1D
<, b1V q1er FPorlrsssseeseeseessesssssssssmmmmmmma DT m T T T e e T
| | il | TBR R R —————— T T T e e
_ ol | g 0 MW ———————— ... T T T e e

é 5TH FLOOR
+159.00

é 4TH FLOOR
+148.83

é 3RD FLOOR
+138.67

é 2ND FLOOR
+128.50

é 1ST FLOOR
+118.33

é B1 FLOOR.
+108.17

10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2" 10!_2"

é B2 FLOOR.
+98.00

II. - IO.

HEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEE EEE E EEE E EEE E EEE EEEE EEE E EEEE ETETEETETETEN T T T T T = B
LI e T i e T T T T I T T T T Ty B T T kol conmroon | COURTYARD A | stuoo ﬁ-i' o ——
= EEEEEEEEE EE EE EE EE T E T EE T EE T EE EE T E S S E S EE EE EE EE EE EET ETETE - EEEEEETE

|
o 2 | L
ﬁ“ﬂu mﬁ ROF 1
o | swo fot  m |
s { cwo fot e |
i I S g oo por  m |

NORTH - SOUTH SECTION C

1" = 20'_0"

®

01 EXISTING TOPO SURFACE

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

BUILDING
SECTIONS

SHEET

A30

9/9/2025 10:05:50 AM



KANSAS STR

] ﬁ-l
Il
I
| \
I

Y ~~'ZBR~~~_ COURTYARD A
EHEHEH\:H\:\H:\H:H\:H\:\H:\H:\H:TE\H _ L

|

--
u “E“I
- ””*ﬁ%ﬁﬂﬁw

||0 - l09

WASHINGTON STREET

- T e e e e = = =T =T === =] == =]

LI+ +1 = EEEEEEEEEETETETETEE]

£ s 1BR EIEIEE

- == Il - eSS

I “ E lﬁmﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁLlﬁMﬁMﬁMﬁ
] | B EEEEEEEEEEEEEEE
| S e e e e e e L e e N e [ e e e e N = ==

44l _ 4"

TO PARAPET

+173.50

ROOF TOP

+169.17
5TH FLOOR

+159.00
4TH FLOOR

+148.83
3RD FLOOR

+138.67
2ND FLOOR

+128.50
1ST FLOOR

+118.33
B1FLOOR

10!_2" 10l_2|| 10'_2" 10l_2|| 10!_2" 10l_2|| 10!_2"

+108.17
B2 FLOOR

+98.00

EAST - WEST SECTION A

1" — 20'_0"

@

NOTES

] PARKING LEVEL 6

KANSAS STREET

| MECH |

SHAFT PARKING LEVEL 5
I MECH

SHAFT PARKING LEVEL 4

5 [ puiems] | [

| SHAFT PARKING LEVEL 3
S= == L wecr ||
T T T T T e L L PARKING LEVELZ o
ST , —
=== =TT MECH
[l T T T ll ikiiniadeiads

/ 1/

/

77

-

K

-
(@]
Q@
=
(@]
= !
2
=
Ol

|

[ ]

|
|
|
o
o
,C
)
]
,-<
>
=
,U
(58]
|
|
|
|
|
|
|
!
|
(93]
o]
=
g:?

WASHINGTON STREET

N
E “ Il
|

Rl
E“ Il

=N = =N = =T = = = =] === = =T = =
=== == == === = === = =T

I_4||
‘10!_2"‘10!_2"‘10!_2"‘10!_2"‘10!_2"‘10!_2"‘10!_2""' J'[L/

TO PARAPET

+173.50

ROOF TOP

+169.17
5TH FLOOR

+159.00
4TH FLOOR

+148.83
3RD FLOOR

+138.67
2ND FLOOR

+128.50
1ST FLOOR

+118.33
B1 FLOOR

+108.17
B2 FLOOR

+98.00

EAST - WEST SECTION B

1" = 20'_0"

O

ﬁ
—i—-
KANSAS STREET

|

il = =

PARKING LEVEL
PARKING LEVEL

PARKING LEVEL

PARKING LEVEL

PARKING LEVEL 1

w | |

— rv

TO PARAPET
+173.50

WASHINGT(l)N STREET
|

2BR

| _
-
E 2BR 0 |

m 2BR I

ROOQF TOP

+169.17
5TH FLOOR

+159.00
ATH FLOOR

+148.83
3RD FLOOR

+138.67
2ND FLOOR

+128.50
1ST FLOOR

+118.33
B1 FLOOR

+108.17
B2 FLOOR

+98.00

EAST - WEST SECTION C

1" — 20'_0"

&

01 EXISTING TOPO SURFACE

3573 HAYDEN
AVENUE
CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
310:399.7975

1521 E GRAND AVE APARTMENTS

1521 E GRAND AVE
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

GRIFFIN CAPITAL CATALYST
DEVELOPMENT FUND LLC
266 KANSAS STREET,

EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245

THIS DRAWING AND THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN ARE THE COPYRIGHTED WORK OF KFA,LLP AND
MAY NOT BE REPRODUCED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION

SUBMITTAL:

ENTITLEMENT SET

JOB NUMBER:

2021-033

09.02.2025

REVISIONS:

SHEET

BUILDING
SECTIONS

SHEET

A31

9/9/2025 10:05:53 AM



	Sheets
	A10 - B2 FLOOR PLAN
	A11 - B1 FLOOR PLAN
	A12 - FIRST FLOOR PLAN
	A13 - SECOND FLOOR PLAN
	A14 - THIRD FLOOR PLAN
	A15 - FOURTH FLOOR PLAN
	A16 - FIFTH FLOOR PLAN
	A17 - ROOF PLAN
	A22 - ELEVATIONS
	A23 - ELEVATIONS
	A30 - BUILDING SECTIONS
	A31 - BUILDING SECTIONS
	G00 - COVER SHEET
	G01 - SITE PLAN & PROJECT INFORMATION
	G02 - FAR CALCULATIONS
	G03 - OPEN SPACE CALCULATIONS
	G04 - BUILDING GROSS AREA
	G05 - BUILDING AREA PER CBC
	G06 - FIRE SAFTY PLAN
	G06.1 - FIRE CODE
	G08 - SURVEY
	G09 - SURVEY


